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ABSTRACT 

POSTMODERN FEMINIST READINGS OF DENTITY 
IN SELECTED WORKS OF 

JUDlTH THOMPSON, MARGARET HOLLINGS WORTH AND PATRICIA GRUBEN 

Marlene Cecilia Moser 
Ph.D. Thesis, 1998 

Graduate Centre for Study of Drama 
University of Toronto 

This dissertation uses a strain of postmodeniist thought, mformed by discourse theory and 

innected by feminism, to explore the articulation of identity in selected plays of Judith Thompson 

and Margaret HoIlingsworth and selected films of Patricia Gruben. In these works, identity is 

configured as  a process, an accumulation of temporary points of CO herence. This dissertation 

demonstrates how identity is contingent on fluctuathg relations of power. The notion of mastery 

in the relations of power is critiqued through the serialization of identity, thmugh images of the 

body, and through the interruption and destabilization of narrative structure. As a result of the 

confiictud representation of identity, the spectator experiences a destabmd subject position; 

identification is both engaged and thwarted as several dinerent possibilities for seeing the action 

are activat ed. 

Chapter One discusses the theoretical parameters of this dissertation. The work of 

Michel Foucault, Judith Butler and Stuart Hall is important in the developrnent of a mode1 of 

subjectlidentity which is applied in later chapters. In Chapter Two, selected plays by Judith 

Thompson are considered with particular attention to the dynamic of subjedidentity and its 

inscription on the body. Here Julia Kristeva's notion of the abject is applied, for example, to 

illuminate the instabiiity of identity. Margaret Hohgsworth's piays are rernarkable for the 

foregrounding and destabüiPng of narrative structure. In Chapter Three, Catherine Belsey's 

definition of classic realism is used to focus the discussion of Hohgsworth's piays. In Chap ter 



Four, Gmben's work is considered with attention to both body and narrative. Audre Lorde's tem 

"bio-mydiography" is appkable, particularly when Gruben takes herseIf as her own object of 

inquiry. The results of these analyses are considered in Chapter Five. In conclusion, identity as a 

site of arnbiguity involves a relinquishrnent of a subject/o bject positioning and of binaries such as 

righthrong, sewother. Given the destabilized subject position which is atforded the spectator, a 

different kind of viewing pleasure m u t  be imaginecl. Temporary moments of intelligibility and 

mastery are activated, accompanied by an interrogation of the singulanty and imperialism of these 

PO skions. 
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CsAPTER ONE 

Setting the Sites 

Using a strain of postmodernist thought, infiected by ferninism, 1 explore the articulation 

of identity in selected plays of Judith Thompson and Margaret Holiingsworth and selected f%ns of 

Patricia Gmben. Identity is shown to be a site of ambiguity, in a tension of rnastery and non- 

mastery. Identity is not fked, but contingent on fluctuating relations of power. The notion of 

mastery or dominance in the relations of power will be cntiqued in three ways: through the 

seriaiization of identity, tbrough @es of the body and through the interruption and 

destabiiization of narrative stnicture. As a result of this conflictual representation of identity, the 

spectator experiences a destabülized sense of subject position; identification is both engaged and 

thwarted as several different possibilities for seeing the action are activated. 

In this chapter, I wiU define the ternis of seif, subject, discourse and identity as they wili 

be used in the following chapters. These definitions will be foiiowed by a more detailed discussion 

of the theoretical parameters of postmodemimi and feminism which srniate this project. 

Part One 

Definhg Terms: Self, Subject, Discourse, Identity 
Self 

In its interrogation and questioning of the master namatives of truth and emancipation, 

postmodemism brings about a crisis in the concept of the seifas an essential, contained king. The 

seN, in the legacy of the Enüghtement, refers to a "stabIe, reliable, integrative entity that has 

access to our inner States and outer reality, at least to a limited (but knowable degree)" (Flax, 



T h M n g  Fragments 8). This idea of the selfis one which is contingent on rationaikm and 

mastery, an ability on the part of the artist/author/subject to control the codes of representation: 

Rationalism rests on the notion that there is an Archimedean point fiom which 
knowledge is acquired. The existence of such an Archedean point that abstracts 
the knower fiom the known is, for rationalimi, definitive of tnrth, (Hekman, 
Gender and KnowZedge 12) 

This abstraction can be reassuring for the individual. There is much to be gained fiom the 

assurance of a position of " h o  wing" and fiighteningly W e  solace to be taken if such a vantage 

point is unfixed. But at what pnce this abstraction? This khd of constitution of a selfis 

dependent on an other, a position of marginalization and subordination to the p r b r y  term of a 

binary equation This dynamic is not only played out in gender, but is recurrent in other 

hierarchical positionings of race, class, and sexuaiity. As Jane Flax points out, asswing a position 

which is removed and objective also implies a certain domination: 

The belief that humans can recognize or constmct an objective set of rules, 
principles, or neutrd laws that will protect them fiom each other is a seductive but 
dangerous illusion It reflects a fàntasy of a powerfùl, Godiike, socially isolated, 
pure mind detached fiom embodied, interrelated persons . . . . To sustain such a 
htasy, lesser others must be created whose domination becomes essentiai to the 
self. The f'ailures of the products of this pure mhd cau be aîtributed to the 
influences of the inferior "othen" (women, other races, the body) over whom 
perfect control has yet to be fully estabüshed. Hence fàr fiom making us  free, such 
approaches to justice generate and require relations of domination. (Disputed 
Subjects 1 15) 

Flax's argument demonstrates the cycle of oppression inherent in a notion of the self which is 

reiiant on rationalism. A rational k ing  implies a separation between subject and object and 

hower and Imown. Objectivity is accepted without question and a dynamic of mastery and a 

hierarchical positionhg is implied. 
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An Uivestment in the self and the power in mastery is bard to relinquish. I f  the knower and 

the known cannot be separated in such a way, for example, how is access to understanding 

possible? How is tmth anainable? The cultural value of attaining a stable selfis great. It does 

seem ail too convenient that the notion of the selfis king undermineci, just as those marpinaiized 

are M y  making their voices heard. And yet the notion of the self as confiped withh these 

temis is dependent on restriction, exclusion, and a hierarchizing of merence. Retaining a hold on 

the li'beral-huma& idea of the self implies an acquiescence to a patriarchal society and system of 

kno wledge: 

For what is this subject that, threatened by loss, is so bemoaned? Bourgeois 
perhaps patriarchai certainly,-for many, this is indeed a great loss- and may lead to 
narcissistic iaments about the end of art, of culture, of the West. But for others, 
precisely for Others, this is not a great loss at all. (Owens 78) 

Rather t is the radical reconception of the self which can be most usefbl for feminism, particularly 

for a feminism which is concemed with a theory of subjectivity which takes into account Others 

who have been consistently rnarginalized. 

Subject 

Where the term self suggests a stable, unined, rational king, the terni subject puts this 

kind of transcendence into question: 

The terni "subject" helps us to conceive of human reality as a construction, as a 
product of signiSing activities which are both culturaUy specific and generally 
unconscious. The category of the subject calls into question the notion of the self 
synonymo us with consciousness; it "decentres" conscio mess. (Samp 2) 

Althusserian interpellation is a usefid way of conceiving the subject as aiready constituted by 

language. In 'ldeology and Ideological State Apparatuses," Althusser demonstrates how the 



subject and ideology are inseparable. [n order for workers to perforrn their tasks 4'conscientiously" 

they must be "steeped" in this ideology (133). Ideology, according to Althusser, "represents the 

ùnagmary reiationship of individuais to their real conditions of existence" ( 1 62). Althusser's 

central thesis is that ideology interpeilates hdividuais as subjects: "the category of the subject is a 

prirnary 'O bvio m e s s  "' and this "is an ide0 logical e ffect , the elementary ideo lo gical effect" ( 1 72). 

This concept of the subject is employed by Foucault. in The Order of nings, Foucault 

eloquently descnis the way in which the subject is embedded in language: 

How cm he be the subject of a Ianguage that for thousands of years bas been 
formed without him, a language whose organization escapes him, whose meaning 
sleeps an almost invincible sleep in the words he momentady activates by means 
of discourse, and within which he is obligea from the very outset, to lodge bis 
speech and thought, as though they were doing no more than animate, for a brief 
period, one segment of that web of innumerable possibilities? (323) 

In m e  History of SemuZity, for example, Foucault analyzes the ways in which sexuality is 

constituted through discursive formations which produce subjects and govem them by contro lling 

their bodies. Foucault draws attention to ho w the discourses of sexuality create p a r t i c h  

subjects. He poses questions in terms of how the body is constituted and formed through 

discourses: 

Why has sexuality been so widely discussed, and what has been said about it? 
What were the effects of power generated by what was said? What are the links 
between these discourses, these effects of power, and the pleasures that were 
invested by them? . . . . The central issue, then (at least in the first instance), is not 
to determine whether one says yes or no to sex, whether one formulates 
prohi'bitions or permissions, whether one asserts its importance or denies its 
effects, or whether one refines the words one uses to designate it; but to account 
for the fàct that it is spoken about, to discover who does the speaking, the 
positions and viewpoints from which they speak, the iBstitutions which prompt 
people to speak about t and which store and distribute the things that are 
said. (11) 



Foucault focuses on the way in which the subject is constituted and poiïced through particular 

discourses. The term subject is usefid because, as Foucault points out, the word bas sigdicant 

resonances: 

There are two rneanings of the word subject: subject to someone else by control 
and dependence, and tied to his own identity by a conscience or self-knowledge. 
Both meanings suggest a fom of power which subjugates and makes subject to. 
("Afterword" 2 1 2) 

As Chris Weedon says, T o  speak is to assume a subject position withh discourse and to become 

subjected to the power and regulation of the discourse" (1 19). The tenn subject in this sense is 

also usefûl because of the object which is impüed in such an articulation The subject is inherently 

unstable, given that it attempts to assume a speaking position, and yet is already spoken. Subject 

wil l  be used in this dissertation to refer to instances in which a coherent speaking position is 

assumed, which then proves to be unstable. The standpoint positioning which is assumed is 

predicated on a dynamic of rnastery. 

Discourse 

A consideration of identity which employs the term subject is dependent on an analysis of 

discourse. Discourse is c o m o d y  used on many valences. One of the general principles of 

discourse analysis is that "a 'discourse' is not merely a linguistic unit, but a unit of human action, 

interaction, cornmimication and cognition" (de Beaugrande 208). Foucault emphasizes how 

discourse c o n m a s  and categorizes the ways in which people corne to think about themselves. It 

is iniportant to emphasize that in Foucault, discourse theory is oriented toward social action: 

. . . discourse theory . . . distinguishes itseifsharply from philosophical concerns 
with the tmth of statements and the validity of arguments, substituthg a concem 



for conditions under which one can be judged to have made a serious, sound, me, 
important, authontative staternent. (Dillon 2 1 1) 

This concem for context involves a consideration of social conditions and investigates the reasons 

for legitimation: 

Foucault speaks of "nilesY' of discourse, but it is widely agreed that the conditions 
under which one can make serious, authoritaîive statements hclude material and 
social institutions and practices. A theory of discourse therefore @lies a theory of 
society, most particularly a theory of power, legitunacy, and authonty. (Dillon 
2I 1) 

in the broadest sense, discourse refers to any communication using signs. Discourse theory, more 

specEcaIly, emphasizes the importance of context in determinmg the legitmiacy of any given 

Lyotard also descnis how, in postrnodernism, the individual is a subject which is aiways 

aiready situated. For Lyotard, the subject is engaged m language games which constitute M e r  

context and circumscrii a tmth- t e h g  ability : 

. . . language games are the minimum relation required for society to exist: even 
before he is born, ifody by vimie of the name he is given, the human child is 
already positioned as the referent in the story recounted by those around hmi, in 
relation to which he wiU inevitably chart his course. (The P ostmodern Condition 
15) 

Not ody is the subject constituted through language, but it is also detemüned largely by the social 

bond, the ways in which ianguage is used and agreed upon by society. In this scenario, the 

postmodern subject is very much a part of a larger discursive systern: 

The social subject itselfseerns to dissolve in this dissemination of language games. 
The social bond is linguistic, but is not woven with a smgle thread. It is a tabric 
fomed by the intersection of at least two (and m reaiity an indeterminate number) 
of language games, obeying Mereat des. (The Postmodern Condition 40) 



hdeeâ, sexuality? race, class are discourses which determine the way in which one is named and 

differentiated within society. As Foucault and Lyotard suggest, discourse is an important 

determinhg feature of the subject; the legitimacy and authority of any subject is dependent on 

context and the shifting relations of power within that context. In rny discussion of the plays and 

f i h ,  1 isolate instances in which subjects assume specific standpoint positions, discursively 

constinired and dependent on a dynamic of rnastery, and show alternatives to this situating of 

subjectivity. 

Identity 

In my aoalysis, the series of positions which the characters assume a s  subjects constitute a 

sense of identity . Identity, then, is the accumulation of this series of discursively constituted 

positions. Stuart Hall's articulation of identity in Quesrions of Cultural Ideniity indicates its 

ephemeral nature: 

I use '5dentity" to refer to the meeting point, the point of suture, between on the 
one hmd the discourses and practices which attempt to Tnterpeliate," speak to us 
or hail us into place as the social subjects of particuiar discourses, and on the other 
hmd, the processes which produce subjectivities, which consenict us as subjects 
which can be "spoken." Identities are thus points of temporary attachrnent to the 
subject positions which discursive practices constmct for us. (5) 

Ekewhere HalI discusses identity a s  a process which connects the several subject positions that an 

individual assumes. The narrative formation which results is similar to what Brian McHale calls 

the "as-if' mode1 of story-tehg: 

[Identity] is historically, not biologically, defined. The subject assumes different 
identities at difEerent times, identities which are no t unified around a CO herent 
"sel£" Within us are contradictory identities, puliing in Werent directions, so that 
our identifications are continuously being shifted about. If we feel we have a 



unifieci identity f?om birth to death, it is only because we construct a comforting 
story or 'hartative of the self' about owselves. (''The Question9' 598) 

Identity, as it is used by Stuart Hall, evokes the pluraüty of king while at the same t h e  

acknowledges its contùigency and ephemeraiity. Coherence is ody to be found in a consteiiation 

of these subject positions. Although this identity may have an effect of wholeness, it is also 

profoundly questioned. In my d y s i s  of the phys and films, as 1 enumerate the positions which 

the characters assume as subjects, a seriaiization of subjects will be demonstrated. This 

serialization contributes to a destabilization of identity. This destabilization is also evident in 

images of the body and in the interruption and reworking of narrative. 

This discussion of ternis has already indicated certain theoreticai parameters of this 

dissertation In the next section, I will discuss particular strains of postmodernism as they engage 

with politicai projects and describe in more detaii how a project of postmodemism infiuenced by 

Foucaultian discourse theory and inflected by feminism wiü be applied to the piays of Thompson 

and Hobgsworth and the films of Gruben. 

Part Two 

Postmodernism and Feminism 

Postmodernism 

God is dead, Marx is dead, and I'm not feeling too weii myself.' 

With its current ubiquitous use, '~ostmodeniism d e r s  fiom a certain semantic 

instability" (Hassan 87). 1 am considering posmiodemism both as an aesthetic practice, and as an 

l Gr&to on Paris w&. (Qtd. by Braidotti 2) 



umbrella term for theory which often includes what is cded  poststructuralism. Wt c m  be 

agreed upon among the various postmodemist pudits and practitioners is the profound 

questionhg of identity. In Modernity and its Future, S ~ a a  Hall elaborates five major innuences 

in the second haifof the twentieth century which have contriiuted to the decentring of the 

Cartesian subject. Hall traces the transition nom individiiiiiism to a decentred subject situating the 

dislocation of the subject through five major advances in social theory and the human sciences: 

marxism, psychoanalysis, structural linguistics, Foucaultian discourse theory and feminism (606- 

61 1). Under the influence of these movements, the postmodern subject is "concephialized as 

having no ked ,  essential or permanent identity', (598). Given Hall's elabmation of the conditions 

which have contriiuted to the destabilization of the subject, 1 w3.I discuss two theones of 

postrnodernism and the concepts of identity and the political projects which they involve: Frednc 

Jarneson and Marxbm, and Linda Hutcheon and femini,cm. On the one han& Jameson laments the 

loss of the self in the postmodern era, for he sees it as the loss of individuaiay, of feeling, and of 

agency. On the other hand, Hutcheon does see why artists and writers are amacted to 

postmodemism. She acknowledges ways in which posmiodemism and feminism have simüar 

concems. Hutcheon, however, uitimately insists on the complicit nature of postmodemism. For 

this reason, postmodernûm is incompatible with feminism because pomodernism does not offer 

a h e w o r k  through which one can offer a coherent critique. After a consideration of lameson's 

and Hutcheon's visions of postmodemism, I consider the contri'butions of Foucault to a 

postmodern concept of identity, and feminist projects which work within this terrain. 



Jameson: "as unique and onmistalcable as your fîngerprints" 

Jameson's influence on postmodemist theory is substantial. Modernism and 

postmodemism &are many similar traits and modes of expression; Jameson makes these fine 

distinctions, but not without an indication of his own biases. The aflxiety and alienation of the 

modemist self are displaced by the hgmentation of postmodeniism (Postmodernism, or the 

CuIfuraI Logic 14). Modemism as  a style is 'khat is as unique and urmiistakable as your own 

fingerprints, as incomparable as your own body" (Poshrodernism, or the Cuhrai Logic 17). 

Postmodemism, on the other hanci, must resort to ''the imitation of dead styles7' (Postmodernism, 

or the Cultural Logic 18). What is evident in Jameson's dennitions of modemism and 

postmodemism is a preferred treatrnent of modernism and, in particdar, a nostalgia for the 

biologicdy detexminecl individual. Jameson associates modemism with a unique, living individual 

in his references to "fkgerprints" and ' kdy"  whereas postmodemism is chamcterized as 

imitative, derivative, and "dead." 

Jameson continues his discussion with an oppositionai pairing of 'Teeling" and 

"expression" in modemism with %e waning a£Eéct of postmodernism" (1 5). Jameson advocates 

the closed, monadic nature of the modemist self because it af5ords the abüity to express its own 

alienation in the world. In reference to Edvani Munch's The Scream, Jameson discusses the 

expression of this state of being: 

. . . it shows us that expression requires the category of the individual monad, but 
it also shows us the heavy price to be paid for that preconditon, dramatizing the 
unhappy paradox that when you consthte your individual subjectivity as a self- 
sufncient field and a closed realm, you thereby shut yourself off Born eveiything 
else and condermi yourselfto the mindess solitude of the monad, buried aüve and 
condemned to a prison-ceIl without egress. (Postmodernism, or the CuIfuraI 
Logic 15) 



By contrast, a fbgmented "self' cannot "express" itself. The repercussions of this -te are many; 

it means the end of several thmgs: 

. . . the end, for example, of style, in the sense of the unique and personal, the end 
of the distinctive brushstroke . . . . As for expression and feelings or emotions, the 
hiration, in contemporary society, âom the older anornie of the centered subject 
may also mean, not merely a hiration f?om anxiety? but a hiration fiom every 
other kind of féehg as weil, since there is no longer a self presem to do the 
feeling. (Postmodemism, or the Cultural Logic 15) 

According to Jameson, 'Ykeüng" in modernism, is replaced by 'ïntensities" which are %ee- 

floating and impersonai" in postmodeniism (Poshnodernism. or the Cultural Logic 16). Jamesoo 

uses the schizophrenic as a mode1 in the postmodem scene, as it gives all things equal weight and 

does not distinguish past fiom present: 

. . . schizophrenic experience is an experience of isolateci, disconnected, 
discontinuous materiai signifiers which fiiil to iink up into a coherent sequence. 
The schizophrenic thus does not know personal identity in our sense, since our 
feeling of identity depends on our sense of the persistence of the Y" and the 'Me" 
over t he .  ('Tostmodemism and Consumer Society" 1 19) 

And this lack of awareness of self, of a core, leads Jameson to question the efficacy of a 

postmodem conception of self: 

The schizophrenic . . . is not only 'ho one" in the sense of having no personal 
idem*; he or she also does nothing, since to have a project means to be able to 
commit oneselfto a certain continuity over tirne. ('Tostmodernism and Consumer 
Society" 120) 

As configured in this scemrio, the schizophrenic, like the "self' in the postmodern condition, is 

without agency. 

As Hutcheon points out on Jameson's remarks on pastiche, many postmodern artists, 

unlike Jameson, see this aesthetic as offering a merent kind of agency and expression: 



Whüe Jameson sees this loss of the modernist, unique, individual style as negative, 
as an imprisoning of the text in the past through pastiche, it has ben  seen by 
postmodernist artists as a liberating challenge to a definition of subjectivity and 
creativity that has ignored the role of history m art and thought. ("Begmning to 
Theorke" 17) 

Throughout his work, Jameson's tone suggests a nostdgia for the coherent self of modernism and 

a particular manner of artistic expression. Rather than an intrinsic iament over this loss within 

postmodemism, it is in lameson's own work that just such a lament is to be found. He criticizes 

pastiche as king 'the imitation of a peculiar mask, speech in a dead language . . . amputated of 

the satiric impulse . . . . a statue with blind eyeballs . . . ." (Postrnodernism, or the Culhua2 Logic 

17). Again, he ernphasizes the absence of the selfwith imagery of the disappea~g or hgmented 

body. In his work, as in the work of Jiirgen ~ a b e d ,  the project of mode* stiU has potentüil 

because of the agency which it can afKord him as a Manllst and as a self-constituted individual. 

Jarneson's article ünks social conditions to the postmodern condition. For Jameson, 

postmodeniism is seen as the "logic of late capitaiim.'' Capitalism is responsible for the waning of 

the individual: 

New types of consumption; planned obsolescence; an ever more mpid rhythm of 
fishion and styling changes; the penetration of advertising, television and the 
media generally to a hitherto unparalleled degree throughout Society; the 
replacement of the old tension between city and country, center and province, by 
the suburb and by universal standardhion; the growth of the great networks of 
superhighways and the arrival of automobile cuiture . . . I beiieve that the 
emergence of postmodemism is closely related to the emergence of this new 
moment of late, consumer or multinationai captialism. 1 believe also that its f o d  
features in many ways express the deeper logic of that particular social system, 
('Tostmodernism and Consumer Society" 124-25) 

See Jürgen Habermas, Wodernity-An hcomplete Projecty' in The Anti-Aesthetic. 
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By linking postmodemism to capitalisn, Jameson comiects commodifïcation to the loss of self 

Subversive power is lost when the idea of the individual is put into question. But the kind of self 

that Jameson laments is of limited use to feminists who want to avoid a dynamic of domination 

and subordination. As critics such as Jacqueline Rose have pointed out, Jameson is attached to a 

concept of the sell; or the loss of a seif, which is hdamentally masculine. Jameson, h a brief 

reference to M d y n  Monroe as one of the 1960s Warhol figures, exerts his privilege to "know" a 

woman, says Rose (240). Rose points out his reference to Marilyn Monroe: Jarneson refers to 

her as ''Marilyn herself", "offered here with ali that familianty that makes the woman so available 

for intimacy, ço utterly knowable, one might say" (240). Rose brings a much-needed gender 

critique to postmodemism. In k t ,  she suggests tbat faced with Jameson's psychic overlay of 

postmodemism, 

. . . feminism might be forgiven for seeing the nostdgia for something felt as an 
earlier, and potentially reintegrated, form of sef-dienation as a regret at the 
passing of a fàutasy of the male self. (243) 

Rose suggests that niuning, as Lyotard conceives as a basic narrative of the subject, is "always a 

sexually Merentiated naming" (244). Although Jameson laments the evacuation of a personal 

style and a unique subjectivity, he is stiU speaking for a concept of the individual which implies a 

universai, mastering self which requires an other to maintain its status. 

Jameson's work is still reliant on a particular paradigm, where dflerence is confïgured in 

binarist ternis, where one term is privileged over the other. E d y  in the article bTostmodemism, or 

The Cultural Logic of Late Capitakm," Jameson states his method of d e t e e  cliffierence: 

. . . it was only in the light of some conception of a dominant culturaI logic or 
hegemonic nom that genuine ditference could be measured and assessed . . . . If 
we do not achieve some general sense of a cultural dominant, then we fàil back 



into a view of present history as sheer heterogeneity, random dBerence, a 
coexistence of a host of distinct forces whose effectivity is undecideable. (1 3) 

Difference in Jarneson's ternis always needs to be established with respect to a hegemonic n o m  

This opposition is pro blematic because it still estabüshes a hierarchical understanding. It contains 

ciifference and usurps it of its radical potential. These are the terms whereby the other must be 

articulated. In this way of operating, substant îai, disruptive difference is not possible. Jameson 

articulates one of the great fears of the effect of postrnodernism. "Sheer heterogeneiw and 

'kandom difiérence" suggest relativism, that "mything goes." To consider the polyvocity of 

postmodemism in this way is to minimize the hdamental epistemological changes that 

postrnodernism undertakes. Jarneson's need to establish and catego rize po stmodemism is an 

impulse to control and contain it, to avoid the disruption of a centre of privilege. 

Linda Hutcheon: compromised critique? 

Working f?om a concept of postmodemism wbich originates in architecture, Linda 

Hutcheon ernphasùes its compromised po litics: 

Postmodemism aims to be accessible through its overt and self-conscious parodic, 
historicai., and reflexive forms and thus to be an effective force in out culture. Its 
cornplicitous critique, then, situates the postmodem squarely within both eco nomic 
capitalism and cultural humanisrn--two of the major dominants of much of the 
western world. (The Politics 13) 

Hutcheon points out the patnarchai underpinnings of both these movements and postmodemism's 

implied collusion with them. Throughout her work, she emphasizes tbat "the postmodern involves 

a paradoxical installing as weU as subverting of conventions--including conventions of the subject" 

(The Politics 14). Because of the concomitant 'w in Chdy Sherman's self-portraits based 



on Hollywood film stills, for example, Hutcheon argues tbat these portraits, as examples of 

postmodem art, are "hardly innocent or uncompromised" (The Politics 14). Hutcheon iaments the 

kick of a pure postmodem critical capacity. She views politics as n e c e s d y  compromised or 

limiteci by postmodemism's investment in the culture, or style, or ideology it is undermining. 

This Werence does wt preclude the engagement of feminism with postmodernism 

Hutcheon acknowledges that the decentred subject can be of use to %mlliists, but only to a limited 

The centre no longer completely holds; fiom the decentred perspective, the 
'tnarginal" and the ex-centric (be it race, gender or ethnicity) take on new 
significance in the light of the implied recognition that our culture is w t  really the 
homogeneous monolith (i.e. male, white, Western) we might have assumed. The 
concept of aiienated othemess (based on binary oppositions that conceal 
hierarchies) gives way, as I have argued, to that of diflierences: to the assertion not 
of cenaaüzed sameness but of decentraüzed communities--another postmodemist 
paradox. ("Beginning to Theorize" 17-1 8) 

Hutcheon notes that there is a productive two-way involvement of feminism and postmodeniism: 

feminism urges a reconsideration of gender in postmodernism; postmodemism af5ords strategies 

of representation such as  parody which cm disrupt patriarchal discourses (The Politics 167). 

However, she insists, ". . . there is stiu no way in which the fèminist and the postmodem-as 

cultural enterprises-an be conflated" ( n e  Politics 167). For Hutcheon, postmodemism is 

'jmpolitically ambivalent" and is not compatible with feminism (The Politics 168). 

theia Referring to Chris Weedon, Linda Hutcheon suggests that feminism is a politics and 

postrnodernism is not (The Politics 168). Feminic;m, as a politics, however, can SU bene& fiom 



the different philosophical haginines of postmodernism, such as  posmiodemism's relationship to 

dBerence. Some postmodern femgiists see this as a positive state: 

For postmodernists, difference-the condition of behg excluded, shumied, 
disadvantaged, neglected, rejected, dislocated, marg.iaiiZed, unwanted--is a 
positive state of afEiirs that permits "outsiders" (m this case, wornen) to criticize 
the n o m ,  values, and practices that the dommant culture (paeiarchy) seeks to 
impose on everyone. Thus difference, or Otherness, is much more than merely an 
oppressed, iderior condition; rather t is a way of being, thinking, and speaking 
that dows  for openmess, plurality, and diversity. (Tong and Tuana 43 1) 

This otherness as a state of king will be addressed as one of the productive ways in which a 

postmodern feminist alliance c m  work. This quote suggests that as a 'positive" state, ciifference 

can easiiy be reworked into a new utopia. But this is to mmimize the epistemological changes in 

postmodenllsm, which Hutcheon herself suggest S. Rather than an either/or scenario, 

postmodemism suggests that several truths are possible although they are aiways problematized in 

their "truth-tehg" power. 

The paradoxes and "complicity" which Hutcheon points out in postmodemism can be 

confïgured differently, a s  places in which c o n t h e n t ,  mastery and easy categorization are not 

possible. These kinds of contradictions pemeate po stmodeniisn Hutcheon no tes, for example, 

Lyotard's and Foucault's 'hastefil  denials of mastery" and "cohesive attacks on cohesion" 

('Beginning" 25). 1s there a new centre king estabiished, for a decentred postmodernisrn? For 

Hutcheon and for her own poetics of postmodernism, the postmodem condition always 

reinscribes at the same t h e  as it undermines, never completely distentangiing itseiffiom the k i t s  

of the discourse which it is critiquing. For these reasons, its po Mcs are Limited. However, it is this 

hdamental paradox in postmodernism that needs to be rethought. The political position which 

Hutcheon envisions is an unimplicated, objective stance. The transcendeme that is implied in such 
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a vision of politics and the subject is adthetical to postmodemism. This kind of mastery and 

separation of subject and O bject is profoundly questioned by postmodemisn Eschewing mastery 

c m  itseif be a very powerful political project. 

The "As If" Mode of Story TelLing 

Brian McHaie recognizes the dilemma of writing about postrnodenllsm In his review of 

Hutcheon's and Jameson's books, he articulates w h  he calls postmodemisn's Prime Directive: 

"DO not totalize; do not commit a master narrative" (Postmodernism, or the Cultural Logic 17); 

he ends his article advocating the "spirit of pluraiism" which Jarneson cautions against: 

1 wodd like to believe that, ifwe can l e m  to entertain master narratives not as 
they are intended to be entertained but in the key of as-6 and ifwe begin telling 
our own stories in the same as-ifkey, then the very nature of the discursive 
stniggle will be altered More  too long, and for the better. (32) 

This mode of story-telling simdtaneously asserts and questions its own truth-telling ability. What 

McHde seems to bit upon is something similar to Lyotard's notion of the "petit récit" (60) in 7?ze 

Postmodern Condition. There are tempocary, contingent 'tmths." If the rneaning-making of 

postmodemism is not based on a binarist mode1 of yedno, in which there is only one answer, then 

there are many tmths, and for feminism, ". . . none of which is privileged dong gendered lines" 

(Hekman, Gender and ffiowledge 9). Within this ïnany truths" scenario, discourse and the 

interplay of power and ideology within discourse become important fàctors in determining the 

measure and effect of a given truth and identity. 



The Influence of Foucault 

Foucault's discourse d y s i s  emphasizes how discourse and power are intricately linked. 

For Foucault, the subject, although constituted, is not powerless. Resistance, like power, exhs 

w i t h  relations, within nodes. It is diffuse; it is everywhere: 

There is not, on the one side, a discourse of power, and opposite it another 
discourse that nins counter to it. Discourses are tacticaI elements or blocks 
operating in the field of force relations; there can nin Werent and even 
contradictory discourses within the same strategy; they can, on the contrary, 
circulate without changing their form fiom one strategy to another, opposing 
strategy. (The History of SexuuIi~ 101-102). 

Miat is fnistratting about this description of power and resistance is its lack of specificity. Taking 

up Foucault's suggestion that power and resistance are everywhere, Nancy Hartsock says, "The 

whole thing cornes to look very hornogeneous. Power is everywhere, and so ultimately nowhere" 

(170). Hartsock suggeas that more specinc ways of situating omelves as subjects are necessary 

In addition, as fe&s have pointed out, Foucault fails to draw attention to the ways the 

subject is gendered, as he d m w s  no correlation between power and the patriarchy (Diamond and 

Quinby xvi). Furthemore, Hartsock suggests that Foucault does not recognize his own power as 

colonizer, nor the specific ways in which po wer is used: 

Foucault's world is a world in which things move, rather than people, a world in 
which subjects becorne obliterated or, rather, recreated as  passive objects, a world 
in which passivity or refusal represent the only possible choices. (167) 

Although these gaps in Foucault's theories are signincant, his ideas are stül useful for feminists. 

With respect to the question of the project of Enlightenment, for example, Foucault insists on 



rethinking the terms of the question He cautions against succumbing to the "b lacW7'  of the 

Enlightenment : 

. . . that does not mean that one has to be 'for" or "against'' the Enlightenment. It 
means precisely that one has to refw everythg that rnight present itself in the 
fom of a simplistic and authoritarian alternative: you either accept the 
Enlightenment and remah within the tmdition of its rationaiism (this is considered 
a positive terrn by some and used by others, on the contrary, as  a reproach); or else 
you cnticize the Enlightenment and then try to escape fiom its principles of 
rationaüty (which may be seen once again as good or bad). . . . . We must try to 
proceed with the analysis of ourselves as beings who are historically determhed, to 
a certain extent, by the Enüghtenrnent. ('Vhat is Enlightenment'?" 43) 

Foucault argues that '\ve have to move beyond the outside-inside alternative; we have to be at the 

fiontiers" CLWhat is Eniightenrnent?" 45). Foucault advocates a criticism which is a "histoncal 

investigation into the events that have led us to constitute ourselves and to recognize ourselves as 

subjects of what we are doing, thinklig, saying" ("What is EnlightenmentT9 46). He ends his 

I do not know whether t must be said today that the critical task still entails faith 
in Enlightenment; I continue to think that diis task requires work on our &ts, that 
is, a patient labor giving form to our impatience for iiiberty. ("What is 
Enlightenment?'' 50) 

Foucault's line is a tenuous one, but it is one which others share. Susan Hekman, for example, in 

her theorizing of a postmodem ferninism, cautions also against rejecting completely the concept of 

agency (Gender and Knowledge 189). By so dohg the bhary is back in place; rejection atFums 

that which is king rejected. In order to think differently, one cannot simply think oppositiody. 

In 'Theatnun Philosophicum," Foucault argues that ciifference, representation, and the 

subject are aii intimately linked. Foucault zeroes in on the constrictions which characteriz the 

consideration of dBerence, mired as it is in a Hegelian dialectical concept: 



The dialectical sovereignty of simüans, consists in permitting ciifferences to exist, 
but always under the d e  of the negative, as an instance of non-king. They may 
appear as the successfûi subversion of the Other, but contradiction secretly assists 
in the salvation of identities. (1 85) 

His solution, nnally, is utopic: 

The k i n g  of dinaence requires thought without contradiction, wahout 
dialectics, without negation; thought that accepts divergence; atFrmative thought 
whose instnunent is disjmction; thought of the multiple-O f the mmadic and 
dispersed multiplicity that is not limited or confiwd by the c o ~ t s  of similanty; 
thought that does not conform to a pedagogicd mode1 (the fiikery of prepared 
m e r s ) ,  but that attacks insoluble problems-that is, a thought that addresses a 
multiplicity of exceptional points, which are displaceci as we distinguish their 
conditions and which insist and subsist in the play of repetitiom. (1 85) 

The solution is to avoid categorization which relies on simüanty and which suppresses difference: 

"Difference c m  only be Liberated through the invention of an acategorical thought" ( T h e a ~ u m  

Philosophicum" 1 8 6). A kind of massive upheaval, such as Foucault is suggesting here with 

dB%rence, is what is necessary for postmodernism to incorporate gender(s), for considerations of 

the seifto accommodate the other, for feminism to effect change. 

In Foucault's discursive formations, the subject of postmodemism, then, is not utterly 

fhgmented, dispersed, and without agency. Rather these terms are themselves within a fiame of 

mind of eithedor. What Foucault niggests is that power is miplicit within discourse, a kind of 

agonistics of agency. This can be usefiil to a feminist project when this agonistics is made more 

specitic. The project of postmodernism, as negotiated by Foucault, cm be of use to feminism 

because the dynamic of mastery is configureci Werently. In this next section, 1 consider ferninists 

who use Foucadtian theory in theorking ide-= 



"A View h m  Elsewhere:" Eccentric Subjects 

Teresa de Lauretis takes her cue fiom Foucault's theory of sec as a "eechnology of 

sex" in order to theorize gender as the product of technologies, discourses, and cntical practices 

(Technologies of Gender ix). She theorizes a Wace which is both ideologicdy embedded, 

representationally contingent and at the same tirne radically speaks its otherness. in 'The 

Technology of Gender," she offers the suggestion of "a view fiom elsewhere" (25) and describes 

the double bind of feminism: '%he tension of a twofold pull in contrary directions - the critical 

negativity of its theory, and the afnrmative positivity of its politics" (26). In '%ccentric Subjects: 

Feminist Theov and Historical Consciousness," Teresa de Lauretis addresses Wittig's "lesbian" 

and situates it withm a mode1 that she calls an "eccentric subject" (143). Although she does not 

address Wittig's problernatic investment in the project of ~nlightenment,) she does provide many 

invaluable insights into the stniggks of speakhg both inside and outside a discoune. De Lauretis 

details the historical male privilege and heterosexual imperative which always already positions 

woman as other, as less than, as submissive to man. Her alternative is provocative: 

1 propose that a point of view, or an eccentric discursive position outside the male 
(hetero)sexual monopoly of power/knowledge--which is to say, a point of view 
excessive to, or not contaiwd by, the sociocultural institution of heterosexuality- 
is necessary to feminism at this point in history, that such a position exists in 
feminist consciousness as personal-political practice and can be found in certain 
feminist critical texts. (1 27) 

De Lauretis's argument is powerful. She acknowledges the heterosexual inrperative of mainStream 

society, and sees within t an engrained dynamic of domination and subordination De Lauretis' 

3 See "Homo Sum" by Monique Wittig. 



argument is that the term "lesbian" exceeds the patriarchal dekition of women; it is not contained 

The struggle against ideologicd apparatuses and socioeconornic institutions of 
women's oppression consists in refùsing the terms of the heterosexual contract, 
not ody in one's practice of living but also in one's practice of knowing. It 
consists, as well, in concurrentiy conceivhg of the social subject in terms that 
exceed, are other than, autonomous fiom, the categories of gender. The concept 
"Iesbian" is one such t e m  (143) 

De Lauretis goes on to give other terms which meet her d e w o n  of an "excessive critical 

position" (145): 'hiestiza, inappropriateld other' (1455): There are many valuable suggestions in 

de Lauretis' article. She is advocatmg a concephlalizing of identiw which contradictorily 

maintains like and unlike qualjties with others (144-45). Here there is the possibüity for solidarity 

at the same tirne as there is ciifference. It is important that several diffetences be accomrnodated. It 

is also important, however, to avoid suggesting a theoretical position as a "lesbian" in the rnanner 

in which deco~c t ion i s t s  çuch as Demda propose speaking as a woman.' 

* bMestiza" is taken fiom Gloria Andzaldua's book Borderlines/"La Frontera " (de Lauretis 
1 3 8). "Imppropriate/d O ther" is a term develo ped by Trinh T. Minh- ha, 'Tntroduction," Discourse 
6 (1986-87) (de Lauretis 144-45). 

See Demda "Becorning Womany' for this use of woman as a metaphor for writing. Somer 
Brodriib in Nothing Matmers argues against postmodeniism and poststructuralism for their 
patriarchal legacy and continued practice: 

Lévi-Strauss tried to convince women we are spoken, exchanged iike words; Lacan 
tried to teach womai we can't speak, because the phallus is the original signifier; and 
then Demda says that it just doesn't matter, it's just talk. Women are stiii used as the 
raw material for poststnictumüst analyses, exchanged in th& words like tokens or 
fetishes. (8 1) 

Brodriib's attack, however, also posits her speakmg position as beyond miplication and does not 
allo w for a hybndized position. 



In the introduction to Feminist Studies/Criticai Studies, De Lauretis proposes a concept 

of a feminist subject which is nuanced and multiple, neither smgular and contained as in 

humanism, nor dispersed and irretrievable as in p o s t h h m :  

What is emerging in feminist writings is, instead, a subject that is not divided in, 
but rather at odds with, Ianguage; an identity made up of heterogeneous and 
heterononrnous representations of gender, race, and class, and ofien indeed across 
languages and cultures; an identity that one decides to reclaim âom a history of 
multiple assimüations, and that one insists on as a strategy . . . . (8) 

This epistemological shüt, which de Lauretis attributes to feminism, is characterized by the 

consciousness of oppression that defines this particular subject, and "engenders the subject as 

political" (1 0). Judith Butler also insists upon the politics of such a subject, but she is carefid to 

place any selfkonsciousness about a subject within a discursive paradigm. 

"Constitutive Outside:" Judith Butler 

in Bodies that Mutter, Judith Butler carefully considers the determinations of the place 

and play of discourse in the construction of the subject. Butler proposes that changes in the 

subject can corne about ody through the reiterative practices of discourse that form that subject in 

the first place. 

Indeed, I can only Say '7" to the extent that I have f5st been addressed, and that 
address has mobilized my place in speech; paradoxicaily, the discursive condition 
of social recognition precedes and conditions the formation of the subject : 
recognition is not conferred on a subject, but fonns that subject. Further, the 
impossibüity of a full recognition, that is, of ever fully inhabithg the name by 
which one's social ide+ is kugurated and mobilized, impiies the iostability and 
incompleteness of subject-formation The '7" is thus a citation of the place of the 
''1" in speech, where that place has a certain prionty and anonymity with respect to 



the litè that animates it: it is the historicdy revisable possibility of a name that 
precedes and exceeds me, but without which I cannot speak. (Bodies that Mutter 
225-26) 

Here Butler indicates both the ways in which the subject is coIlStituted through discourse and the 

fhdanientally unstable components of this formation. Butler here offers the possibility of change 

in the subject, without endowing the subject with a tmmcendental, mastering quaiity. 

Butler's discussion of the discursive iimits of "sex" necessarily involves a rethinking of the 

formation of the subject. Butler addresses the 'hteateriation" of the body which "takes place (or 

f%k to take place) through certain highly regulated practices" (1). Her idea of gender is one 

which cornes to be through perfomativity, "as the reiterative and citational practice by which 

discourse produces the effects that it narnes7' (2). Butler pamstakingly delineates her ideas on 

discursive construction. It is important not to endow discourse with a "godiike agency which not 

oniy causes but composes everything which is its object" (6). It is necessary to think about the 

determination of gender as an ambiguous process, neither speaking a subject which is already 

constituted, nor bringing it completely into king through disco une: 

Subjected to gender, brit subjectivated by gender, the '7" neither precedes nor 
folIo ws the process of this gendering, but emerges ody within and as the matrix of 
gender relations themselves. (7) 

This way of thinking about discourse and agency is useful for feminists and also compatile with 

the project I am proposing. Here Butler does not think in terms of an eithedor: "language and 

m a t e r i e  are not opposed, for Ianguage both is and refers to that which is material, and what is 

materiai never M y  escapes fiom the process by which it is signified" (68). 

For Butler the activation of the subject within discourse becornes the means through which 

agency is possible: 



The 44activity" of this gendering cannot, strictiy speaking, be a human act or 
expression, a wülful appropriation, and it is certahdy not a question of takmg on a 
mask; t is the ma& through which ali wiîîing nrst becomes possible, its enabling 
cultural condition. (7) 

Butler addresses the ways in which discourse %terpepeles9' the mdividd. The repetaion of this 

mterpellation consthtes the individuai; it also provides the means for its resistance. The 

construction of gender happens through "exclusionary means" (8): 

. . . the human is not only produced over and agaimt the inhumao, but through a 
set of foreclosures fadical erasures, that are, spictly speaking, rebed  the 
possibility of cultural articulation. Hence, it is not enough to claim that hurnan 
subjects are constructeci, for the construction of the human is a differential 
operation that produces the more and the less '%wnan," the inhuman, the humdy 
unthinkable. These excluded sites corne to bound the '%muin'' as its constitutive 
outside, and to haunt those boundaries as the persistent possibility of their 
disruption and rearticulation. (8) 

This concept of the "constitutive outside" will be of particular use in my consideration of identity 

in ternis of postmodeniism and tèminism, for the same kmd of process occurs in the "1" who 

cornes to speak. For Butler, t is the process of reiteration which is c o d t i n g .  This reiterative 

process also opens up avenues of resistance: 

As a secümented effect of a reiterative or ntual practice, sex acquires its 
naturalized effect, and yet, it is also by virtue of this reiteration that gaps and 
fissures are opened up as the constitutive instabilities in such constructions, as that 
which escapes or exceeds the nom, as that which camot be wholly dehed or 
fixed by the repetitive labor of that n o m  (1 0) 

My project is in sympathy with Butler's, as t appiies to a mode1 of identity formation Butler's 

emphasis, however, is on perfonnativity, reiteration and citatioaality. It is through these means 

that the subject cornes to agency: 

"Agency" wodd then be the double-movement of king constituted in and by a 
sigmfier, where '30 be constituted" means 'Y0 be compeiied to cite or repeat or 
mimey' the signifier itself. Enabled by the very signifier tbat depends for its 



continuation on the fiture of that citational chah, agency is the hiatus in iterabüity, 
the compulsion to mstall an identity through repetition, which requires the very 
contingency, the unde teded  intend, that identity insistentiy seeks to foreclose. 
(220) 

This idea of repeating merently is the poiitical agency withm Butler's discussion. The 

constitutive outside is an ongoing part of this iterabiiay because it too is in a constant process of 

king dinérentiy codgured. In Bodies that Matter¶ Butler ernphasizes the political potential of 

such a theory: 

If there is a %ormative" dimemion to this work, it consists precisely in assisting a 
radical resigniiication of the symbolic domain, deviating the citational chain toward 
a more possible future to expand the very meaning of what counts as a vaiued and 
duabfe body in the world. (20) 

My project dovetails with Butler's in its consideration of the discursively conmcted subject and 

in its project of advocating change. Most specificaiiy, this dissertation addresses how this 

application of a strain of postmodemism, ïnfiected by feminism, illustrates the tension of rnastery 

and non-mastery in identity formation. 

Mastery and Non-Mastery in Identity Formation 

Butler is caretid to avoid a theorking of a "godlike" discourse; instead she discusses the 

ways in which a reiterative and citational discursive process produces gender. Although this 

process has a constituting effect, Butler suggests that "gaps and &sures are opened up . . . as that 

which escapes or exceeds the norm, as that which cannot be whdy dehed or fixed by the 

repetitive labor of that nomi" (10). Butler descriis a fluid dynamic of identity formation which 

s t iu  accounts for excessivity and change. Homi Bhabha uses similar ternis to discuss identity as a 

process, located as a cCdiaIectical hinge between the birth and death of the subject"(4) 



What is at issue is the performative nature of differential identities: the regdation 
and negotiation of those spaces that are continuaily, contingentiy, "opening out," 
remaking the boundaries, expusing the limits of any c h  to a singular or 
autonomous sign of dserence-be it ciass, gender or race. Such assignations of 
SOCLE diaerences-where merence is neither One nor the ûther but something 
else besides. in-between-find the5 agency in a form of the "fbture" where the past 
is not originary, where the present is not smiply transitory. It is, i f 1  rnay stretch a 
point, an interstitial fiimre, that emerges in-between the clamis of the past and the 
needs of the present. (2 19) 

This consistent undoing of binary terms of the subject is what is necessary in "how newness enters 

the world," as Bhabha puts it (9). Here a Merent kind of agency is to be found: in the remakmg 

of identity in which mastery is critiqued. Through this process, ditferent ways of interacting 

become possible, which are not hierarchically bound. 

In rny analysis of the work of Thompsoq Hohgsworth and Gmben, identity is contingent 

on relations of power; mastery is achieved by charaeters in these plays and nIms through a 

domination of an other. This mastery, ho wever, is ephemeral, because identay is predicated on 

fluctuatmg relations of power. I emphasize the ways in which particular vaiences of power, 

dependent on cultural and societal support, determine the validity of truths. Smgular tnith and a 

coherent, rnasterfùi identity are refused. The instability of identity and the critique of mastery are 

achieved through the seriaiization of identity. In addition, mastery is critiqued by images of the 

body which rebel aga& the nom. Here Butler's "constit~ftive outside" is applicable, as the limits 

of the representable body are challenged. Rather than king an exotic, unknown temtory, the 

'%onstmitive outside" is always discursively contingent. The discursive construction and 

contingency of identity is &O foregrounded by intempted and destabilized narrative techniques: 

a literal demonstration of the "gaps and fissures" in the story-telling of identity. Again here 

mastery or dominance, be it in identity or in an assertion of a singular tnith, is critiqued. 



Mastery and Non-Mastery in Spectatorship 

Because these plays and films demonstrate characters who experience identity as unstable, 

in narratives which are also interrupted and interrogated, the effect for the spectator is a 

destabiiized subject position. This h d  of spectatorship is important to a postmodem feminist 

agenda There is no one point of view or story h e  which is prioritized. Instead, the spectator 

becomes more actively engaged in choosing and developing meaning. Similar to the process of 

identity formation, in which subjects are constituted and anain agency according to shifting 

valences of power, identification is offered to the spectator, momentarily engaged, and then 

undermineci. The dynamic of mastery in the identificatory process of the spectator is also tied to 

relations of power. By engaging and thwarting this dyoamic through disrupted identification and 

in htempted narrative structures, these plays and films critique this mode1 of power and point to 

the discourses and social structures which constitute identity. In this way, the social production of 

identity is emphasized and a consideration of selfis shified to a consideration of comrnunity. As 

my d y s i s  develops, the engagement with the spectator will be elaborated in the context of the 

postmodem feminism which 1 am proposing. 

The Choice and Arrangement of Texts 

When Ji Dolan discusses postmodem performances, she cites ones which readily cross 

boundaries of theory and practice, of high and low culture, and display fkgmented, multivalent 

~haracters.~ The plays and nIms which 1 consider in this dissertation are not universally agreed 

6 Dolan discusses, for example, aanssexual Kate Bernstein as she performs her experiences 
of gender identity ('?n Defense of the Discourse 67). 
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upon as properly postmodern. The plays of Judith Thompson and Margaret Hohgsworth, in 

particular, do not refuse the "referent" but b o a  aiways employ some kind of realin aesthetic or 

narrative engagement while critiquhg it. These texts use strategies of realimi to present 

provisional visions of identity. Patricia &ben uses more radical anti-reaüst techniques to 

foreground the con~tftlction of perspective and story. Her films problematize identity in 

archetypes, in fictional representations, and in personal stories, especidy w hen she interrogates 

her own identity as a filmmaker. The works which I have chosen are arranged on a continuum of 

deployment of the strategies of realism, fiom the most realist to the least, Eom the lest O bviousky 

feminist to the most, with the plays preceding the films. 

In addition, I consider the reception of the work of Thompson, Hollingsworth and 

Gruben. This is important to my project because the postmodern feminisrn theorbihg which 1 am 

suggesting is necessarily comfnitted to a community and to a change within society. 1 offer these 

comments on reviews and critical reception as a means of understanding, to a certain extent, the 

effect that these anists have had on audiences and critics. My address of critical reception is not 

to totalize and account for all responses; it does suggea, however, a sirndtaueous reading of 

community at the sarne tirne as it offers a theoretical reading of texts. 

As the exammation of the subjedidentity strategies m the works of aii three artists will 

demonstrate, there are different emphases and concerns in their work. Judith Thompson's work 

uses viscerd and provocative images of bodies which are threatened. In Chapter Two, 1 

emphasize the dynasnic of subjedidentity with a particular focus on its inscription on the body in 

the work of Judith Thompson. Although there is also attention to the body in Margaret 

Hollingsworth's plays, her work is remarkable for its foregromding and destabilihg of narrative 
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structure. In Chapter Three, 1 emphasize the subjedidentity dyaamic in narrative. Narrativity 

becomes important because it is a h  one of the ways in which identity cornes into king: the dots 

are connected as the subjects are M e d  into a story of becoming. 1 have chosen to consider the 

work of two plaprrights who have been categorized very differently, h a s t  oppositionaliy, and 

yet I show how this pattern of subjectlidentity is relevant for both their works. Patricia Gmben's 

work is itseif wide-ranging and technically experimental; it is concerned with a reworkmg of both 

body and narrative. In Chapter Four, 1 discuss Gmben's pro blematization of the articulation of 

identity; Gniben eventually takes herseif as an object of inqujr. 1 will discuss the results of these 

analyses in Chapter Five, and return to other theoretical issues which are raised through the 

consideration of these piays and films in light of my reading of them as posmiodem ferninist 

conf&prations of identity. 



'Tdentity Panic:" The Piays of Judith Thompson 

I'm in the holding your breath part right now, so I'm not sure what's on the other 
end, but I feel k e  I'm so big I'd barely fit into Kirk Cornmunity Centre (Pony in 
White Biting Dog 106) 

In my discussion of the piays of Judith Thompson, 1 will demonnrate how identity is 

destabilized through the serialization of the subject, through disniptive images of the body, and 

through deaabiiized and intermpted narrative. The emphasis in this chapter will be on the 

representation of the body. First, a consideration of the reception of Thompson's piays will 

contextuaüze rny reading. The varied reactions to Thompson's phys suggest a viewing process 

which is f'iindamentally unnerving. 

Reception 

The plays of Judith Thompson are hard to watch, as characters are plunged into horrifymg 

circumstances and grapple with paradoxical renewals. The "identity panic" which ensues on 

watching Thompson's plays is hailed by some and reviied by others. The stahis of Judith 

Thompson as  a playwright within the Canadian context is open to debate. Some critics, like 

Robert Nunn, declare her 'Vie greatest playWright this country has seen, now or ever" ("Spatial 

Metaphor" 3). Nunn admits this opinion %y no means represents critical consensus" (3). 

Newspaper articles referhg to early productions of The Crackwuïker gleefùlly report the number 

of walkouts.' One article reports that a disgnintled theatre patron leaving The CrachaZker 

7 See 'Crackwalker star thrüled by walkouts" for actor Hardee T. Lineham's perspective 
on the Toronto Workshop production of The CruckwaIkr in 1982 in which many patrons walked 
out. Ray Conlogue, in an article anticipating the production of mite Biting Dog, described how 
as many as 40 people a Nght walked out at the maiastage production of m e  CrackwaIker at the 
Centaur Theatre in Montreal. ("Stage Set for Dose" n.p.) 



verbaüy attacked an usher: 'Y hope a i i  the characters die. 1 hope the author dies. And I hope you 

die! "' (Kaplan, "nie Crackwuikzr" o. p.). Clearly Thompson's plays provo ke extreme reactions. 

Judith Thompson herself attracts a certain amount of notoriety a s  a playwright. 

Newspaper reviews, particularly early in her career, were obsessed with who Judith Thornpson 

was. The headline in The Globe and Mail on the occasion of The Crackwalker's nominaiion for a 

Dora Mavor Moore award proclaimed: "Thompson different fiom her characters" (Steed mp.). In 

interviews, Thompson reports simüar responses i?om people: 

I'LI be at weddings or functions and the person sitting next to me dl t b k  1 m u t  
be racy or radical and taik to me in a vulgar way because of rny plays . . . . 
A lot of people expect green haii. ("Judith Thompson InteMew" 91) 

I f  some audience members expect her to act like one her characters, some critics endow her with 

a simiiar essentiaikm In his introduction to The Other Side of the Durk Urjo Kareda attributes an 

uncaony artistic ab- to Judith Thompson: 

Judith Thompson hears the poetry of the inarticulate and the semi-litenite, 
embodying the colloquialisms, the b m d  names, the k t u r e d  but expressive 
syntax, with the urgency of their speakers. She fiees her words to carry their wiid, 
unruly, seeking spirits. (9) 

Not only does the playwright "hear" the words of the inarticulate, she also translates their spirits 

into words. Her plays, Kareda irnplies, remind us of our physicaiity, our ineluctable humanity: 

Piss, shit, sweat, blood, saliva, vomit, tears, mucous, semen, amniotic fluid-these 
are as central and as inescapable a part of o u .  beings as our heart, our mind, o u  
soul. (10) 

Judith Thompson may not have green hair, but she seems to have a special ab- to hem, 

translate, and evoke an essential king. This h e  of critical inquiry assumes an unchanging reality, 

inscribing a coherent, Imined, essentialist self. It assumes an inarticulacy and primitiveness in the 



other: Thompson's plays are a dangerous walk on the wild side, leading irrevocably back to the 

Indeed, Judith Thompson herselfmight agree with such articulations of the seE in which 

truths are universal and unchanging. in interviews she expresses her beüef in a collective 

unconscious: "1 do believe in a collective unconscious. 1 beiieve that we can aii relate to 

everything. Somewhere. Somehow" ("Judith Thompson Interview" 89). In an i n t e ~ e w  with 

Cynthia Zimmerman, Thompson descnis her belief in synchronicity and ber disagreement with 

Marxist views that "everything is contextual" ("A Conversation" 86). In the same interview, 

Thompson speaks of her own phywriting process in similar ternis: 

. . . 1 know that the way my work works is fiom a kind of chaos, a helpless chaos. 
And that I have to feel passive, like a conduit. I don't want to do too rnuch 
dîrecting because of that. As soon as 1 start to feel queenly, I know somethhg will 
go away. (193) 

She wants her audience to experience a painful recognition: 

My real hope is to hold a &or up to all of us, because I thuik that awakening, 
slipping out of our comas, is what 2's ail about. Otherwise, we do not iive-4's the 
unexamined Mie. The coma lifting, then, becomes political. Art is political, should 
be political, but only in this really essential way. (1 93) 

'Truth" is a word which recurs in i n t e~ews  with Judith Thompson: "You've just got to te l  the 

truth and leave it at that. The horrible Truth," ("Judith Thompson inteMe* 102) and later, 

'Truth is simply what is. It happens to you through not doing anything" (1 03). Her perception of 

identity is sllnilarly anchored in essentiaüst ternis: 'Tm fàçcuiated by identity, and 1 guess my 

work discusses the stripping way [sic] of the superficial masks to reveal the genuine self' 

(Thompson in Cadoret np.). 



Reports of audience reaction and critical commentary account for the disniption brought 

about by Judith Thompson's work. They do this by seekmg to find the reai seifwithin or behind 

the plays. Kareda and other reviewers see Thornpson's work within a context of a social reaiity in 

which people are universally the same: she speaks for the disenfr;inchised or explores the m a t e d  

urge in real people, real selves. Critical commentary on Thompson's work O fien stresses her 

Freudian predilections. Robert Nunn develo ps psyc hological readings of Thompson' s plays, 

emphasizhg the conscious/unconsciou divide, the Oedipal patterns and the ' tn~anny~ ' '~  Nunn 

ends his article on Thornpson's latest play SZed with a reflection on his reading of Thompson: 

It wouldn't do of course to limit Judith Thompson's plays to the kind of reading 1 
have sketched out here; but you couid do worse than to read her plays as  "siices 
fiom the banquet of Freud." The reetuni of the repressed haunts her plays, in both 
modes outüned by Freud: within the individual psyche, the Stranger who is not a 
straoger breaks through the defences mounted by repression; and, within the 
collective psyche of the urban society that is her subject, the forgotten belief5 of 
the past break through the defences of ratiooaüsm. (%rangers" 32) 

Nunn's analyses most often situate Thompson's work within a Freudian context, displayhg the 

interplay of the conscious and the unconscious, the ego and the id. I have simüar concerns to 

Num's, in signahg the ways in which Thompson's plays ''break through the defences of 

ratiooalism," yet my approach is to situate her work within a context of postmodernism and 

feminism. Although 1 cm recognize and read her works in an essentialist paradigm, at the same 

t h e  I recognize that reactions to her work both in perfiormance and as written text are anything 

but contaiaed, codhned, or settled. This provocation has to do with the disturbing visions of 

See Nunn, "Spatial Metaphor in the Plays of Judith Thompson" and "Strangers to 
Ourselves: Judith Thompson' s Sled." 



identity which perrneate her work and the corresponding uncodortable relationship whic h is 

estabiished between text and audience or reader. 

It should be noted that 1 am considering Thompson's work within a hmework of a 

particular kind of feminism. When asked in an interview ifshe thinks of her work as femhkt, 

Thompson replies: 

No. 1 suppose you codd interpret it that way. But I never think, oh I mustn't 
portray that woman as a weak wornan, although some feminists believe th you 
should oniy have strong women. (Tevisions of Probability" 19) 

This interview, as Tomc -tes at the outset, was to discuss what t was like to be a woman 

wnting for the theatre (1 8). The questions spiral in and out of a discussion of Thompson's 

experience in the theatxe and the portraya1 of her female characters, and Thompson ends by 

saylig, "We haven't really ken  very feminist" (23). Of Dee in 1 am Y o m  Thompson says, '4 

wanted to do a study of an amoral w o d  ("Revisions of Probability" 19). Elsewhere she 

describes creating a character who "goes to the extreme of rnasochism" ('(ludith Thompson 

Interview" 1 02): 

And I'm certain that a lot of feminists would take issue with that and say that you 
are not to portray a masochistic fernale, because that's perpetuating a notion that' s 
incorrect. To that I wouid say, no, it's examining an issue that's true, and until you 
examine what is, what exists, you can't do anything about it. ("Judith Thompson 
Interview" 102) 

Thompson takes situations to the extrerne of what is. As Margaret Hollingsworth says about 

Thompson's work, "Al1 our worst fears are in her plays, not understated, but overstated- 

shouted, repeated, hammered home, airnost to the point of abswdity" (iCCo Ilaborators" 1 7). 

Indeed, Thompson presents territory which can be recuperated by the patriarchy. In an 



article in Language NI her Eye, where conaibutors are asked to address wntmg and gender, 

Thompson again tries to address the feminism of her characters: 

In preparation for this essay, I tried to look at my characters fiom a feminist 
perspective. To be honest, I wasn't exactly sure what 1 was looking for, but what 1 
saw is that none of my characters defines herseif as a feminist, or as someone 
opposed to femmism. Most of thern have been successfbily brainwashed by the 
patriarchal society in which they live, and the others are in a fight to the death with 
themselves because of it. But there is one 1 have overlooked, I think, waiting 
patientiy at the back of the crowd, her legs crossed at the ankle, watching me. She 
is waiting for me to see her. I will look at her now. (%ne TweW' 264) 

The rest of the piece goes on to descri'be this one overlooked, the 'Werninist feminist" (2641, the 

one who is caught within patriarchal prescriptions at the çame t h e  as she tries to fight them: 

She is uncornfortable with beautifid women, and at times has experienced 
momtrous jealousy towards them, hating them for their gifts, and wishing them ill 
fortune. She feek very happy, however, with Git or "uglf' women, because she is 
not threatened by them. Inwardly, she feeb superior to the ''ugly" women, and 
infenor to the beautifid. She hates herseiffor this. (264) 

Similarly, Thompson's characters are conflicnial in their attitudes and codicted within 

themselves. Thompson begins and ends the piece with a reference to a dream she had in which she 

felt herselfdivided, like a womi, split over and over and regenerated in her piays. A question 

recurs which indicates not a whole se& but one which is always only partial: "Where are the 

eleven other Judiths?" (267) 

Perhaps it is this UIlfeminist feminism which postmodernism can explain. Ric Knowles has 

noted the contradiction in Thompson: 

Thompson does not present herself as a feminist, and in fàct in ber public 
staternents she sounds very much like a traditional liberal hum& wntiag 
universal truths for posterity: '7 want to wnte piays that last forever and transcend 
cultural context," she told the DuMaurier World Stage panel. Nevertheless, her 
plays revision dramatic structures and ianguages that ferninist theorists have sho wn 
to be phallogocentric . . . . as in much feminist drama (as pointed out by Helene 



Keysaar in her book, Ferninisi Theatre) the inevitabiiity of reversal becomes in 
Judith Thompson the potentiai for transformation . . . . (The Achievernent of 
Grace" 36) 

Ekewhere, in an article entitled 'The Draniaturgy of the Perverse," Knowles develops an 

argument which formulates a definition of postmodemism as he sees it working in plays such as 

those of Judith Thompson. Knowles argues that Thompson, by perverting aaditional Aristotelian 

and modernist structures such as recognition and revers& presents characters who undergo not 

one reversal or recognition, but several. With reference to a scene fiom Lion in the Sireers, 

Knowles describes the stories of the characters as 'jxofound and ve-ry moving" (228), and yet, at 

the same t h ,  he argues that 'the identities of the characters seem to be contingent upon the 

changing stories they teil of themselves and one another" (328). 

JeMifer Harvie also addresses the tension between the universalizing and deconstnicting 

impulses in Thompson's writing. She argues that it is possible to read Thompson's work, 

particularly Lion in the Streets, both ways. In an article on Lion in the Streets, Harvie describes 

the '~rovisional fictions" of this work and their emancipatory potential: 

The difFerent oppressed subjectivities we idenfied in our unified realist reading 
need not be totally deconstructed and disallowed by this second reading, but rnay 
be contextualized as historicaüy and culturally contingent fictions, not 
transcendental realities . . . . The 'kealities" which we read in our unifïed realist 
reading may thus be seen as necessary but only provisional. ("Corxstnicting 
Fictions" 9 1 ) 

Harvie draws attention to the 'knetarepresentational" hagery of the play and its implications for 

the subjectivity of the characters (90). She suggests that there can be a simultaneous installing and 

undennining of reality within Lion in the Streets and that these two readings are wt incompatible; 

rather they are "necessary but ody provisionai" ("Constnicting Fictions" 9 1). 
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I t  is with aiterition to this kind of sensibiiay and reading of texts that 1 will pumie my 

discussion of the plays of Judith Thompson. The tension that ffiowles and Harvie ident* (and 

which is also manifested in the mixed reaction and critical analysis of her plays) can be attrr'buted 

to the tension there is between positions of mastery and non-mastery withlli her work: there is a 

Lingering reluctance to rehquish what is stable and whole, combined with an impulse to shatter 

such notions of completeness in an articulation of an identity which is aiways contingent. 

In this chapter, 1 focus on identity with particular attention to the representation of the 

body as a site of ambiguity. In my discussion of the plays, 1 will indicate the postmodem 

techniques which challenge the concept of the self: specificaliy in the violent images of the body, 

in characters whose articulation of identity is unstable, and in the self-reflexive nature of the piays 

themselves. The real impetus to change, compatible with a feminist agenda, is in the ways in 

which these plays question the viability of the self as a coherent, stable entity. Using the paradigm 

of subjecdidentity which 1 have established in Chapter One, 1 will read as postmodern feminist 

texts these selected plays of Judith Thompson: The CrackwaZk-er, Tmado, and I am Yours, from 

the collection, The Other Side of the Da& as weli as two separately published plays, White Biting 

Dog, and Lion in the Streets. 

The Crackwafker 

In my discussion of this play, 1 will emphasize the different representations of identity that 

the characters of Sandy and Theresa offer. The oppression of Sandy and Theresa in The 

CrackwaIker is p M  to observe. Sandy is brutalized by her husband, Joe, who has possibly 

raped Theresa, Sandy's best fiend. Where she is the whore to Joe, Theresa is the Madonna to 



her own husband. Both positions are equally constricting. In addition, both Sandy and 

Theresa participate in their own oppression. As one reviewer says, 'nieresa is fàr nom king a 

feminist protagonist. Dim-witted and prorniscuous, she is dependent on the state and on men for 

her Survivai" (Steed n-p.). In a review of The Crackwakr, however, Ioanne McIntyre, who 

played Theresa, descnis why she chose to do this script: 

A couple of weeks before auditioning for The CruckwaIker, I'd read for Sumething 
Red (a Vancouver play set in much the same stranim of small-time criminals and 
their der ing,  masochistic girl fiends, produced in the spring of 1 980 at the 
Tarragon). It had the same gutter language as Cruckw~Iker~ and the characters 
even had the same kmd ofjobs--but no self-esteem, especiay. the women. 

But when 1 read CruckwuIker, I found the characters had self-respect. Theresa 
may be retarded, but she is the brightest slow person you wül ever meet. She 
knows she's not a good mother--'9 slow, Ai, I slow"--but she hows  what the 
problem is, and when she gets into scrapes, she gets out of them. (In Conlogue, 
"Crackwaiker Brilliant Play" El)  

According to McIntyre, Theresa has an ability to overcome situations; she knows how to get out 

of scrapes. Although Sandy demonstrates indications of this ability as well, she does not embrace 

this instability as Theresa does. Sandy's adherence to a set of ordered and ordering principles 

situates her within a restrictive paradigm in which only serialLed change is possible. There are 

moments of rupture, and cracks in her veneer, but these only suggest a hdamental instabilty that 

is manifesteci fully in Theresa. Theresa's mode of interacting is not based on the same kind of 

mastery. With Theresa there is no coherence or nostalgia for the past. She lives in a perpetual 

present. Theresa most often represents a different configuration of identity: identity as a site of 



Sandy: Maintainhg Order 

One of the first scenes in ne Crackwallker illustrates Sandy's mode of interaction and her 

attempts to assert agency by participating in a shaong dynamic of domination and subordination. 

When Sandy conûonts Theresa with the rumour that Theresa had sex with Joe, Theresa tek her 

that Joe raped her. Sandy bas already ensured that loe won't be cheating on her again. Joe beat 

Sandy when she accused h i .  of infideüty; she responded in kind. Sandy attacked Joe when he was 

sleeping and ripped his back with her high heels. The moment she asserts herselfover Joe, and 

loe's recognition of this, is emphasized by italics in the script: 

SANDY. . . . You shoulda seen him, fïrst 1 guess he thought he was dreamin, 
eh, so he just lies there makin these ugly noises burpin and that? And then 
he opens his eyes, and puts his hands up like a baby eh, and then 1 seen him 
see the heel. . . . (23) 

The only way for Sandy to achieve agency is in a dynamic of domination and subordination, a 

dynamic which characterizes her relationship with Joe. Shortly after this scene, Joe renims and the 

power shifts when Sandy accuses h i .  of raping Theresa Sandy does not have enough evidence to 

sustain her accusation, and she retreats: 

SANDY. 1 didn't mean it. 
JOE. It was a joke? 
SANDY. 1 was just--you said you liked her better. 
JOE. Wkt? 
SANDY. You said you liked-po kin her better. (30) 

The scene becomes increasingly intense and violent. Joe thrusts Sandy away fiom him; she rushes 

at him, trying to scream, but is stopped by a pamtùl stomach seizure. Joe finds this arousing. Joe 

rnakes advances to her, but as the stage directions say, "SANDY looh at him with hatreà" (3 1). 

Joe is about to Ieave when Sandy calls him back: 



SANDY. [headdown] Joe. 
JOE. What can 1 do for ya? 
[SANDY smiles] 
Oh, ya do want it. Okay, why - why- don? ya take that b l o w  there off 
[ S e  removes her blouse] 
Hm. And the skirt. 
[She removes her skirt. She is Zef? Ni a bru and pantyhose with a [ow crotch. 
He no&, Zooking her up and down] 
How corne ya like it like this? Eh? [shahs his heu4 
1 gotta be somewhere. 
[JOE exiis. SANDY remains onstage, not moving. Lights out quickly.] (3 1 )  

In the develo pment of this scene, the interactions build to a point of high ciramatic tension so that 

Sandy's rejection is utter and devastating. Although her body rebels, with the stomach cramp, this 

arouses loe. Sandy cannot even achieve agmcy by participating in a seduction of ke .  

Sandy is doomed to a cycle of repetition based on this pattern of domination and 

subordination. Her agency is W e d  to the situation in which she h d s  herself. The result is that 

she repeats a series of positions which essentially M e r  very little. Her reiteration of her 

subjectivity, in the temis of Judith Butler, is limited: she does not repeat Merentiy. Joe leaves, 

cornes back and then Ieaves again. Sandy swears that she will not take him back, but she does. 

Change is ody extemal: when Joe is away, Sandy learns how to make a new drink, "a Dirty 

Mother," and a new way to apply eyeliner to make her eyes look bigger (59). At the end of the 

play, the only change they are going to make is one of geography. Sandy and Joe will move to 

Calgary to start again. In reviews of the play, one of Sandy's lines is quoted repeatedlf: "bein 

dead ain't no different fiom livin anyway. . . . It's just like movin to Brockville or Oshawa or 

somethin. It ain't that difEerent9' (45). This line epitornizes Sandy's philosophy and the extent to 

See reviews by Richard W. Cadoret in The City DwelZer, Mark Czamecki in Maclean 's, 
Doug Bale in The London Free Press. 
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which she makes any changes in her lité. This seriaüzation of positions as subject undermines 

coherence in the character of Sandy. 

There are other moments when the coherence of Sandy is threatened. The discursive 

construction of identity is foregrounded in dialogue. Both Sandy and Theresa are continually 

%terpeUated" by various discourses. One of the ways in which the unity of identity is 

imerrogated in the plays of Judith Thompson is in the overt ackmwledgement of discursive 

authorities. In The CrackwaIker, discursive authonties, such as The Reader 's Digest, the "sosha 

worker", and invisible others such as Bonnie Cain are invoked. Moments of an individuai's 

experience are affirmeci and given greater significance by connections which can be made to a 

kind of ideal self in the movies, in literature, or in popular mythology. At one point, Sandy uses 

Funny Girl to descni  how her relationship with Joe used to be: ''1 used to feel like we was in the 

fùckin movies," she says and describes a scene fiom the movie with Barbara Streisand and Omar 

Sharifthat she and Joe seemed to reenact (24). She looks to Alan for an diïrrmtion of her sense 

of self: "Am 1 gettin ugly lookin?" (42). Through these consistently present rembders of the 

discursive production of identity, the coherence of an individual as a "self' is put into question. 

Agency as a subject is configured in a Iarger context of shiRing relations of power, related to 

discourse. 

A more substantial instabiby in Sandy's identity is intimated at times. Sandy maintains 

order ody superfïcially. She asks Theresa to stay overnight because she is scared to be alone. She 

hears a cat scream and wakes Theresa up. She goes Uito the other room and, as the stage 

directions indicate, "screams a prima/ scream" (53) for no apparent reason. She cornes out to 

Theresa to say, ' lt was nothin" (53). Sandy's instability of identity is oniy shown briefly like this, 



or in the example of her severe stomach cramp, and then she quickly embraces order or reason to 

give her security. In an mterview, Thompson descriks Sandy's cbaracter: 

Sandy believes that there's a right way to be and she's extremely Calvinist. She 
believes that the salt and pepper should be kept up in the second cupboard. She 
believes that when you butter toast, you butter it to the edges. She beiieves that 
you have a cup of tea at ten o'clock. You don't Wear mismatchhg socks, you Wear 
rnatching gloves, you have your buttons dom up, you have your clothes cleaned, 
you have your supper at five. 

In other words, the quotidian k what saves her nom the abyss. ("Judith 
Thompson interview" 95) 

Sandy's obsession with the de- and adherence to order is counterpointed by the disorder and 

chaos which characterizes Theresa As this quote fiom Thompson illustrates, the threat of the 

outside is siiified by the abyss. 

Theresa: Negotiating the Abyss 

The image of the abyss is similar to what Butier calls the bcconstitutive outside." The abyss 

is an image which recurs in Thompson's work and is most often a space of extreme ambiguity. 

She describes it variously as "death" ("Judith Thompson Interview" 95) and a s  a "nightmare" (In 

Now np.). The abyss is fightening and destabilizing: 

The abyss is death. It's what you don't know . . . . You see an abyss when you're 
fàlling, in that dream where you're fàlling and tàlling and there's no bottom. 
("Judith Thompson Interview" 95) 

The abyss is a place where a different kind of repetition is possible. At the end of the play, when 

Alan kiUs Danny, his and Theresa's baby, Sandy puts the horror into perspective by taking care of 

business. She c& the police, arranges the fuwrai; she makes sure that justice is done. '7 think it's 

better off dead," Sandy says (70). But her ordering and rationalking are not able to account for 



everythmg. When Saady d e x n k s  the thexal, she mentions the wreath of flowers around the 

baby's neck to disguise the mark of the strangle: "The flowers never hid it they just made ya look 

harder, ya know? They jwt made ya look harder" (7 1). It is the threat of the outside that keeps 

Sandy in check. What the rnakeup of Sandy suggests, the character of Theresa more completely 

embodies. The changes Theresa makes fiom one position to another are not reasoned away. 

Rather they occur quickly and without psychologking. Theresa arrives a .  Sandy and Joe's, 

carrying her dead baby in a bag; she accuses Alan and he runs away. As they wait for the police to 

arrive, Sandy tums to console Theresa who is crying. She says that she's moving to Calgary with 

Joe and suggests that Theresa Msit her. But Theresa has already switched allegiance to another 

context. She is working at Kresge's and c m o t  leave: 

THERESA. [tells story joyomiy wifh no trace of griejl Down at Kresge's up 
with Ivy. Ha! She hardly funny she hardly get pissed off when 1 eatin icin 
she yeiiin. 'Trese, ifyou eat one more chocolate icin I t e h  Charlie I tellin 
on you, Ivy, snitchin butter tarts!" They're hardly good, thougb, them tarts. 
Ivy English ... Sorry 1 can't comin with ya out west, Sanny ... Ivy be piss 
OE (68) 

Sandy is no longer Theresa's best fiend; Ivy has replaced her. As the stage directions indicate, 

Theresa moves f?om grief to joy in moments. Seemingly with little thought, Theresa also moves 

f?om one se& relationship to another. In her accusation of Alan she has already established a 

different discursive situation for herself: 

THERESA. You goin up the river to Penetang, Ai, you goin there tomorrow 
and you never coming out for what you done you not goin back with me 1 
goin with Ron Harton he better than you he not stoppem breathk, he still 
1Mn up on Division up at Shuter's? 1 callin him up and 1 goin steady with 
him he better lookin you funny lookin 1 screwin him. (66) 



Theresa acts and perceives her situations differently. Although she moves fiom one situation to 

the next, she does so immediately, without an insistence that things wiil change. This positionmg 

is expedient and demonstrates its arbitrariness. By bringing to the fore the way in which Theresa 

is constructed as a subject and the way in which terms are interchangeable, Thompson presents an 

identity which is not a 'teasomble" coherent self Theresa's changes are not explained away as 

Sandy's are. She sirnply takes up a new position as it suits her. 

It does not matter ifthings do not make sense; Theresa does not try to assert '?rutnith" Her 

hold on truth Ui the play is always precarious. She does not maiiciously mislead; her tmtb is plural 

and dependent on context. She is a Limmal character, one who negotiates between worlds of her 

own and other's making. In the opening monologue of the play, she is ever aware of the 

 cations of the Yruw her story of when Mrs. Beddison threw her out is replete with 

contradictions. Danny and she are just fiends, she says, 'îve're just tallcin, eh, we weren't dohg 

nothin" (1 9). Then as the story thickens, and Mrs. Beddison ttneatens to iatrude, Theresa panics: 

"so 1 get scared, eh, so I tell D m y  to get in the closet. We don't got no clothes on, eh, so I put 

his jeans and that under the covers Wte I'm sleepin" (19). It is unclear whether or not she has been 

raped by Sandy's husband, Joe. At fkst she t e k  Sandy that it is tme: 

TKERESA. He done it when 1 never wanted it it's true. 
SANDY. It is, eh? 
THERESA. S'true, Sanny. Don't teil Joe, eh? (25) 

But when she is conf?onted with a public situation, she is unable to counteract Joe's "tnith:" 

JOE. It's true. 1 corne in piss dniok I'm passed out on the floor and there she is 
down on all fours shovin her big white ass in my nice. (29) 

Neither a confession nor an accusation is forthcoming. Her tmth is neither: 



JOE. Tell em Like it was Trese, and no crossin fhgers. 
THERESA. Go away. 
SANDY. Therese is he tellin the tnrtb? 
ALAN. Theresa you never done that, did ya? Shown him your burn? 
JOE. This is your last chance, burger, now tell the fùckin truth or 1 get serious. 
SANDY. Don't lie to me Theresa. 1 can forgive a Io t of things but not a lie. 
ALAN. You cm tell the truth, Theresa, I'U take care of ya  
SANDY. Eh, Trese? 
[Pause] 
THERESA [laughing] Who fàrted? (29) 

The representation of Theresa emphasizes the interchangeability of situations and of subjectivity . 

In the postmodem world, the %th'' th" contingent, and created by discursive practices. Theresa 

probably has ken "sucking off the queers d o m  by the Lido," but we never really find out for 

sure. This is the presentation of a dinerent kind of identity and a challenge to the concept of a 

subject which is binarily bouod in a subject/object dynamic. In the end no single designation or 

discursive authority works. Theresa is neitherbth the "Madonna" Alan d e s  her out to be, 

nodand the retard whore that Joe calls her. M e r  Sandy's long monologue descnikig the fimeral 

at the end of the play, Theresa appears briefly after sounds of a small struggle offstage. Her final 

words are haunting: 

THERESA. Stupid old bassard don't go foolin with me you don? even know 
who I look like even. You don? even know who I lookin me. (71) 

Whether Theresa au maintains her hold on Alan's designation, that she looked like the madonna, 

is uncertain. What is clear is that the pull of positionhg within discourse is strong. Theresa, to a 

certain extent, needs to be recognized: who she's "lookin üke." But as ber struggle oftStage 

reveals, this position is only temporary and replete with contradictions. 



Other [mages of Ambivalence 

In addition to Thereq the baby in The CrackwuIker is an ambivalent figure. It imperfectly 

completes the picture Alan imagines: the madonna and child. But Alan carmot cope with a wife 

and a child who are not as they are supposed to be. Theresa cannot meet the needs of Danny who 

is not n o d :  he does not respond as a baby should. He is de&, perhaps mentaily disabled. He 

does not fit easily into the paradigms of the ideal fàmily. The "not n o d '  does not belong. It 

takes up too much space. When Danny cries and cries, Alan finally silences him by strangiing him. 

He is not able to cope with a baby who does not behave, with the world of the crackwalker, with 

a world where good and evil are not so easily distinguished. 

When Thompson talks about her plays, as I have noted above, she often refers to her work 

in ternis of psychoanalysis. Critics have duly pointed out the psychoanalytic interpretations that 

are possible of stage and script readings. Robert NUM, for example, adyzes the spatial 

metaphors of The &zckw~iker, White Biting Dog, and l am Yours, and demonstrates the constant 

emphasis on the precariousness of the conscious/uncooscious divide. In the early productions of 

The CrackwaZkzr, for example, the openiug to a large sewer pipe was a domhant stage image: 

It is a metaphor of the permeable barrier separating the world of the '4conçcious" 
fkom the world of the %nconscious," waking from dreamhg, sanity f?om 
psychosis. In social terrns it k a metaphor for the penneable barrier between those 
who survive economicaiIy and those who do not. The image of a sewer as the 
access and passage to the cûnconscio~'' is in keeping with the play's dual stress 
on the feamilness of what is just on the other side and on its Wariity-that is our 
SUE d o m  there, always hidden under out feet. ("Spatial Metaphor" 1 O) 

What these images emphaste above all is the precarious state of king between places. There is 

no stable, s e c w  sense of seifto rely on. Identity is in continuai motion 



Whereas 2 % ~  Crackwalkcr eventuaily received great acclaim (after it returned fiorn a 

successful engagement at the Centaur Theatre in Montreai), White Biting Dog received mostly 

negative reviews when Ï t  was fim performed.10 Academic reaction is also mixed. Robert Nunn 

sums it up best: '4 have seen it, read it countless times, am deeply impressed by it, and it slips 

through my kgers like quicksilver" ("Spatial Metaphor" 10). 

Similar to The CrackwaIkm, this play presents extreme situations where the physical 

nature of the characters and their circumstances are emphasized. Interactions are dependent on a 

pattern of domination and subordination. This play concerns Cape's mission to reunite his parents, 

Glidden and Lomia, in order to save his fàther who is suflkring fiom a debilitathg disease incurred 

by the handüng of sphagnum moss. Early in the play, Pony, a psychic, is sunnwned to help Cape. 

She goes into a trance and speaks in the voice of Lomia, Cape's mother: 

PONY. Ooooooooooh that's lovely darling could you just do the inside of my 
am, oh God that is delicious I just made a lovely thick Guuiy burp! (20) 

Cape almost vomits (20). In a matter of minutes Lomia and her lover, Pascd, arrive destmite on 

the doorstep of Cape and Glidden's home. In the course of the play, Cape manipulates aL Pony 

fàils in love with him and declares she will do anything fbr him. Acting for Cape, she is fbrced into 

actions which involve domination and conquering: she fèels jealousy of Cape's attraction to 

Pascal, his mother's lover. She even tdy  tums on herse& "squishes" the old Pony and commits 

suicide in order to stop herself h m  acting in the way she has been Lomia, Cape's mother, is a 

Jocasta figure. Robert Nunn goes so fàr as to say that the mother-son relationslip is the only 

'O See Lyle Slack, "Dog's Creator is undaunted by her play's poor reception-" nie 
Spectator. 9 Feb 1984. 
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relationship which matters in the play ("Spatial Metaphop1 O). Cape forces Lomia to return to his 

M e r ;  he seduces her lover, P d .  Both women are p a w  of Cape. The agency which is 

afforded to Pony and Lomia in these positions is limiteci and involves a subjugation of the self or 

the othcr. Change cornes when the borders which maintain such a self are put into crisis. In this 

section, I wili consider the representation of Pony and Lomia as limited subjects. 1 will then 

consider the images of abjection, with refkrence to Julia Kristeva9s discussion Ï n  Powers of 

Horror. In this play the discourse of the rebellion of identity is written on the body. 

Limited Subjects: Pony and Lomia 

Although both women are pawns of Cape, they present vastly diffèrent &male figures. 

Pony is an innocent, comected in a naive way to a psychic world. Her credentials are somewhat 

dubious: 

PONY. Like this isn't a very good example, but up in Kirkhd, whenever I 
wanted the t d c  light to change, I'd just squeeze my bumcheeks together, 
eh, hard as  I codd, ta1 alrnost passed out but it worked, it worked every 
the .  (18) 

Both her language and her appearance suggest her "idiot savante" status. In the Tarragon 1993 

production her costume and performance emphasized the character ' s "geekiness": she wore cat's 

eye glasses and knee socks, for example, in contrast to the impeccably groomed Daniel McIvor 

who played Cape. Pony's naivety as a character is reaikd when she is sexually dominated by 

Cape. She eventualiy internalizes this domination and bangs herselt; not liking the 'Tonf' she bs 



At the other end of the spectnun is Lotnia, Cape's mother. Her action is to seduce: her 

husband, her Iover, her son. By d accounts, Jackie Burroughs' performance in the origmal 

production in 1984 was stumhg: 

Star büling, as much for her role as for her performance, rnust go to Jackie 
Burroughs as L o d  This must be, and is in her performance, a striknigly sexual 
and self-dramatipn 

. . 
g woman . . . . (Conlogue, "Funny, Exuberant S p W  E10) 

Lomia's overt sexuality empowers her to an extent, but aiso puts her into situations where she 

rejects or dominates, or is rejected or donmiated. She and Cape play out roles of mother and son, 

nvitching domination and subordination Cape grabs Lomia h m  his bedroom, where she is 

making love with Pascai, and drags her into the Livmg nom: 

CAPE. You're coming with me whether you like t or not, young lady. (places 
her in chair) Now, in future, you corne when I cd! (51) 

Moments later Lomia cajoles Cape: 

LOMIA. Awww. What wodd you Like to teil me, baby, that Miss Opal said 
your drawing of a horsey was very bery good? Well 1 couldn't care less, it 
loo ks Like a blo b to me! ! 

CAPE. I muid like to tell you that father is dying. 
(he hos her in his control now). (5 1) 

Cape eventualiy dominates Lomia, seducing her lover, making her pretend to return to Glidden. 

But ail plans fau through. They are both left at the end of the play, cowering together. The note 

on which the play ends is ominous. Mother and son seem to be undergoing some khd of 

transformation, but the result is uncertain. Says Cape, 'Do you think it wili make . . . any . . . 

The agency which Pony and Lomia achieve in this way is minimal. The subject is doomed 

to repetition, to inefktuai action which resuits in either hollow momentary aiumph or 
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devastating defeat. Transfomiation in subjectivity is more evident in the repfaying of identity 

which involves a more distinct destabhtion. Robert Numi identifies spatial images Ki 

productions of White Bithg Dog whch emphasize ihhahy, the tension between inside and 

outside. This is rnoa often represented visuaily by the sidewalk: "The sidewaik is the place of the 

rnost dreadfX pain, of loss and of the shattering of the seif" (13). In the Tamgon production in 

1984, as Nunn points out, the sidewaik was in the rniddle of the audience, connecting the fictional 

and real worlds (14). In addition to these spatial images, in W?~ite Bithg Dog the h i d i f y  of the 

body is evoked. Rather than seeing this representation as reintorcing an Oedipal htasy, 1 will 

discuss this play for the potential that such a "shattering of seif' has for rebirth. 

Liminal Spaces: The Abject 

Kristeva's conception of the abject is a psychological space hught  with danger and ped ,  

always threatening the clean and pmper self The introduction of this psychoa~Iytic concept here 

is in conjmction with a discursive consideration of its reaktion. This space is both loathed and 

necesW. My consideration of the abject is motivated by the potential for subversion which it 

notion, the abject is neither subject nor object. in this way, it is a useful way of conceiving of the 

articulation of an identity which confOunds these disGnctions. The abject is perhaps rnost easily 

defined by what it is not. Aithough the abject, Iüce the object, is opposed to '4," it does not ailow 

'Y to be more autonomous. It is outside of rneaning: 

If the object . . . through its opposition, senles me w i t k  the fk@e texture of a 
desire fOr meankg, . . . what is abject, on the contrary, the jettisoned object, is 



radicdy excluded and draws me toward the place where meaning collapses. 
(Kristeva, Powers of Horror 1 -2) 

Abjection recalls the violence with which a body becomes separated fiom another body in order 

to be (Kristeva, Powers 10). It recalls birth, the division fiom the mother, and afso the advent hto 

language and the accompanying repression of pre-Oedipd drives. The symbolic order imposes a 

singulanty on identity. We c m  only 'W' lïke someone else. The abject is that which we reject in 

order to assert this notion of identity: 

Obviousty, 1 am only like someone else: mmietic logic ofthe advent of the ego, 
objects, and signs. But when 1 seek (myselt), [ose (myself), or experience 
jouissance-then "I" is heterogeneous. Discodort, unease, dizziness stemmhg 
Eom an ambiguity that, through the violence of a revolt against, demarcates a 
space out of which signs and objects arise. m e v a ,  Powers of Horror 10) 

Abjection draws attention to the M t y  of signification. It highlights the precarious nanire of an 

articulation of identity. Associated with plurality and disorder, in White Biling Dog, the abject 

becomes a means of revolt, a perversion of the sipifjing structures which govem the worlds the 

characters inhabit. At these moments of confrontation between boudaries, the abject erupts, 

challenging form, Ianguage and notions of identity. Abjection is not so much a threat to heakh and 

cleanlmess as it is a disniption of order, a disrespectfid fiaunting of the Law. It is manifested in 

food loathing, corporeal waste, and incest. These are the instances which I will consider the abject 

in White Biling Dog. 

In the play, images of ingesting and expelüng food are extrerne and grotesque. Robert 

Nunn suggests that "AU these metaphors of inhaüng, ingesting and expehg carry emotional and 

psychologicd connotations of penetration and destnrction" ("Spatial Metaphor" 15), metaphors 

which at the end of the play are replaced by "metaphors of invasion as salvation" (1 5) .  1 agree 



with Nunn regarding the ambipuity of the metaphon here; ho wever, tbis CO uld a h  indicate a 

stmggle to overcome the binary play of good/evii, insideloutside, etc. niese images are a h  

supported by a metatheatncd, discursive play. 

One of the most sturming moments of the play is Pony's serving of tea to Cape and his 

M e r .  Men they question why she has batter all over her face as she serves them, she relates a 

disturbing story. Troubled by her own participation in Cape's schemes, and her lack of control 

over herse& Pony becomes so hungry she gorges herselfon batter made with Mooarch flour. S ü 1  

unsatisfied, she siices oEchunks of the three k z e n  daschunds, Enca, Gretchen and Haus, crams 

them into her cheeks and nins upstaus: 

PONY. . . . 1 mix in the dogflesh and I put it in my hand I eat and I eat it and 1 
eat it t a 1  almost fàjnt, till it's coming out my tear ducts but I don? care! I 
don't care, eh, 'cause 1 fèeI good, 1 fèel clean . . . . (93) 

But the sight of Cape and Glidden d e s  her vomit the dogs, she says, d e s  the toilet overflow 

until she is left with no other option, but to throw up the dogs into the teacups. Not only does 

Pony say she eats the dead dogs, but she also serves them up to M e r  and son in their tea 

The moment at wbich this abjection occurs is important. Pony is so enmeshed in Cape's 

story, and so overcome with love for him, that 'the old Pony is almost squished" (101). By 

vomiting the daschunds, Pony is trying to assert control over her identiv. As Kristeva describes it, 

this is an ambivalent action, where the spasms that protect oneselfalso abject oneself: 

During that course in which 'l" become, I give birth to myselfamid the violence of 
sobs, of vomit. Mute protest of the symptom, shattering violence of a convulsion 
that, to be sure, is inscribed in a symbolic system, but m whicb, without either 
waflting or king able to become htegrated in order to answer to it, it reacts, it 
abreacts. It abjects. (3) 



This, indeed, is what is happening ro Pony. Unable to become a part of this system, yet also 

trapped within it, she psychicdy revolts. From the violent Ionging, the hunger for something 

perfect, to the equally violent rejection, she is caught at the borders, unable to achieve a coherent 

The border of one's condition as a living king is also evident in the abjection that 

accompanies corporeal fluids and waste: 

. . . refuse and corpses show me what I perxnânentiy thnist aside in order to live. 
These body fluids, this defilement, this shit are what He withstands, bardly and 
with difncuIty, on the part of death. (Kristeva, Powers of Horror 3) 

In White Biting Dog, the female is most consistentîy associated with the 'iinderneathness" ( 19), 

the abject. Pony used to be an ambulance driver; her fàvourite subject was dissection Lomia, 

Cape's mother, '%rts fàrtse no person should" (2 1). '1 feel-" she says, T inside 1 feel like ... 

(honest) like ... sewage" (68). 

If the femde is associated with the abject, it is the W e r  who brings extenial order. Pony 

goes into a trame, to try to Save Glidden, Cape's M e r .  But she regrases to a memory of her 

own M e r ,  and the secinity and order he could bring: 

PONY. . . . I would do anything, anything, to-to to just have him spit, to have 
him spit on his hadq and clean oEmy fàce, have him spit and wipe and I 
could smeli it so strongly and... 

(PONY fuints and CAPE hugs her, izard. She is dreaming that her dad is wiping 
his spit al1 over her face) (77) 

This reunion with her Mer,  just like her giving over of herseif to Cape, demands her suicide, a 

conquering of the abject. The division of identity, Y've never feit two thoughts at once before" 

(78), is too much to bear. In order to ensure the continued existence of Cape, she becornes the 

abjected corpse, a Christ-like sacrifice in order to bring new life: 



Abjection is a reswection that bas gone through death (of the ego). It is an 
alchemy that aansfonns death drive into a start of lifé, of new s i g d b c e  [sic]. 
(Kristeva, Powers of Horror 1 5 )  

This revisionhg of death as Ee, as suicide as rebnth, is tenuous. Redemption is not simple, and 

the end of the play is unclear. Are Lornia and Cape saved by the sacrifices of Glidden and Pony? 

Or are they left to attempt to exist with an ambiguous aching intemal rift, since "deep within t h  

sornething hm cracked' ( 1  OS)? 

The relationship between Cape and Lomia is the focus of White Biting Dog and incest is 

often suggested. Both Lomia and Cape are unable to feel for others. 'Nothmg-gets-in." says Cape 

(56). He kisses Lomia: "We-we-touched tangues," says Lomia (56). Cape responds with 

vio Ience: 

CAPE. (holding her closely, starts in a whisperj I'll tell you one thing I feel. 1 
feel--1 always feel--1 want to take you by the hau (does so) and then and 
then bash and bash and bash and bash and bash your head against the wall 
. . - - (56) 

Cape is threatened by his rnother; the sound of her lovemaking makes hirn gag. He counteracts his 

fear of "sinking Kretrievably into the mother" ( M e v a ,  Powers of Horror 67), by his own 

attempts to devour her. 

The food loathing, references to waste and the corpse, and the incestuous overtones can 

ail be read as resisting, refùsing mechanisms which indicate the vuherability of the symbolic order. 

They highüght the stmggle between the pure and the impure, the outside and the inside, and even 

a struggle against these dichotomies. A reading of the abject in these plays undoes the concept of 

the unified self. What is usually repressed, rejected, or buried, in order for the clean and propet 



se& the pure and simple tnrth to be illuminated, erupts and disturbs the order. A d i r e n t  kmd of 

dynamic is set into play, one which reworks the shüting relations of power. 

In White Biting Dog, several of these moments of abjection are presented provisiody. 

Pony's vomithg of the daschunds is, after all, a story. Whether she is t e h g  the tmth or not is 

subject to question Her final scene, a h ,  is to her Mer ,  in the light of a iilm projector. She is 

bathed in a white iight wfiich signifies both her ghost-like other worldly presence, and the 

mediation of herseif as subject, as the representatiod apparatus is highlighted. Abjection is a 

ditférent kind of signifjhg system, and expiains, in part, why Thompson's play c m  be so 

disnirbing. Order and structure are necessary for articulation, just as chaos and disorder can 

numire creativity. In Sexing the Probyn advocates pushing 

. . . beyond an "outside-inside alternative" to a place where we can think the two 
together: this is to refuse a logic of either "me" or "she" and move to a mode of 
theory that dows us to think dBkrence together, outside of a binary logic, at the 
same t h e  that the material and ontologicd conditions of diBrence are privileged. 
(140) 

It is in this troubled space, in the negotiation of the abject, that another -station of identity is 

suggested. Again, the ambiguous nature of this formation of identity must be acknowledged. 

Although the abject provides a space of revolt, how fiir does signification and identity articulation 

change by such an invocation? 

Let us consider the character of Pony in more detail as a meam of corning to tenns with 

this question. Pony is the character who most completely embodies this state of ambivalence. She 

attempts to assert agency, yet her c'love" fbr Cape sends her mto a space where she does not 

know herseK She fkds th ultimateiy too much to bear and conmiits suicide. And yet this death 



is no t a state of fidky. It is also a space of transition. Glidden is quite sick, and when his son 

expresses concern, Glidden quotes Auntie Grace: 

GLIDDEN. . . . When Gracey was dying and I wouldn't eat wouidn't sleep 
wouldn't move from under her bed, just lay there breathing dust she said to 
me "Glid," she said, '2ook at the kettle, and think of me. I'rn WATER 
now, 1 will be STEAM." That helped. ( s q s  it fasfer, Iike a kid's rhyme) 
Look at the kettle and think of me, I'rn water now, 1 WU be steam. h 
water now, 1 will be s e a .  That's aii it is. (6) 

This image recurs briefiy m Lion in the Streets in a £kagrnent of a dinner conversation: 

GEORGE. St. Paul said, "We are as vapour," what is it? Like %apour 
vanisheth" or-something. "We are no more." So 1 got up this notion of 
Martians-bemg these-wisps of vapour ... . (1 9) 

The Hnage of death as vapour or stem is one of dispersion, of a diierent state of king. Lion in 

the Streets explores tbis more fuUy in the character of the dead Isobei, whose journey of identity 

focuses the play. In White Biting Dog, Pony descnis this state to her fàther as an oddly hopeful 

space: 

PONY. . . . it's not at ail a bad thing. It's quite nice ifyou just give in to it. 
You know the feeling when you're falling asleep and ya jump awake 'cause 
you dreamt you slipped on a stair? Weil it's Like ifyou stayed in the slip -- 
ifyou dove right down into it and held your breath ta you came out the 
other end. I'rn in the holding your breath part right now, so I'rn not sure 
what's on the other end, but 1 feel like I'm so big I'd barely fit into Kirk 
Community Centre.. . . (106) 

At the end of the play, Lomia and Cape are &O on the verge of an ambiguous renewal: 

(LOMIA Iooks at CAPE. They both feel, hope that a change is takingplace; deep 
within them something has cracked. M q b e  the only feeling they me experiencing 
is guiZt, but that is something) 
CAPE. Do you think it will make ... any .. . ciifference? 
(LOMIA Iooh up. Her hope shows in her eyes. CAPE just dues not how. )  (108) 



George Toies descriis this scene as though "[tlhey have reached a juncture where it is possible 

for them to relinquish their posture of mastery" (121). Although Toles analyzes this space in 

terms of a journey of "soul-making" (120), it is also possible to consider the ending as a 

relinquishing of mastery as in postmodernism. Cape's last line is, of course, ambiguous, but there 

is still the possibility of change. Despite the extreme and horrible circumstances in the plays of 

Judith Thompson, there are suggestions of other possible ways of being. 

E h b e t h  Gross sees abjection as  "the underside of the symbolic" (89). Gross elaborates 

on the "border" which the abject negotiates; it is both and neither: 

The abject is decidably inside and outside the body (like the skin of milk), dead and 
alive (like the corpse), autonomous and enguffig (like Xection and pollution). It 
is what disturbs identity, system and order, disrupting the social boundaries 
demanded by the symbolic. It represents no definite positions, or rules, boundaries, 
or socially imposed limits. (90) 

Thompson's comments on her plays consistently refer to the '*abyss" which her characters 

confkont, the same term E b b &  Gross uses to describe the abject: "the unspoken of a stable 

speaking position, an abyss at the very borders of the subject's identity, a hole into which the 

subject may W' (87). It is this state which the subject must negotiate in order to speak. 

Thompson speaks of her playwriting process in very similar terms. She relates her gift of 

playwriting to fear, a fear comparable to the feeling she has during epileptic seizures md that fear 

induced by her phobia of snakes: 

Every once in a while . . . I feel I am f k b g  again down the tembIe hole, with 
nothing to hold on to. And I believe this fdling, this "identity panic," is a result of 
my using the very essence of myselfto create character in dramatic work. 
(Tpilepsy & the Snake" 6) 
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Thompson's remarks regardhg this fear, this induction of "identity panic" cm be related to simüar 

fears her chamers undergo or confkont. In the negotiation of merent positions as subjects 

within particuiar cultural and historicd matrixes, a crisis in identity in White Biiing Dog is played 

out in the confüct on the body. Images of bodily fluids and functions depict a body which, Mce 

identity, is unstable. Psychoadytic readings like this can &O be compatible with a postmodern 

f e d m ;  the abject certady contributes to the destabilization of the coherence of the rational 

self. In the end, there are indications of new possible ways of being in the constant sheddmg of 

discursive skins as identity is rerna.de into ever new manifestations. 

Tornado 

Urjo Kareda in~oduced the radio version of Tornudo when it was aired on CBC Radio as 

an "explosive exafnination of fertility."" The women in Tornudo are tyrannized by either their 

desire to have children or their need to keep their men. Mandy and Jane, in particular, continually 

abase themselves and abuse each other in their cornpetition to succeed. Rose overtly States her 

desùe to have as many children as possible. By showing these extreme situations and by 

serialinng these positions, Thompson presents a destabilized identity. In adâition, the invocation 

of the constitutive outside recurs in the characterization of Rose and Mandy and contriibutes to 

this destabilization. In this way, mastery in the relations of power is critiqued. 

" In the introduction to Tornado as broadcast for The Second Generation 1990. In th& 
section 1 refer to both the radio version and its script included in The Other Side of the Dark. 
Recentiy a stage version of Tornado was published in Canadian Theatre Review 89 (Summer 
1996). As this version is substantially different to the radio version, 1 wiil only make a few 
references in passing. 



Rose and Mandy 

Mandy is a middle-class governrnent worker who has internalized liberal humanist 

discourses; at the beginning of the play she declares she is U n ~ l  a slave of biology" (8 1). But this 

public prochation is displaced by its exact opposite when her husband wants to separate 

because he is having an afW with sorneone who can give h i .  something Mandy cannot: cbiidren. 

This changes what we know of Mandy. She does an about fàce: 

MANDY. Why . .. why didn't you . . . teil me, Bill 
BILL. WeiI, because you're always ... t e b g  everybody how you hate children, 

how that's the last thing you- 
MANDY. 1 WAS LYING! I WAS LYMG, BILL, DON'T YOU SEE? 
BEL. Lying? Why? 
MANDY. FOR YOU! For YOU because 1 thought YOU DIDN'T WANT 
BILL. Why ... why did you think that? 
MANDY. You never said! I wanted to let you off the hook. It's the way 1 was 

brought up; if a man doesn't mention something .. . 1 ... I wanted to please 
yoq Bill, I didn't want to pressure you ... 1 ... want ... a chi& more tban 
wthiw* (86) 

On the one hami, Mandy is depicted as utteriy dependent on her relationship with her husband in 

her determination of choices. On the other hand, the discourses which constnict and aBord 

choices are always emphasized. Both of these positions seem to be manifestations of a 

Rose, one of Mandy's clients, is also characterized in an extrerne way: she simply wants to 

have lots and lots of children; she repeats the same position as subject over and over again. She is 

poor, an epileptic, and was abused by her m e r  when she was a child. She is now on welfare, 

pregmt, and raishg four children by herself, but she wants to have more: 

ROSE. . . . So 1 want to have as many children as I c m  have so 1 can love 
them the good way, the way my mummy started Io* me before. So 1 got 
these kids, these four kids, 1 love them more than my life more than your 



lifè and this fifth one coming in five months.. See, this is one thing 1 can 
do, I can do it some girls can't but 1 can 1 can love them and 1 know how 
fiornrnymum.. . . (88) 

The role Rose has folmd for herselfwithin the patriarchy is taken to an extreme: and here in this 

almost parodic description of motherhood, she k d s  limited agency. She is representative of the 

ideal motherL2 whom Mandy tries to and starts to becorne, even literally. 

Mandy fin& limited agency within the discourses which constnict her. When Mandy fwis 

out she cannot conceive and plots to aeal Rose's baby, she uses her power as a Social Worker to 

make Rose believe in her plot. In order to get what she wants, Mandy tum Rose's love back on 

to itself. She quotes studies which have proved that the fouah or nfth child of a wornan who has 

epilepsy is susceptible to sudden infànt death syndrome. Mandy uses a scientific discourse to 

achieve her goals: 

MANDY. Iym afiaid that these studies are so conclusive that the M M e r  of 
Health has ordered us to go into the community and ... inforni women such 
as yourself of the situation and help them ... to find a suitable place for the 
baby ... M e r  aii you wouldn't want ... the baby to die. (1 02) 

The foregrounding of this discourse and the accompanying po wer that Mandy is able to wield 

over Rose contributes to a destabilization in the coherence of self Rose yields to the power of the 

ideological state apparatus (Althusser 143-45), that which functions to contain and perpetuate 

ideology without force, but through systems and institutions. The power that Mandy holds is 

substantial; it is, however, clo sely linked to the scientinc discourse she emplo ys. 

The instability of identity becomes more obvious as the play progresses. The power which 

Mandy yields is temporary. The police, a repressive state apparatus (Althusser 143-45), ensuring 

12 Patricia Phillips' performance of this role on radio is haunting. Her voice and incantation 
of this speech are soft and lyrical. Above a i i  the performance gives the impression of sincerity. 



the perpetuation of ideology through force, arrive to take back the kidnapped baby. Mandy nins 

away, takes the child with ber, and seeks refbge on a clin. Threatened by a different discourse and 

assertion of a dinerent tnith, Mandy's identity is unfked. As the police pursue, Mandy gradudy 

begins to become Rose; she takes on her experience. She imagines she has given birth and she 

experiences the "tornado" effect of Rose's epilepsy: 

MANDY. Nine rnonths! Nine months 1 carried this child in my belly, I threw 
up every day for the f k t  five and then 1 couldn't sleep for the last four 
months? And 1 kept fkinting. AU to bring your baby, your baby into the 
world, AND NOW YOU'RE TRYING TO TAKE HER AWAY FROM 
ME JUST BECAUSE I'M EPILEPTIC, WELL, 1 CAN'T HECP IT! 1 
CAN'T HELP IT IF 1 GO TO THE OTHEX SIDE, HOW DARE YOU 
HOW DARE YOU. (1 11) 

Identification with Rose becomes the only way to temporarily attain the subjectivity she desires. 

Mandy's body responds to what her mind imagines. In the stage version of Tornado in the 

Canadian Theatre Review, the Mandy character (named Viola) becomes so like Rose that her 

breasts begin to leak spontaneously (63). In both the radio and the stage versions, she descends 

into an arnbiguous seizure, irnitating Rose's epileptic seizures. This replaying of identity 

deçtabilizes its mity. This repetition of identity is a device which occurs in a later play, Lion in the 

Streets. Identity is not coherent and consistent; it is fluid and found through engagement with 

others. 

The Constitutive Outside: the baby, epilepsy, the tornado, the abyss 

The baby is aiways an important and complex ckter/symbol in Thompson's plays. On 

the one hanci, the baby provides Rose with a sense of who she is: a mother. The baby provides 

access to the outside world; it assures Mandy's identification within the patriarchy. When Mandy 



has the baby, she also retains her hold on her husband. However, the baby is &O the source of 

anguish between BU and Mandy and Jane. The baby is in the realm of the constitutive outside: it 

brings Mandy's identity into being, but t also retums as a constant threat to her identity. This 

echoes a sewuther dynamic of psychoanalysis. The other is both a part of and extemai to the 

"self." It cornes to signify both Î n  the intimate relations between people and withjn the larger 

comunities. The extrerne matemal role which Mandy takes up leads her into a whirlwind space 

of contradiction where binaries are CO Uapsed. 

The space of the baby also brings on chaos: epilepsy and the baby are intimately 

cormecteci. Mandy uses Rose's epilepsy to spirit the baby away fiom her. The epilepsy that Rose 

experiences is tomado-like. When Rose has a seinire, she ioses herseK She cannot care for her 

chiIdren; rather, she is dependent on them to see her tlirough the seinire. In the following quote, 

M e ,  Rose's son, talks his mother through the ~ o d o : "  

JAKE. . . . you're turnhg upside d o m  and around a million million times and 
as fast as inside a dryer and fiilling and m e r  and M e r  and ice picks and 
scissors and snakes and every sick sound Like throwin up and cnishin eggs 
and rnean iaughin and everybody's laughin and you're fallin, 1 know, falllli 
fiillin so tast so fast and you're at the bonom you're at the boaom now 
covered with mud and ifyou don't breathe if you don't breathe the Light 
will be covered with mud, black, covered with mud if you don't breathe 
you'U be dead underground . . . . (96) 

The torrtado in this play is what Judith Thompson c& the abyss. It is a place of "identity panic." 

Jake makes her scream back to Me: 

JAKE. ... just scream, just scream mummy, scream your scream out and you'll fly 
to the top burst through the air let the scream take ya let it camy ya up bang! 
through to the air. (96) 

At this point, Rose screams a "blood-nndling screum" (96). An ambiguous space of neithedwr, 

where distinctions between the outer and inner worlds collapse, the abyss is too frightening a 
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realm to remah ia It  is a contradictory space of transition, a space which can also be considered 

as an image of a postmodem configuration of king, where these binaries are combined in an 

uneasy tension. 

In imitation of Rose, Mandy also descends into this space, and it is on this note that the 

radio version of the play ends. When Mandy steals the baby and hides on the cüff, she takes on 

Rose's epilepsy as weii. Having stolen Rose's baby, but now found out and r&g fkom the 

police, she too descends into the tornado. When she slips to the other side, Jake tries to taik her 

back, repeating the words he used to bring Rose back This state of king is fiightening: it is a 

place, Iüce the space of the c rackde r ,  of suspension, where slippage in either direction is 

possible. Again Jake attempts to bring back Mandy to the place of Iight and order; he assures her 

that her actions are not in vain, that her e ~ o r d i n a r y  behaviour is meanin@: 

JAKE. . . . you got taken by something that was bigger than yourseifand that 
fit that takes can make for bad in the world sometimes but also for the- 
bestest, most greatest human-beau-acts .. . they know . .. that you ... are a 
great human act. (1 13) 

He's "like a saint" (1 1 3). He rejects Mandy's current husband and assures her of stabdity within a 

"new family": 

JAKE. Him? He can't even grow a beard! Looks like weeds! NO. Mandy, 
we're your husband now, our M y .  (1 14) 

But resurrection in this way is not entirely comforting, as Mandy descends into a fit. Although 

Jake calls to Mandy as he does to Rose, tbere is stül an ambiguous ending. There is no final 

scream which signifies her resurgence to air. l3  The stage version of the play also ends on an 

ambiguous note. Viola (Mandy) "sits up, holding on tu t h ,  rigidly," but there is no salutary 

l3 In the script there is no indication of a scream; on the radio tape, there is only silence. 
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scream (64). As Ki many of Thompson's phys, there is the promise of forgiveness and dvation, 

overlaid in a Roman Catholic iconography, and yet the gesture at the end is uncertain', there is a 

potential to be r e a k d ,  but it is a potential &ch is ody completed hqhatively. 

1 am Yours 

Again, in 1 am Yours, the roles which the fende charafters take up appear to be 

essentiahd and bblogically detemiined. Birth plays a prhary role. Dee, after a one night stand 

with Toi, finds herselfambivalently pregnam. Unwilhg at first to keep the child, she is also 

unwilling to let Toi have custody. She enlists the help of her sister Mercy to lie in court in order to 

prevent Toi's victory. Dee reunites with Mack, her estranged husband, but intends to Ieave hUn 

when the baby is bom Mercy, in turn, has very low self-esteem. Recently separated, she flirts 

with Mack. Pegs conspires with Toi; they steal Dee's baby when she unexpectedly gives birth 

during their visit. In this shon description of the play, it is apparent that the roles that wornen play 

are limited. Women want to bear children. Women want to be acknowledged by the M e r .  

Women manipulate, connive, betray, steal. Women are not to be tnisted. And yet there is a 

straoge power, resonance and daring to thiç play. Again the topography of this play can be read 

not as a demonstration of the essentialized roles of women, but as a display of the lack of 

coherence to identity. Pegs, Dee and Mercy take agency fiom particulat standpoints, but they are 

fhstrated in their attempts to achieve meanin@ action This -ration is tied to the dynamic 

which the title of the play indicates: an imbrication of sewother. I am Yours is the title of the 

medieval Germa. poem which is inscribecl in the locket which Dee received from her fàther: 



RAYMOND. Du bist mein 
Ich bin de i .  
Des soikt du gewiss sein 
Du bist verschlossen 
In meinem Herzen 
Ver Io ren ist das Schlusselein 
Du musst irnmer diuinen sein 
[no W. with understanding of the signijicance of the poem] 
... You are locked in my heart 
the key is lost 
You will always have to stay inside t .  .. . 
For always. (157) 

Robert Nunn points out the the broken promise that the title, the poem, and the locket sig*: 

The locket inscn i  '9ch bin dein"--the title of the play-ironically holds out the 
offer of eternd love, of the desiring subject finding its lost complement in the 
other, but in k t ,  for the two &ers who possess identical lockets, Dee's fiom her 
Daddy, Mercy's (maybe only in dreams) nom Raymond, the locket signifies loss. 
The promise is always already broken, the desired object is always already a 
sigmfier of that which is absent. ("Spatial Metaphor" 20) 

Nunn goes on to argue for the loss of the mother which is central to the play, and makes a 

convincing argument for the ending in which the gaze of the mother is proved to be either severed 

or ülusory. It is important to consider, however, that the locket and the ?ch bin dein" inscriptions 

corne fiom the fither. The relationship of Y am yours" refers to the imbrication of sewother, and 

mother-daughter, but it also refers to the relationship of fàther-daughter, and by extension, 

patriarchal society-woman. The loss here is abandonment on several levels, not only the loss of 

the mother. George Toles points out the corollary of the me: 

. . - it has been the burden of the action to show us how these fam%ar words of 
self-surrender generally mean just the opposite, conceaüng a hard unyielding c h  
that 'you are mine." (1 27) 

It is &O possible to consider the loss which the "ich bin dein" interchange constantly recalls as the 

insufnciency of a mode1 of the subject which is baseci on a binary opposition, and a dependence on 
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an other to c o b  its identity. The locket is both real and imaghary; the relationship between 

selfand other is aiso both red and imagiuary. Yet the dynamic of the locket is always doomed to 

Mure, possibly because of the psychoanalytic loss which is central tu aii formafons of the self, 

but possibly also due to the very limitations in the conception of a subject which is based on a 

hierarchicd rnodeî, in which interactions with the other demand a domination and subordhation. 

Subjects are formed in these exclusionary ternis. Such positions prove to be limiting and unstable. 

An identity with possibiüties for acting outside a dynamic of dominaace and subordination can be 

read in images of the body. When, particularly m the case of Mercy, a new co~guration of the 

sewother dyoamic is oEered, the potential for radical change is possible. In this section, 1 wiU 

consider the ways in which the subjedidentity mode1 is demoostrated in the characters of Pegs, 

Dee and Mercy. 

The mother: Pegs 

Like the other characters, Pegs searches for confirmation of '4" withm the other. She is 

constantly stnvhg to be recognized, but this acknowledgement is not forthcoming. She t e k  the 

taxi driver of her descent fiom being important where everythmg is "Mum this, Mum that" (1 5 1) 

to a state of uncertain recognition SigniscantIy, the story which Pegs t e k  as Dee goes into 

labour is another story of a lack of recognition. A firiend does not recognize her at a high school 

reunion because she has put on weight: "Weil 1 musta tumed k e e  shades a rd,"  says Pegs. "1 

codd hardly speak but 1 did, lüce a fool, I turned to her and 1 said, 'But Marjorie, here 1 am, I'm 

Peggy! Didn't you see me?"' (1 69). As these examples illustrate, this stmggle to take up a 

position as subject, an '7" where the recognition of the  ou" is painful Uusory, and incomplete. 



The instability of these positions of subject is amplinecl when other images of Pegs' 

identity are considered. Language is an important means of assertmg power and ascertainmg 

status. On the one hand, it provides her a means of asserting control Here she relates the story of 

her reaction tu an employer's criticism of her grammar in order to inspire Toi to action: 

PEGS. . . . Weil I turn around to her and says "You think I don't know the 
correct grammar? 1 kww 3's 'don't have any' but 1 say 'don't got none.' 1 
CHOOSE 'don't got none.' 1 CHOOSE my granmiar, cause I'd rather be 
dead; I'd rather be dead than anything like you." THEY HAVE US 
BELIEVIN WE CAN'T TALK, WE CAN'T DRESS, AND NOW THEY 
HAVE YOU BELrFVfhT YOU DON'T HAVE A RIGHT TO YOUR 
CHILD! . . . (160) 

Although Pegs asserts power in choosing her grammar, she also denies the fimctional use of 

language. She h d s  power in the sheer volume of her talk. She has what her son caik %e talk 

trots" (13 1). She uses language as a defense: she t e k  her long story about the highschool reunion 

as Dee is in the throes of labour. Through the juxtaposition of Peg 's endless chatter and Dee's 

labour, a bodylmind split is demomtrated on stage. Through an onshught of language, Dee is 

rendered helpless. Denied the baby tbrough the justice system, Pegs cm use another meam of 

discourse to get what she wants. She can make the symbolic order work for her; she uses 

language untii it is devoid of its meaning and becomes an action. For Pegs, language is not "a 

-parent medium of expression" (Flax, Thinking Fragments 3 1), but must be used a s  a means 

to an end. In the excess of Pegs' talc, there is a refusal of binaries and of an unequivocal 

comection between thought and Ianguage: 

PEGS. . . . I happen to need to tak to talc and talk and talk and talk and don't 
need nobody say nothing because I am taIkllig and 1 am go- ta& and taik 
till our feet fieeze off and our hands get fiost bite cause when 1 am talklli 1 
am swimmin in a big vat of English cream--meam-and talk and 1 want to 
swim and crearn and talk and talk tili we all fàll over and k z e .  (13 1) 



Words are used not for their meaning' but as stratepic toois; they even take on a sensualit-. Taik 

is pleasurable; it is, d e r  ail, like ''Swimmin in a big vat of English creaa" This use of language as 

a means of resistance is Iimited, however. Pegs' excessive use of language can oniy work to "am 

the machinery," to paraphrase Irigaray (102). Although Pegs renders Dee powerless and steak her 

baby, the choices she d e s  are again in the cycle of domination and subordination; at the end of 

the play, she lies slumped in the chair, uncooscious or possibly dead (1 76). 

Dee: at the cusp 

Dee owns the original locket. She is the weQloved daughter, the desired woman. She 

most often invokes the dyoamic of "1 am y o u d  you are mine." Her actions are at the expense of 

others. Everyone is disposable. She dominates, uses and dismisses becaw she can. Although she 

inhabits these positions as subject, identity is also profoundly destabilized in the images that are 

associated with the birth of her chiid. 

Dee's interactions with others demonstrate shifting relations of power. The pain of this 

dynamic is best demonstrated in her interactions with Mack, her estranged husband. He cornes 

back to her, seeking to understand why the rnarriage feIl apart. He is unable to beiieve that Dee 

doesn't love h i .  anymore. Dee tells him to leave. He tosses the key back to her and makes to 

leave, when suddenly Dee begs him to r e m .  She throws herself at his feet. They seem to be at 

the point of a tender reconciliation, when the power shats and equilium is upset: 

DEE miles. They are facing each other. Affer quite a silence they go to kiss 
very tender&, buut just as their Zips meef, DEE speaks] 

DEE. Youuuuu sucker, you believe me? 1 HATE yo y 1 stiU hate you, I just 
was scared to be alone, don? you get it, I'm using you I'M USING YOU, 
YOU W. [she slorts to hit him across the face] You suck, you suck, 



you suck, you suck, get out, get out, get out. [she pushes him physcali)] 
Get out! Go!! 

MACK. I'm warning you. 
DEE. 1 said get out of my Hie, and I mean it, don't believe the mewiing 

pisshead, in the hall, believe me, 1 hate you, 1 hate you, 1 hate you!!! 
FIACK leaves] No, stay! Please stay, please stay! Go! Get out, get out! 

MAAAAACKTEEEEE MACKKKKKIEEEEE MAAACKIEE. 
[As DEE wails ' W C K I E  ' we hear o siren, louder and louder. She 

collapses ont0 the @or] 
MAACKKKKIE what's happening to me? MAAACKIE MAACKlE 

MACKE. (127) 

Not ody is Mack confused as to what to do, so is the audience. As Sharren Friedman descri'bes, 

this scene in performance provoked e d c  laughter. Only the siren at the end forced the audience 

into silence (145). The ambivalence in the interaction causes discodort in the audience. As Dee 

herselfdeclares at the end of the scene, she does not h o w  what is happening to her. She is found 

on the cusp of the eitherfor bkary of dominatiodsubo rdination. In this way, the mastery involveci 

in the shifting dynamics of power is critiquecl. 

Dee's ambivalence and her unfixed identity are signifieci by her relationship to her unborn 

child. Again the work of Julia Kristeva is usefiil to illuminate the conflict in identity in the 

pregnant woman: 

Ceils fuse, spiit, and proliferate; volumes grow, tissues stretch, and body fluids 
change rhythm, speeding up or slowing d o m  W i  the body, growing as a graft, 
indomitable, there is an other. And no one is present, within that simdtaneously 
dual and d e n  space, to sigr@ wbat is going on. "It happens, but I'm not there." 
"1 cannot reaiize it, but it goes on." Motherhood's impossible syilogism. 
C6Motherhood" 237) 

It is significant that this unrealizable space is also signined by Dee's drawing: her attempt to 

represent the meaningless. The baby in I am Yours is not just c6Like" a picture, as of the d o r i n a  

and child in 7?ze Crackwalkr; it is drawn by Dee, ftom t s  foetus stage ahnost till bnth. It is 

altemately h o m g  and beautiful. The baby is Dee's h e r  beast, the animd, ironically the 



"constitutive outside" which she must grapple with in order to exist. She first communkates wÏth 

it when she is in the hospital, and akhough she is ambivalent about it, her ability to recognke it is 

what prevents her fiom having the abortion: 

DEE. 1s that you? Are you ... speaking ... to me? 1 cm hear you breathing, 
speaking. STOP, PLEASE! STOP you STOP. STOP taiking to me - 
you're breathuig, in my ears, stop. Please, no! I DON'T want to KNOW 
yoy NO, PLEASE, 1 WANT TO GET RID OF YOU 1 - don't. Don't. 
DON'T make those ... [she sees something that touches her-such LU a 
baby 's mi le ,  a small hand, etc.] don't- w, no no no OKAY! OKAY 
OKAY OKAY YOU ARE! You are! You are!! YOU ARE!!! (142) 

It is Dee's grappling with the birth of this chüd which fiees her. Although she recognizes this baby 

(or new state of king) and deiivers t, t is taken away fiom her. She must give it up into a 

sociem a language, a cultural realm in which it is formed and birthed again, several times. 

In a monologue near the end of the play, Dee cornes out on a ramp k i n g  the audience. A 

bright Light blinds the audience. Dee is in the nursery, lookmg for her baby. The stage directions 

give some insight into the joumey she has accomplished: 

[ . . . She feels purif ed--through birth--and also through understanding her self- 
hatred, her guilt about her nother--she is now able to love Mer huving grappled 
with her "shadow " or "animal. " She is infiLsed with this love. . . . ] (1 76) 

There is always an uncertain, ambiguous, tangentid end to the plays of Judith Thompson. Just as 

language is not "arent," so the metaphors cannot be read easily. After this scene, there is a 

cross-Me to Tome,  in a hotel room with Pegs arnbiguously slumped, dead or unconscious. 

Toilane holds the baby, and calls out, bewildered: Wlum??" (1 76). Nunn links these moments 

together: 

We see a montage of the severed bond between Toilane and Pegs and the 
imaginary bond between Dee and the baby (who is not there). The fàct that Dee's 



greeting is directed to every single person sitting in the theatre includes the whole 
audience in a Wectic of desire and absence. (1 8- 19) 

It is not only the montage of severed bonds which incorporates the audience here, but t is also the 

opacity of this image which achieves this effect. In these images, there is a figural viscerd quality 

in which logical, binary order is broken d o m  The play ends on a note of uncertainty. The baby, 

like Pegs, like Toilane, Like Mercy, Like Dee, is many things to different people. Identity as 

realized through the interaction of Dee and her baby is an ambivalent, incoqlete process, where 

Mercy: the unaccommodated identity 

Mercy experiences some of the same rejections and categorizations as the others. She is 

also on the search for the ülusory satisfâction that the ''1 am yours" dynamic irnplies. Ho wever, 

Mercy most actively moves beyond the binary terms of this equation. She most radically attempts 

to confound the boundaries, like Theresa in The Crackwalker, Pony in White Biting Dog and 

Mandy in Tomado. 

Like Pegs, Mercy is constantly on a search to be recognized. She looks for a solution for 

her state-of-identity malaise. She wants to take up other people's lives. She mes to steal her 

sister's husband. She wishes she wodd get a brain tumour so that people would be kind to her 

(1 50). Unlike Dee, she does not conform to the ideal standard of '%ornad' and has always lived in 

the shadow of her sister: ''If you're--a woman and you're--barn ugly you might as weU be born 

dead" (1 45). She has internaüzed the way in which she has k e n  perceived. Cruel classmates 

cded her '%horedog;" when she is rejected by Mack, Dee's husband, she calls herself a %lut." 



However, she still tries and wants to become "loved," the "centre9' of someone's Hie. Mercy is at 

the crossroads of discourses. She is subjected to two diffierent discourses here, or perhaps two 

fàcets of the one and the same categorization: woman as disposable and womui as beautifid 

desired O bject . 

Mercy experiences some of the same rejection that Pegs does: she is unable to achieve 

satisfàctory recognition and reflection of herself. Her relationship with Raymond, an ambiguous 

lover fiom her past, alternately afEords and denies her this recognition. Raymond was an older 

man who picked her up hitchhiking. Mercy says, '2ike none of the other guys at schoo 1 would 

even look at me, but this guy, RAYMOND, he SEES, see? He sees what 1 always knew . . ." 
(133). But Mercy is ambivalent about her relationship with Raymond. This conflict is reaüzed 

theatrically in a dream sequence. Mercy is on a bus, and she dreams that the man beside her is 

Raymond. The stage directions indicate Mercy's simultaneous enjoyment and denial of his 

attention: 

[RAYMOND is bringing a rafher guiI~fifreen-yeur-oId MERCY to orgasm by 
manipulating her vagina. She has an o r g m ,  and then immediately pretends thut 
nothing at al1 has happenedl (1 20-2 1) 

In this scene Raymond &es her a locket with the inscription '?ch bin dein," the locket which her 

sister Dee received fiom her fàther. When Raymond asks her to skip school to vend t h e  with 

him (he has, after all, brought prophylactics), she screams at him: 

PROPHYLACTICS ! NO! No, no, no! ! You're diçgusting! You're a disgusting old 
man and you rnake me feel üke a greasy slut and I hate you for it, 1 haaaaate you, 1 
hate yoy I hate you, 1 ... (122) 

At this point, Raymond tums back into the Itaiian man who is sitting b i d e  Mercy on the bus. 

The transformation of Raymond into someone eke illustrates Mercy's conflicting desires in her 



situating of him: she both wants and refuses his attention. The way she has constructed him also 

deteminies who he is physicaily. 

Mercy's rehtionship with her sister involves a similar dynamic of rejection and 

recognition. When Mercy arrives at her sister's place, Dee does not recognize her: T m  sorry-- 

were you at han's the other night, or" (1 37). Mercy is understandably upset: T M  YOUR O WN 

SISTER WKY DIDN'T YOU RECOGNIZE YOUR OWN SISTER? (139). Mercy att- 

Dee's recognition when she assists Dee by lying in her defence. Dee convinces her to lie on the 

witness stand in order to prevent Toi and Pegs fiom winning custody of the unbom child. In 

r e m  Mercy demands her love: 

MERCY. Say '? LOVE YOU MERCY9--say it. 
DEE. @use] 1 love you Mercy. 
MERCY. More than anything on this earth? 
VEE puts locket around MERCY'S neck] (1 60) 

But "I" confïrtned as "Yours" is s h o w  to be untenable. Although Mercy wants to be the "centre" 

of someone's üfe, to speak fiom a space of coherence, this is not to be. 

The iUusory nature of rhis wholeness is found in Mercy's passionate defence of television 

niis monologue illustrates Mercy's conflictual state: 

MERCY. Don't put down television. DON'T YOU FUCKING 
PUT DOWN TELEVISION, YOU SNOT, TELEVISION FIAS 
SAVED MY L I E .  IT HAS L I T E W L Y  SAVED MY LIFE, 
WHEN YOU'RE SO LONELY YOU COULD DIE. 1 MEAN 
SHRlVEL UP AND DIE BECAUSE NOBODY CARES 
WHETHER YOU GET UP OR STAY IN BED OR DON'T EAT, 
WHEN YOU'RE SO LONELY EVERY PORE IN Yom SKIN 
IS SCREAMTNG TO BE TOUCHED, THE TELEVISION IS A 
SAVIOUR. IT IS A VOICE A WARM VOICE. THERE ARE 
FUNNY TALK SHOWS WITT3 HOSTS WHO THINK 
EXACTLY LIKE 1 DO. (145-46) 



Mercy's accomrno&tion as a subject to an Althusserian interpellation is evident in this example. 

As a subject, she is a "subjected king," formed and satisned by discourses which constnxct 

models of behaviour, but with little abiüty to act outside that discursive construction. Characters 

are willing to debase themselves to extraordinary measures for rnomentary sec* and 

confirmation of identity. 

A dserent kind of identity is reafized, however, in sume of Mercy's actions. More than 

any other character, Mercy moves beyond binaries. Signiscantly, she both testines for and then 

betrays her sister. She Lies on the witness stand in order to help Dee win her court case and win 

custody of her child; she then stands by while Toi and his mother steal the child fiom Dee, 

immediately after bixth. The scew is a theatrical coup. Toi and Pegs arrive to talk to Dee; Pegs 

wants Dee at least to admit that her son did not lie. As Dee goes into labour, Toi and Pegs refuse 

to leave. Mercy does not move to heb her sister: 

TOILANE. I WANT MY CHILD. I'M GONNA HAVE MY CHUID. 
DEE. You can't do this, this is sick, this is .... 
PEGS. My son wants his child and he got a right and you know he does. Now 

nobody's gonna hurt you. We're just go= take what is rightfiilly ours. 
DEE. Just for Christ's sake, can't you just leave. MERCEEEEE!! 
W R C Y  standr up. Stands on her tippytoes. L@s her han& high in the air. Eyes 
wide, turns around and walks out]. (1 70) 

Mercy h d s  herselfat the untenable intersection of different possible ways of being. Her solution 

is to remove herself In this example, Mercy reverts to a childlike display; she pretends to 

disappear. The consequences of this action propel her into another mstabIe temtory: she is both 

"sorry" and 'hot sorry" at the same t h e .  She takes this action, however, because she wants to act 

morally, and reverse, perhaps, the injustice she herselfperpetrated by lying on the witness stand. 

But by doing what she thinks is right, she is betraying her sister; she is caught in a logical bind. 



Either act has repercussions. There is simply no right, and no wrong. Mercy's resulting confusion 

leaves her in a transitional space: 

MERCY. But 1 betrayed her, 1 betrayed my own sister. I thought, you know, 1 
thought it was the ri& thing. I wanted to do the right thing for once in my 
Me. I'rn sorry you know but I'm not at the sarne tirne. Do you know what 1 
mean? 1 mean I'rn sorry but I'rn not sony I'rn not I'rn sorry I'rn not I'rn 
sorry I'rn not I'rn not I'rn sorry. (1 73) 

The limitations of language are exposed. In this example, as in moa of Thompson's plays, the 

choices that the characters d e  are difncult ones. Mercy's contrition is not pure. Singulanty of 

identity is questioned. Neither morality nor boundaries are clearly defined. 

Mercy has a cornplicated relationship with the paniarchy: she desperately desires to be like 

Dee, to be her father's Ewourite. The ccich-bin-dein" dynamic has ken denied her; she has never 

k e n  assured of the Mer's love, and is angry: 

MERCY. . . . you you FCTCKER DADDY. I HEARD you, 1 SAW you giving 
her that locket Yor my favomite daughter, Deirdre9'--th& heart with the 
ICH BiN DEIN engraved. What does that m e q  anyway? eh? What the 
heil does that mean? (1 33) 

In a world of language where discourses necessariiy eenta exclusion, identity is dways 

unsatisfktory- In the case of Mercy, she faied to anain that special recognition by her EIther, and 

has k e n  searching for it in relationships ever since. She seems to be even outside the code, the 

key that would give her access to that special meaning: cc What the heu does that mean?" (1 3 3) she 

says about the Gemian inscription. Her most powerfùl move is in the refusal of the terrns of 

engagement of subjectivity. 



Ambiguous Identities 

We have seen how charactes are subjects of and to discourses. The conflicnial nature of 

the discourses renders the subjects themselves unstable. In this section, we have seen how the 

articuIatioo of the self is &O paradoxically dependent on, yet constantly rejected by the other. An 

ided relationship where '7'' and ‘Yeu" f o m  a symbiotic whole is desired, but always proves 

impossible. The result in Thornpson's plays is an emphasis on this state of king between. Perhaps 

it is in embracing that very territory that the only kind of iiberation can corne. 

Again the baby is the centrai unarticulated identity in this play. Nunn holds that the baby- 

mother model is also a model for the audience's dialectic of desire and absence ("Spatial 

Metaphor" 1 8- 19). Towards the end of his article, he descriis the way in which the ramp is used 

in the play: 

The ramp is the focal point of the extraordinarily powerful affects that the play 
releases to seep through the wall of repression of which the "psychic distance" of 
the audience is a displacement. . . . the audience is addressed in ways which fkther 
accomplish the breaching of the walL We are the door which dams in Toi's face, 
and twice we are the Uifiuit whose voice and gaze seem to erase all absence and 
restore ail that bas ken los. (26-27) 

I agree with N m 7 s  assessrnent of the implication of the audience; however, I see this implication 

as a Merent kind of audience-stage interaction, one which neither confimis nor unsettles the 

psyche but rather attempts to articulate a different model of identity, which is both played out on 

stage and offkred as a model for audience engagement. Over and over in Thornpson's plays, 

women are the central figures, struggling within paîriarchal cotlstraints. As Thompson says, most 

of her femaie characters have been "successfuyr brainwashed by the patriarchal society m which 

they live" or they are "in a fight to the death with themselves because of if' ("One TweIfth" 264). 



J e d e r  Harvie considers the possibiüties of the mise en scene of 1 am Y o m  as  a kind of 

dreamscape, with ambiguous v i e h g  psibibies: 

Like fàntasy, the play Straddles the border between the conscious and the 
unconscious, acknowledging the import of both. Also üke fàntasy' this 
composition allows the play's audiences a range of engagements with the play, so 
that they must choose whether to engage with a theme of love, or of love's 
prohibition. ("(Lm)Possiaility" 248) 

ln I am Ycurs, as is r e a k d  more fùliy in Lion in the Streets, there are these moments of h tasy  

or escape. A scene in which Raymond appears to Mercy, for example, is referred to ambiguously: 

"This couid be a dream," suggest the stage directions (1 71). It is this imaginative holding 

together of possible worlds which becomes an important part of Thompson's dramaturgy* Here 

there is the simdtaneous entertaining of several possibiiities which characterizes a postmodem 

feminism. Althou* Thompson uses strategies of reaiism, she aîso interrogates these very same 

strategies, by involving a dream sequence or a fàntastical moment. These moments are not 

qualined or explained by the narrative; they have equd substance and authonty as the other scenes 

in the play. In this way, Thompson is suggesting several possible narratives. 

Lion in the Stree6: the fictive unity of identity in narrative 

What lam Yours suggests in many of its dream-like scenes, Lion Ni the Streets reaiizes in 

its overtly non-narrative impulse. Scenes are comected by the characters who pass through thern; 

the play is struct-ured as a kind of "relay" (Knowles, The Achievernent" 34). The way in which 

the play takes shape appears to be accidental; the audience is encouraged to make connections 

only by the character who moves fi-om one scene to the next. Similarly, the formation of identity is 

shown to be contingent. Characters become subjects according to their particular narratives. Thei. 
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identity is dependent on shifting relations of power withm these narratives. The ctiatacters are 

several and are not rnaintained throughout the play. They appear briefly, in a series of emotionally 

charged scenes. Their crises cluster about IsobeI, ofien reflecting or r e s o h g  with Isobel's 

character objective (Harvie, 'Constructing Fictions" 84). Although Iso bel is the only character 

whose progress we may chart throughout the play, and the only character who seems to nistain a 

transformation, she also occupies a liminal territory The identity of Isobel proves to be fluid as 

she crosses boundaries of fictions and challenges borders. 

Subjects in Crisis 

Most of the characters in the play are show m oppressive circumstances and in tum use 

desperate, aggressive rneasures against those who threaten them Shüts in power are highlighted. 

Characters switch ailegiance fiom narrative to narrative. Sue, for example, proves to be Iso bel's 

fkst helper. She rescues Isobel fiom the attacks by the other cbildren and cornforts Isobel by 

t e h g  her a similar story fiom her chjldhood. In this example, story-tehg and the confirmation 

of identity are lînked. But Sue's identity is not secure. It is tenuously held together, a precarious 

Mage of her positions as subject. J e d e r  Harvie enmerates the nurnber of positions which are 

constructed for Sue in her poststructuralist reading of the play and describes them in Julia 

Kristeva's tenn as "'slogans' which help characters to make sense of or contain only provisiondy 

the 'lion' of a chaotic or threatening experience" ("Constructing Fictions" 88). Sue appears as 

Isobel's helper, but Isobel loses fàith in her wher, she sees her lose her power. Sue fkds out that 

her husband BU is hawip an afEiir. She attempts to seduce hmi; she perfomis a striptease for him, 



but he rejects her. Sue in this way is presented in a series of posiîions as subject. Her changeability 

fiom one position to another undermines a coherence in identity. 

The discursive foundation for subjectivity is exposed as king vuluerable. Sue has been 

living on trust in a vow: 

SUE. YOU TOOK A VOW! In a CHURCH in fiont of a pries and my mother 
and your mother and your M e r  and you swore to LOVE and honour and 
cherish tiu DEATH US DO PART till DEATH US DO PART, BILL, it's 
YOUR WORD your WORD. 

BILL. 1 am breaking my word. (22) 

The words and story in which Sue believes are unstable. Both the marriage contract and its 

dissolution, in this case, in the public display of Sue's humiliation, are socially detemiined. Word, 

language, narrative--th& which seemed to be so reliable and indispensable--are shown to be as 

fickle as the people who employ them. 

As Ric Knowles points out, the narratives of the characters in this play are conflicting: 

Several sequences . . . can be seen as "duelling narratives," as the characters 
constmct equally compelliag but mutudy exclusive biographies and 
autobiographies that involve one another in pivotal but conflicting roles in their 
O wn narrative strat egies. ('The Ac hievement" 3 4) 

Thompson foregrounds the instability of narrative throughout. Coherence is arbitrary and 

temporary. The pain of the characters is in the f lounde~g they experience as they are caught 

between these places of coherence. One of the most forceful examples of the power of narrative 

and the construction of subjects occurs near the end of the play. Isobel follows Sherry, sure that 

she will lead him to the Iion: "She ... 1 see, 1 srneli the spray, the Lion's spray" (55). By this it is 

clear that Isobel has had a similar experience to Sherry. What ensues is a very painful scene 

between Sherry and her boyf?iend Edward. Edward threatens to cancel their wedding unless 



Sherry t e k  hirn what he wants to hem: uiat she's been dreaming about the rape that happened to 

her six years ago : 

EDWARD. That was the best fùck you ever had, wasn't it? It was the only 
fuck you ever respected, wasn't it? WASN'T [T SHERRY? (58) 

He badgers her uMü she agrees with hEn and retek the story, "Corne on, tel  the truth, the truth, 

truth, truthy' (59), he says. The stage directions rnake it clear that Sherry is disgusted at what she 

is sayhg, but she agrees to his narrative, and as iines alternate, she relates a story which is at first 

his, and then ambivalently hers, and codd be mterpreted either way. These narratives do indeed 

"duel" until Edward's wins out: 

EDWARD. The hottest sex you ever had! 
SHERRY. And .. and ... 1 lie there for hours, passed out, al1 my blood pouring 

out ont0 the cernent. 
EDWARD. But happy, right? You M y  got it GOOD. 
SHERRY. Until the My's puttin out her garbage! 
EDWARD. And you told her the tnah, didn't you? 
SHERRY. what? 
ED WARD. That it was d your M t ?  
ED WARD. That you teased the poor guy, that you wanted him to power yo y 

it was the sexiest hottest sex ever you wanted to be HAD. 
SHERRY. The lady, she helped me up, she-she gave me a Kleenex, and a 

glas of water, she- 
EDWARD. You told her, of course, that you are the snake. 
SHERRY. 1 ... am ... the snake? 
EDWARD. Because SATAN tempts OTHERS to sin, right? 
SHERRY. Satan tempts others to sin? 
EDWARD. You were the snake with the b o n d  back, glittering! 
SHERRY. I ... am ... the snake. 
EDWARD. It  was ali your Mt. 
SHERRY. It was .. . ail . .. my fàuit. 
ED WARD. You ARE the snake. 
SHERRY. I am the snake. 1 am the d e .  1 AM the d e .  1 AM THE 

SNAKE. 1 AM THE SNAKE! 1 AM THE SNAKE! I AM THE SNAKE! 1 
AM THE SNAKE! 1 AM THE SNAAAAAAAAKE! ! (61) 



in this scene, it is the retelling of the narrative that is important to Edward. He rnust control the 

stories Sherry tells him and tells the woman in the past. Narratives constnict positions for subjects 

which are linked to larger social narratives and contexts. By acquiescing to Edward's narrative, 

Sherry assures her participation in a larger social narrative: the Cindereila myth.I4 Immediately 

after screaming that she is the snake (where she ais0 agrees to the Biblical myth of Adam and 

Eve) and she breaks down and cries, she pulls herseiftogether to claim her reward: 

SHERRY. Eddie? Will you corne with me tomorrow then to Ashley's to pick 
out a pattern? Like I've make the appointment and everything Ed, and after 
all, you are going to have to live with the dishes. I mean, 1 know guys hate 
goin in there, ad guys do, but everyone that gets married goes to Açhley's, 
everyone that gets married- 

ED WARD. Alright. But nothing with fiowers on it. I just want something 
clan, rnaybe-white, with a black stripe. (6 1-62) 

The power of these larger culturd narratives is exposed in this moment, as Thompson 

demonstrates the domination and subordination Liherent in the subjects the narratives create. In 

the story that Thompson creates in Lion in the Streets, she &O offers a dif5erent construction of 

identity which can also undermine such power structures as weiI. 

One of the most arresting sequences of the play is the scene between Scarlett and 

Christine. Here there is an overt cooflict in the narratives which construct the characters. Beneath 

the sanitized, formulait words of the journaüst, Thompson shows repressed violence. Despite the 

surface shock of her vocabulary and imaginative sex scenes, Scarlett desperately needs to fit imo a 

larger social situatioa Christine quipes Scarlett for a story, creating an identity for her. On one 

l4 Judith Thompson uses this term to describe this scene to Jennifér Harvie (In Harvie, 
'Troblernatking Truth" 157 n.6). 



level, Scarlett, a woman with cerebral paky, effectively dismpts the smooth patina of Christine's 

CHRISTINE. Scarlett, do you have any hobbies; that is, what do you do 
between volunteers, do you have fàvourite soap operas or game shows, or- 

SCARLETT. I screw my brains out. (46) 

Scarlett tells her çtory when Christine cautiously admits, "I thmk everybody deserves to - have a 

happy sex Hie" (46). At füst t seems as though Scarlett wins. As she descnbs her 'tnidnight 

man" who cornes into her room at night, Scarlett physically enacts t: 

SCARLE'M'. He corne every t h e  there isn't no moon, in like a big cat sit on 
the bed, and me, like a big piece of K t ,  

[Dance music starts. SCARLETT gels up] 
explodin in the heat, exploding up and out the whole night, I can MOVE when 

my boy cornes, [she twîrZs] 1 am mo* I know 1 am, 1 am turnin and 
swishin and holdin, 

[A MAN enters. He und SCARLETT dance romanticd'y around the set. He 
Ieaves her back in the chari, immobile, and exits] (47) 

This fàntastical moment is liberatory for Scariett; again, it is not explained as a dream sequence, 

but stands within the experience of Scarlett. And yet, this mastery is temporary. The power 

reverts to Christine when she says that she is going to print the story regardless of her promise of 

secrecy. Scarlett panics. Because of other social circumstances, this story cannot be told: 

SCARLETT. PLEASE!! PLEASE!! Please, Christine, rny old lady and old 
man, they're old, rny rnum's had a stroke, my dad's got MS, this'd kiU em, 
please! ! 

CHRISTINE. That is not my business, Scarlett, Scarlett, let go of me, LET 
GO! 

SCARLETT. Reverend Pete and everybody down the church, they'd thuik I 
was a siut, they'd send me to the fkeakhouse. (48) 

This aory that Christine wants to introduce to the newspaper wouid have untenable social 

u cations for Scarlett. Despite the inability to transcend the restrictions of her physical 



circuniçtances, Scarlett 's imagination transcends what Christine has. Scarlett nego tiates seveml 

different identities dependent on context. Power repeatedly shifts in this sequence. Christine 

attacks Scarlett, viciously beating her in an explosion of her repressed anger. This scene also 

bridges reality and htasy; but most importantly it triggers Christine to admit what her 1 0 s  is: 

belonging. Scarlett has something which she does wt: 

CHRISTINE. . . . You shouldn't have made me do that Scarlett. You 
shouldn't have made me kick you iike that. The way you, yo y you taiked 
to me like that. Like, like, like you belong. In the world. As if you belong. 
Where did you get that feeling? I want it. I need it. (49) 

The imaginative possibiüties of Scarlett release her fkom a stu1tifying constriction as a subject 

coostnicted in a singular f'ashion Piayed out on her body, her cerebral palsy, like the epüepsy m 

Tornado. gives her a coveted ability: to go to the other side, to belong dinerently and severdy- 

Isobel's S tory 

Thompson's emphasis on the body is again realized in the portraya1 of Isobel. Isobel is the 

ghost of a young Pomiguese girl who was murdered seventeen years ago. She is the audience 

to ucbstone for the play: she is constant throughout and either participates in or observes ail the 

scenes. Other characters are changeable and seen only briefly, in extreme situations which demand 

extreme measures. Change is f o n d  in stepping outside the cycle of structures which are based on 

a dynamic of mastery. Isobel presents the journey of a dinerent kind of identity formation. 

Mastery is critiqued in the presentaîion of her story as a destabibxd, ironized and intempted 

narrative. 

As Ric Knowles points out, the fonn of the play itselfhas ironic resonances with a more 

traditional dramatic structure: this is not a subversion, but d e r  a perversion of the Aristoteiian 



and modernist structures of containment ('The Dramaturgy" 226). Wth reference to the scene 

between David and the pries, Knowles illustrates how %e identities of the characters seem to be 

contingent on the changing stories they tell of themselves aod one another" (228). Knowles points 

out the series of reversais that occurs in this scene and how this relates to Thompson's 

discontinuous structure in the play. This perversion is contingent on Isobel's reading and action in 

the play itself. The exposition of the play, for example, is a self-conscious address to the audience 

by Iso bel: 

ISOBEL. Doan be scare. Doan be scare. [turns tu audience] Doan be scare of 
this pickshur! This pickshur is nüüce, nice! I looove this pickshur, this 
pickshur is mine! [gestwing bhind her] 1s my house, is my Street, is my 
park, is my people! You know me, you lmow me very hard! I live next 
house to yo y with my brother and sisters, Maria, Luig, Carla and Romeo 
we play, we play with your girl, your boy, you know me, you know me 
very hard. But ... when did tha be? Tha not be now! Tha not be today! I 
think tha be very long years ago. 1 diink I be old. 1 think I be very old. 1s 
rny h o w  but is not my house is my street but is not my Street my people is 
gone 1 am lost. 1 am lost. 1 AM LOOOOOOOOOST!! (15) 

Things are and are not what they seen The exposition of the play sets the scene, by t ehg  us that 

everything which we seem to think is certain is uncertaia Isobel's address indicates the stage, the 

'Pickshur" they are about to witness, but her dislocation is palpable. The play becornes a search 

for this home or identity which also involves a redefkition of what identity might mean. 'This 

pickshur is nüüce, nice!" Isobet declares. But what foliows is anything but nice. The monologue is 

replete with contradictions. She speaks directly to the audience, telling them, as she teils herse& 

not to be scared although the stage directions hdicate she is terdied. She appears as a nine-year 

old chüd, yet part way through the monologue she acknowledges how old she feels. She assures 

us that this is her neighbourhood, but at the end of the monologue she screams her distress. She is 

determined to be hown, to be recognized. She is both at home and not at home. Although she is 



the main character of the play, she is " d e e h e r  a b o i  to e t  and interact with others is 

iirnited. Already Isobel and the audience are in the precarious position of having to entertain two 

thoughts at once. The contradictioos within this moment indicate again the paradoxes of the 

postmodem. 

As Isobel is the only character who is consistently present throughout the play, we foUow 

her viewing experience and chart the transformations that she undergoes. These corne to her as 

she observes the story which is unfolding before her and creates her own role Un 2. The audience 

is put into a sitnilar position of watching and potential W o r m a t i o a  Isobel in the nrst halfof the 

play is searching for her helper, someone to take ber home. By Act II she has undergone at least 

one "recognition:" she reaIizes she is a ghost, unjikefy to find home or help, and she becornes an 

active pursuant of her murderer. Her search for Ben, however, ends with Isobel's forgiveness for 

hini; she does not kill him as is her intention. 

Kno wles descriis ho w the transformation of Isobel involves an exhortation to the 

audience to do as she has done, and take back their üves through an act of will. It is &O 

important to consider the change in the way that Isobel acts. Early in the play she is involved by 

physically fighting the children, or invisibly shooting the adults in the daycare meeting. These 

actions and this stanis are relinquished as Isobel acknowledges her status as a pi~ture.'~ This 

change occurs in the scene where loanne, a woman with cancer, descriis the kind of death she 

wants: 

ISOBEL. *!! 1 am dead! 1 have k e n  bones for seventeen 
years, missing, missing, my fàce in the TV and newspapers, posters, 

l5 Hawie discusses imagery m Lion in the Streets as a "potential destabilizer of meaning" 
("Constructing Fictions" 89). 



everybody lookm for, nobody nnd, I am gone, I am dead, I AM DEADLY 
DEAD! Down! It was night, was a lion, roar!! with red eyes: he come 
closer [silent scream] corne closer [ s i h t  scream] ROAR tear my throat 
out ROAR tear my eyes out ... ROAR 1 am kill! 1 am kül! I am no more! 

[Music] 
[h JOAMV' We are both pictures now. WHO WILL TAKE US? WHO 

WILL TAKE US TO HEAVEN, HA? (36-37) 

Isobel's journey is to a space of what others call redemption or moments of grace, or what 1 

consider to be a configuration of a postmodern identity. Here Isobel's absence in this world is 

emphasized. She is '%O more." Rather than a nihüistic state, this c m  be construed as a positive 

space of resolution: she leams to teil stories differentiy. 

Isobel's ternporary resolution of her own story is one of the ways in which she achieves 

agency. Although the other characters seem to be still mired in a -te of contradictory discourses 

and circumstances, Isobel cornes to represent a different kind of identity; she overcornes the 

limitations of acting to dominate or control. Isobel achieves a certain status which is conveyed in 

the ironic iconography of a reiigious tmscendence. This can appear as an ironic ~ ~ m n t  on a 

&ional ciramatic structure in which the movement of the play is a journey to closure: where 

Isobel is finally able to take back her He, to quiet her speaking heart. She fmally tells the story of 

her rape and murder by Ben at the end of the play. She is only able to come to some kind of 

closure when she is at ease with the contradictions of her king. She cornes to see Ben in the 

graveyard, and t e k  the story of the day of her abduction The exchange is an attempt to assert her 

BEN. I'rn haüucinatin. 
ISOBEL. I'm Isobel, 
BEN. You're a picture. 
ISOBEL. I'm Isabel. (63) 
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She is able to 'Wce back her W' not by killing him, but by forgiving him. In her last speech, the 

stage directions indicate she is an adult now (63). The tornados, the circles, the chaos of the other 

characters continue. It is only Isobel who is able to achieve an ironic catharsis by removing herself 

fiom the stories, by acknowledging both her statu as a picture, and her participation in others' 

stories. She is able to tell her story and give others hope by the sense skie rnakes out of her own 

story-telling and by removing herseif fiom the binarist configurations. 

This reading of the character of Isobel may appear to be smoothing over contradictions, 

rather than highlighting them. The end of Lion in the Streets seem odd. Does Isobel forgive her 

kiuer, and therefore, as a good, self-sacrificing fernale, refuse to blame or to demand justice? 

Iso bel clearly is working within the story-telling of Roman Catholic iconography; but as the stage 

directions say, Isobel ascends to heaven, "in her mind" (63). It is Isobel's specific story which 

defhes her transformation. 

"As-ü" identities: the contingency of community 

Isobel's tnagmative ending to her story is one way to read her agency. In addition to the 

%-if' enactment of the ending, Isobel's resulution cornes in her association with Sherry's story. 

In Lion in the Sheeis the seWother split is displaced by a dynamic of identity and agency which is 

based within community. The imaginative incorporation and reworking of identity occurs in the 

ways in which actors transfonn from one character to another as subjectivity is at the same t h e  

unique and yet repeatable. Several times characters literally take up the experiences of other 

characters. Sometimes the traosforrnation fiom one character to another happens on stage; t c m  

even be integrated hto the action. For example, when Laura brings up the story of Maria to her 



husband George and insists, "how could you forget?" George eventuaiIy responds by taking on 

the role of Maria and repeating Laura's words: 

[GEORGE grah a tabledoth and wraps it around his head, likz a shawZ, 
speaking in a Portuguese accent] 

GEORGE. How could I forget, how could 1 forget? 
LAURA. George. 
GEORGE. Looka this. Me? 1 donta forget nothing. 
LAURA. George I'm going to bed. Molly gets up in two hours and t's always 

me that gets up with her of course. 
[She wa lk  around the c i d e ]  
GEORGE/MARIA, LAURA. 
[Now he speuh as MARIA, ISOBEL'S mother. BOBEL recogni'es her] 
L A W  George! Corne to bed. 
GEORGE/MARIA. LAüR4. 
LAURA. Maria (25-26) 

Scenes and characters blend one into the other, Uustrating the pemeability of both. Not only does 

the play bleed fiom one scene to the next, but subjects live according to the stories of others, 

mirroring them through action and word. The embeddedness of identity in the other is cornplex: 

George plays Maria who describes how she becomes her husband, Antonio. As she fol& the 

laundry she senses his experience: 

MARIA. Like I fold myselftoo, and 1 go in his body, maybe, you know his ... 
hand to, wipe off his Face when he hot and too sweat 1 am there; 

[She w& operaticaily down-stage and delivers the rest of the speech, which 
should be Zike an aria] 

1 am foldin a light sheet of blue then and sudden, 1 can see through his eye, am 
at subway, in hmi, he stands on the platform, is empty, empty and 1 am his 
head, circles and circles like r d  birds flying around and around 1 am his 
throat, tight, cannot breathe enough air in my body the floor the floor 
move, and si& in, rise up rise like a wd like a külin wave tum tum me in 
circles with teeth in circles and under aud ovet 1 Mi! 

CI SOBEL fails on an imaginary track in fiont of her mother] 
I làll on the silver track nobody move 1 hearing the sound. The sound of the 

rats in the tunnel their breath like a basement these dark rats ninning 
ninning towards me I am stone 1 am earth m o t  scream cannot move the 
rats tramp ... trample my body £kt-ten and every bone splinter like ... (27) 



in this scene both Isobel and her mother dnunatize the story which is told to L a m  There is both 

an inscnbing and an underminhg of this event. Although Maria says that she experiences the fàU 

on the tracks, it is Isobel who acts it out for the audience. The story is told by Maria, who is 

played by George. The eEect is an odd resonance, for this is Antonio's story in the first place. 

There is a metatheaaical tone to the story as well, as the style of her delivery according to the 

stage directions is meant to be operatic. The story and the seme of self is no t fragmenteci in this 

paT.ticular scene so much as it is shared. 

In this way, identity is not so much owned, as shared by a cormmuiity. It cornes through 

and is situated withiu a community, within discourse, within several bodies. Although Thompson 

may consider this a tapping into a universalism, it may surely be considered a universam ody 

insofàr as similar circumstances are found. These are ofken the stones of marginalized characters, 

of women, for example. Sue cornforts Isobel early in the play by relating a similar story to 

Isobel's. Sue and her sisters were terrorized by boys on bicycles who shot anows at them. The 

stones that are thrown in Isobel's interaction and the arrows in Sue's story recall the children's 

rhyme: "Sticks and stones may break my bones but names wiU never hurt me." Names and 

d g ,  however, are very important in this play, especially naming home, experience, and 

ultimately identity. We are subjects both through the sequence of positions which we find 

discursively and the ways in which we relate to them as real. We empathize and find ourselves 

through others, just as Sue and Isobel do in their story telling. 

That accumulation of s d  aories conmiutes to an ironizing of the narrative at the level 

of the play as a whole. It is difEcult, for example, to make connections between characters, to teli 



any kind of story of the whole which d e s  sense. Individual scenes are quickly and deffly 

sketched, but the connections are seemingIy arbitrary- Rather than a un+g story, there are 

several smaller stories within stories, in a Chinese box structure. I6 

What the play involves, more than anythg else, is a relinquishing of rnastery. The result 

of such an involvement in the audience is saikuig. What is almost completely denied in Lion in the 

Sîreets is a specinc implied singular viewing position Isobel is always there; she guides us 

tangentially on her joumey, and yet her resolution and ascension are aixnost so naive that they are 

unpalatable; it is impossible to configure the resolution as anything beyond a very specific 

narrative ending for Isobel herself. The other characters are lefi at loose ends, as is the audience, 

with resolution given to ody one of the many we have seen. The options for a coherent sense of 

selfmay seem simplistic; the options for the postmodernist identity may seem ovenvhelrning. 

'Take back your Me," Isobel exhorts us, but this is only in the "as if' key of t e h g  stones 

(McHale 32). Stuart Hall also acknowledges the importance of coming to terxns with the story- 

telling of one's identity: 

They [identities] arise fkom the narrativization of the self, but the necessarüy 
fictionai nature of this process in no way undermines its discursive, material or 
political effectivity, even ifthe belongingness, the ''suturing into the st01-f' through 
which identities arise 4 partiy, in the imaginary (as weIl as the symbolic) and 
therefore, always, partly constnicted in fàntasy, or at least within a £àntasmatic 
field. (Questions 4) 

it is in this imaginary, fktasmatic reah  where the plays of Thompson are most effective. The 

ending of Lion in the Streets is bittersweet: we are lefi to disentang1e the strands of rightkong; 

l6 David and the priea exchange stories. Rodney and Michael fight over stories fkom the 
pst. The stories and interpretations for events that occur in the Sugar Meeting are also examples 
of the layers of sto ry-telling. 



vengeancelforgiveness; good/evil; as we want the sec* of m e r s  and yet also the pluratism of 

ciifference. It is again usefùl to return to the p d g m  of postmodernism for a consideration of 

While many reject the modernist "view fiom nowhere," they question whether 
postmodemism would not lead us to the equaily problematic "everywhere." Are 
coherent theory and politics possible within a postmodern position? (Nicholson, 
"Introduction" 9) 

Defining merence is paramomt. These viewing positions are in an eitherlor configuration. A 

dif3erent kind of specincity, however, is possible in a postmodern M e  of reference, one which is 

temporary and conm%utes to an identity positioning which aEords agency, and yet does not Unply 

unpro blematic CO hesion. 

Conclusion 

In the piays of Judith Thompson, there is a Werent kind of dramaturgy at work, one 

which dernands a différent kind of engagement on the part of the audience, a kind of C,éarful play. 

In his fo mulation of the dramaturgy of the perverse, Ric Knowles describes how this khd of 

playwriting provides emancipatory potential for its audience in the subject positions it onérs ("The 

Dramaiurgy" 234). Recogninng these positions as constmcted, yet taking them up nonetheless, 

is, as Jennifer Hanie puts it, "a politics of the provisional" (Tonstnicting Fictions" 91). What 1 

am suggesting here is the way in which this provisionality and plurality of subjectivity are linked 

to a tension between mastery and non-mastery and how this can be of use to a feminist politics. 

The characters ody temporarily attain agency by acquiescing to a discursive construction, but this 

proves limiting. It is an important part of Thompson's dramaturgy that her piays and her 



characters are rooted in coherent concepts of the subject: part of their power is this ability to 

sect the audience so deeply. It is important, of course, that we sedwitness the positions which 

the characters assume. The experiences of these characters on this level are Becting, even 

emotionally draining. This functions well and effectively, and is one way in which Thompson's 

plays have profound e f f m  of identification And yet this identification is also unsettled. 

This unsettling occurs on many levels. The positions of the characters are changeable. 

Positions are relinquished as other opportunities arise, or as power valences shift. The 

serialization of these positions destabilizes any coherent sense of self. If these positions are many, 

they are also transitory and achieve only temporary change. Furthermore, the abusive situations 

within these plays perpetuate the same kinds of subjects. The discursive construction of subjects is 

forego unded, both by the discursive authorities which operate as touchstones for identification, 

and also by the seriality of the positions which are taken up. The serialization does not afford any 

filndament.1 change in the institutions and discourses which prove to be Limiting and inextricably 

Linked to a binarist right/wrong, dorninant/subordinate form of interaction. 

It is only in the reworking of the "constitutive outside" that substantial changes in 

articulations of being and of social interactions can take place. It is the very incompleteness of this 

formation of identity which lends it political effectiveness: 

That identifications shift does not necessarily mean that one identification is 
repudiated for another; that shifting may well be one sign of hope for the 
possibility of avowing an expansive set of connections. This will not be a simple 
matter of "sympathy" with another's position, since sympathy involves a 
substitution of oneself for another that may well be a colonization of the other's 
position as one's own. And it will not be the abstract inference of an equivalence 
based on an insight into the partially constituted character of all social identity. It 
will be a matter of tracing the ways in which identification is implicated in what it 



excludes, and to follow the h e s  of that implication for the rnap of fùture 
community that it might yield. (Butler 118-19) 

Figuring out desires, and articulating what one wants entails choices. By highlighting the 

exclusiom and reworking of the "constitutive outside," Thompson suggests a mereut dynamic of 

identity formation which does not involve imperialism or colonization. Located at contradictory 

interstices, thwarted by the dependence of the "I" in "Y0 y" characters who most embody this 

state of arnbiguity are caught in uncertain, transitional spaces; they are unable to articulate fkom a 

coherent space. There are recurring images in the plays of Judith Thompson, sites of ambivalence, 

where new ways of thinking about identity seem to be possible: characters who sail over the 

cracks,'' circular images of tornados, the recurring image of the baby as a screaming into king of 

the postmodem identity, the hctured beings of the abject. In particular, the ghost-Re presence 

of Isobel demonstrates the Merent kind of reading and discursive negotiation which is necessary 

in order to achieve such an identity: she is able to find a story and a way of t e h g  herself that 

allows her a negotiation of space in the world. The combined effect of the whirling contradictions 

of the postmodem terrain and the painful situatedness of the subject makes for a disturbing, often 

This is the territory, then, which this reading of the postmodem feminist identity 

negotiates. The where-do-1-stand and the what-do-1-do confuson which makes up the who-am4 

in a postmodem world inevitably lives in a body, a gendered identity. Identity is perhaps best 

conceived as a 'hiode of holding together the epistemological and the ontological" (Probyn 4), for 

indeed, the ontological is what has k e n  Ieft out of much postmodern theory. This articulation is 

'' Thompson in letter to Knowles dated 24 October 1984 (Qtd. in Hanie, Troblematizing 
Tmth" 3 1). 
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reaIized by the reintegration of  the material within and through the discursive in the plays of 

Judith Thompson A similar tempiate of identity cm be seen in the plays of Margaret 

Hollingsworth; her strategies of  articufation of this postmodern feminist identity, however, aie 

rnuch more narratively bound, less physically raw. But as I have s h o w  with Thompson, the two 

are inextricably iinked. In Hollingsworth as in Thompson, my readmg of the plays wiU focus on 

the interplay of these deterrninants of  identity, emphasizing how a mind/body split is reworked in 

postmodemisn 



Stones that Matter: The Plays of Margaret Hollingsworth 

JACK. Like a s h e y  green mg, heavin under your feet-and when you walk on 
it you feel it squelch ... you feel it under your kt, and then you're up to 
your knees m it and then it's up to your chm. They're on your shoulders, m 
your ears ... they're takin over! It's ffogs. Your Eggin fkogs! 

JENNY. Do somethi-i-i-i-ng ! 1 hate them! KiIl them! W them! Kiü them! Kill 
them! Kül them! Ki-i-i-i-i-iU! (The Home that Jack Built 22) 

Unlike the 'iinfeminist feminist" position of Judith Thornpson, the ferninist politics of 

Margaret Holluigsworth are clear. In 1985 in an impassioned article for Canadian Theatre Review 

entitled "Why We Don't Write," she advocates aErmative action to bring about change, arguinp 

that theatre in Engüsh Canada, in partictilar, is temTbly consexvative and not receptive to works by 

women (26-37). In Langu~ge in her Eye she indicates what else must change: "Theatre is the 1 s t  

male cultural bastion, the men are doing their best to hold the fort and the walls aren't about to 

tumble without a huge assault eorn playgoers" (1 44). Ahhough she is persistent in her own work, 

she is not optirnistic about immediate change for women piaywrights: 

No, 1 guess I don't see the male hierarchy in the artistic directorates of theatres in 
Canada changing. Even when the tendency is towatds change, 1 think women have 
become honed d o m  very quickly to that male point of view. They have to if 
they're going to survive. ('Wargaret Hollingsworth I n t e ~ e ~ '  146) 

Hollingsworth's remarks corne f?om personal experience. In the introduction to Endangered 

Species, she declares the collection was written "out of pervenity, I suspect, and certainly not out 

of any commercial instinct" (7). She undertook the publication of it herself: '? became so tired of 

having plays just Iying around with nothing happening to them. It occurred to me a long t h e  ago 

that I should publish them myself, but that takes a lot of money and energy" ("'Margaret 

Hollingsworth InteMew" 148). Clearly the trajectory of Hollingsworth's career suggests a 

playwright who is battling to wrÎte differently, to change audiences, to get them to think 
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differentiy. Her feroinism comes in her forthright critique of the ckcumstances of women which 

she represents in her plays: '? c d  it as I see 2," she says in the introduction to Endnngered 

Species (8). Her feminism also appears in the ways in which she challenges the conditions of 

playwrighting for women in Canada. My anaiysis will demonstrate the way in which her plays 

rewrite forms of identity as  weU. Before 1 examine the substance of her plays, 1 will situate 

Hollingsworth's plays within a hmework of reception and criticisrn. These remarks are crucial in 

order to contrast my discussion of Hohgworth,  as well as to account for what 1 consider to be 

a rather negative reception of these plays. 

Recep tion 

Hollingsworth's piays are seldom produced; as she herself states, much of her feedback 

comes fiom academic circles (''Margaret Hohgsworth Interview" 149). The response to her 

plays by critics is harsh, suggests Hollingsworth: 

With a couple of exceptions in Vancouver, 1 think I've k e n  treated very roughly. 
Either ignored or absolutely panned with no attempt to understand where I'm 
comlig from or what I'm trying to do. (The Work 99) 

Generaliy it is her plays which are more conservative in structure and content that have gamered 

more attention Ever Loving was praised for its '%- in the Toronto production (Conlogue, 

"Humanity" E8). Gina Mdet  commends its ability to communicate true emotion: 

'Wollingsworth's voice is thin, but it's clear, and the emotions it evokes are profound because the 

actors invest them with a truth that is palpable" @ 1). When other more experimentd plays are 

also reviewed on this criterion, the success of the production is still iiuked to the ability of the 



actors to communicaîe "truth." Robert Crew fi& the Tarragon r e W  of AlIi Alli Oh and 

Islands in 1986 uninspiring: 

Although 1 Like Islanh slightly more than the smealist AIIi Alii Oh, my problem 
with both phys is that they lack any spark of h u m . .  Despite the accomplished 
work of Giisenan [the actor playhg AU], the relatiomhip between AUi and Muriel 
does mt ring true. ~Hoiiuipsworth PIays" G2) 

Part of the problem with these plays, it seerns, is thei. dour perspective on We: 'The message 

60m these joyless, obscure plays seems to be that, man or woman, we are aU islands; all 

relationships are doomed to Mure" (G2). War Babies does not fàir any better in reviews. This 

t h e  Crew begins his review with an overt admission: 

Margaret Hohgsworth is surely one of the more puzzling of contemporary 
CanadiSn phywrights. 

It's obvious to aii that her work is strikingly original and written with keen 
intelligence. Yet it's all too easy to get loa within those intricaie m e d  
landscapes. ("Intelligent Writer" np.) 

Although Crew praises the "intellectual exercise," he laments its lack of drama: 

As theatre, however, it becomes dense, difncult, and ultimately w g  in its 
lack of true emotiond content. It's all too easy to switch off and let things drift by. 
(n-p.) 

Bob Pennington leaves Wm Babies '%rith a clear impression that the highly intelligent and 

commendably-compassionate HoUingswonh had exceeded her considerable abüity" (np.). There 

is something disturbing but difncult about these plays. They do not easüy satisfy. As Robert Crew 

says, " . . . what is king said about relationships has an unpleasantIy bitter and pessimistic ring" 

("Intelligent Writer" o. p.). It is both this unpalatable message and the musuai dramatic form 

which Crew finds fhsîrating: 



Hohgsworth has some strong and vital thoughts to convey. She has yet, to my 
a d ,  folmd the right way of saying them m a f o m  that constitutes compehg 
drama. (o. p. ) 

In a review of WiIIfuI Acts, a collection of Hohgsworth's plays, Don Rubin uses Diving to 

ülustrate both the potentiai, but also the Iimitations of her work: 

Here again, one fkds ail of the Hohgsworth signatures--multiple realities, a 
multiplicity of motives, lonelmess and conhion at the centre of a M e  üfe, with 
anger, violence, and death just a breath away. One fin& also a drarnatist weil 
enough m cormnand of her tools, yet who tends oniy superficially to explore the 
essential questions her works raise. (1 37-38) 

Again Rubin's remarks indicate a preference for a particular kind of psychological snidy. What 

these reviews indicate is a predüection on the part of reviewers to look for a recognizable, 

forgivhg, and optirnistic view of humanity as cornmunicated by the playwright, with satisfymg 

and famiüar emotionai content for the audience. This desire can be linked to a preference for 

classic realism. As Catherine Belsey says, 

Classic realism tends to offer as the "O bvious" basis of its intelligr'bility the 
assumption that character, d e d  and coherent, is the source of action. . . . 
Uiconsistency of character or the inappropriateness of particular actions to 
particular characters is seen as a weakness. (Crirical Practice 73) 

Hollingsworth herself says that her plays do not provide for catharsis ("CoZlaborators" 1 7), nor do 

they necessarily present characters to emulate. It is often the unusual f om and particularly the 

unusual use of narrative in Hollingsworth's plays whïch bring about such uncertain, unsatisfied 

Like Judith Thornpson, Margaret Hollingsworth is one of the playwrights that Ric 

Knowles mentions in his discussion of postrnodernism in Canadian drama as a "dramaturgy of the 

perverse:" 



Hohgsworth neither rejects the symboüc structures of modemkm nor simply 
parodies them; rather she is engaged m a process of creatively perverthg and 
reshaping those structures. ('The Dramaturgy" 230) 

This creative perversion also extends to the forms of agency which the characters in her piays 

wield. Building on Knowles' formulation and investigating the possibilities for a feminist agency 

within this postmodem perversion, I will discuss these selected plays of Margaret Hollingsworth 

with attention to the formulation of identity within the context of postmodern feminism: Mother 

COU~~Q, The Apple in the Eye, Divhg, Wm Babies, Endongered Species, A fZi AIli Oh, Islands 

and In Confidence. Here 1 will demonstrate the feminist politics of Margaret Hollingsworth, with 

attention to the possibilities for identity which her plays suggest. 

Mdher County: story telling with the mother 

Mother Counhy, HoIliagsworth's first full length play, addresses one of Hollingsworth's 

key thematic concems: home. In an interview, Hollingsworth descri'bes this continuing 

preoccupation: 

Home cornes in again and again in my work. It's about relating to the place that 
you're in and hding a place for yourself in a foreign environment, which is what 
I'm doing. Feebg out of context, out of place, motivates me and informs my 
work. Without it 1 wouldn't be writing anywhere. It's very miportant to me and 
yet at the same tirne it's unsettling; it's something I have to keep exploring. (The 
Work 93) 

Horne as a metaphor of identity recurs in Hollingsworth's work and wül be considered in more 

detail in the discussion of Endungered Species. The feeling of displacement which Hollingsworth 

desmis here is key to my analysis of Mother Country. Although this play can also be read 
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allegorically as Canada's separation fiorn ~ngland,'* my concern is to consider t as an exploration 

of the way in which the dynamic of identity is conceived. in this play, the self-containeci individual 

is co~l~tantly impinged upon by the other, by a cornmunity, by discourse. The dynamic of 

isoiation/imbrication in this play, in panicular, is explored in the dyaamic of child/parent. 

Like many of Hollingsworth's plays, Mother Country is haunted by the absence of the 

Mer .  The action of the play is straightforward. A f k d y  (sans fàther) is united to celebrate the 

retirement of Janet, the mother. Daughters Sdy, Doreen, and Fran, Douglas, Doreen's husband, 

and Maurice, the neighbour, congregate at Janet's island home. The sening is odd: not ody is the 

house on an island, but it has &O ken  built to represent a captain's cabin Therefore the h g  

room where the play takes place is round, with porthole-shaped windows that look down to the 

garden (iv). The action of the play is confessionai, as fàmily secrets are revealed, and Sharon, the 

father's new fiancée appears as a catalyst to the action. 

Mother and daughters both are obsessed with Rory, Janet's ex-husband. Rory is a media 

personality; his one "appearance" in the play is on television. Ody his voice is heard; his image 

does not appear. He announces his new campaign in poiitics; Sharon has arrived in order to 

request that the Famiy keep a low profile. The play eventually reveals that Rory and Janet have re- 

established a fiiendship, a revelation which causes much dishamiony among the daughters who 

feel as though they have been denied his presence f?om birth and who resent the lies that have 

been told to 'protect" them. They thought he wallced out. As it tum out, Janet threw him out of 

the house. Says Doreen, "Why did you tell us a l l  those lies? (to DOUGLAS) 1 used to spend 

la See Hollingsworth's remarks in The Work 98. 
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nights crying for my &the?' (57). Janet, however, seems to have come to temis with her üfe and 

her relationship with her ex-husband; her new found fieedom is to do a doctorate. 

The concentration in this play is on the displaced chiidren. The abandoning fàther as a 

media personaIifl may &O hdicate the lingering, morphous patriarchal containment which 

engulfi the individuai. The mother, on the other haud, who has made peace with the Mer ,  is also 

rejected and rejecting. The identities of the children, then, are left without moorings. The play is 

about their joumey to come to terms with their own rootlessiess. In this way, the nexus of the 

play in my reading is a search for a way of king which is a process of creation and story-telling. 

In this way, the play uses realistic theatncal conventions which are at the same tmie undermined. 

In strategies of realism, the pst figures iargefy. In particulat, psychological reasons cm be 

found for present problems. Janet's children look for themselves in their past and in their heritage. 

EarIy in the play, they look at old photographs and attempt to relive their past. It is as though a 

reaiist dynamic is king self-consciously played out: the characters are searcbg to maintain an 

essential comection between who they were then and who they are now. There is one photo, m 

particular, which provokes an impassioned discussion. In the photo, Sdy, who is slightly mentaliy 

delayed, has a bucket on her head. "Were we always cruel to each other?" Doreen asks (24). 

Janet had thrown Fran into the water as a child to teach her how to swim Janet dismisses the 

question, saying they were ail survivors, but Fran persists: 

FRAN. Do I look like a survivor? (&O DOIREEN) How do you see me? (to 
JANET) How do you see us, Janet? Do you still see her [SALLY] with a 
bucket over her head? How do we see you? You're not still the same 
person who threw me into that water ... we've aii changed, haven't we? 
(24) 



Despite Fran's assertion that they have changed, the daughters stiU search for a pst reason for 

their identity. The development of cbaracters in this sense is psychologically sound: the present is 

explained by the past. In this perspective we can see the development of character as progressive, 

rational, explicable. The daughters have not made good because of both the mother and the 

For a M e r  examination of these saategies of r e a h  within the play, let us turn to 

Catherine Belsey's definition: "Classic realism is characterized by iIZz(sionism, narrative which 

leads to closure, and a hierarchy of discourses which estabmes the 'tnith' of the story" (Critical 

Pracfice 70). Through these realist conventions, the reader or spectator is hvited to construct a 

particuiar histo ryr 

Through the presentation of an intelligible history which effices its own statu as 
discour~e, classic realism proposes a mode1 in which author and reader are subjects 
who are the source of s h e d  rneanings, the origin of which is mysteriously extra- 
discursive. It thus does the work of ideology in suppressing the relationship 
between ianguage and subjectivity. (72) 

These characteristics of classic realism are both employed and subverted in Mother Country. On 

the one han& the history and possible fùture of the daughters, as well as their subjectivity as 

whole, contained individuah, are established as historically and psychologically inevitable at the 

level of the plot. On the other hand, the story-telling of the daughters is emphasized. The 

coherence of thei identities is put into question by comments such as Fran's remarks. Illusionisn 

and fourth wall realism are maintained, but these are also ironized. Again the tension of mastery 

and non-mastery is key to the krmation of identity of the characters. The M e r  is both present 

and absent by king on television. SimilarIy, narrative which leads to closure is both suggested and 

undermineci. The enigma around which the story tums is the absence of the Mer. As the story 
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progresses, however, the enigma also becomes the story of the absence of the mother. When Janet 

goes for a swim, and her clothes are discovered by the beach, she is thought to be dead. Janet's 

disappearaflce causes havoc in the household. Searches are initiated; a heiicopter is ordered. The 

daughters celebrate the "death" of the mother. Janet's disappearance is brief, however. She 

r e m ,  puts back the celebratory brandy and re-establishes order. In this way, the story is both 

done and undone. The enigma is both present and absent. Expectations are both set up and then 

thwarted. 

In this way, characters are constructed who are both whole and fhgmentary. The overall 

impression of the play is one of psychological realism. And yet, at the same thne, this coherence 

of identity is undemiined and shown to be representatiodly contingent. One of the ways in which 

subjectivity is constandy put into question is uIrough the device of game-playing. The daughters 

decide to dress up as one of themselves in the pas .  As it tunis out, they al1 decide to dress up iike 

their mother, Janet. They imitate her gestures and her voice. Each cornes to make a confession 

about herseif: Doreen admits she Med her real estate exams; Saiiy tells of a fkiled rebeliious trip 

to town; Fran adrnits her own self-hatred (34-35). In their appropriation of their mother, they 

speak their own internalization of her standards and control. Their subjectivity is contingent on 

hers. The daughters' imitation of Janet is foiiowed by a game of Murder in the Dark: "Ln this 

game Janet's death is inescapable as all the women playing it are @es of Janet" (Parker 103). 

Through an ùonîzed repetition of Janet, the subjectivity of the daughters is voiced. There is a 

simultaneous installing and undeminhg of identity. 

Mother Counfry is one of Hollingsworth's earlier piays; in the introduction she describes 

the play's flirtation with naturalist and realist conventions: 



The dialogue and action in this play are not intended to be straight6orwardly 
nahiraüstic. A director should allow the detaiis to build up on each other and the 
oddness and discordancies to be felt, until a slightly surreal effect is achieved 
remimscent of a painting fiom the rnagic reaiism schoot. ([il) 

Dorothy Parker points out such surrealistic elements in the play as the heücopter and Sharon the 

fiancée as deus ex machina; she also notes a conînst in the symbolic setting with the "colloquial 

b e s s  in the dialogue to produce the incongniis, basic to surrealistic style" (1 04). These 

hcongruous features suggest the s~ultaneous existence of several levels of reaiity, which 

contributes to destabilized and fàntasmatic identities. Mastery of an action or of a parîicular 

meanhg is undemiined. The "death" of the mother, for example, is aiways only hghary. The 

most substantial act of defiance is Fran's, in her beheading of the chsysanthemums. And yet also 

this act of destruction does nothing more for Fran than situate her within the same cycle of 

triumph/defeat. in this way, Fran's attempts to act out against her mother and the confines of her 

situation do not achieve clearcut resolution. This qd i f jhg  of action is linked to a depiction of 

identity as ako always in this tension of mastery and non-mastery. Hoilingsworth says of the 

characters she constr~~cts, '7 tend to write a lot about people on a M e  edge, about an emotiod 

world where one leap in the wrong direction is going to be carastrophic" (The Work 93). This 

borderline condition is related to the destabilized linear narrative in Hollingsworth' s plays. This 

relationship between destabilized identity and destabilized narrative becomes more apparent in 

Hollingsworth's later plays. 



The Apple in the Eye and Diking: stories with no "hard, brîght kernels of meaning" 

1 am considering these two short plays togerher because of their similanty m content and 

f o m  In each play a woman is depicted as isolated and controlled by an 0-e male voice. llre 

Appïe in the Eye opens with Germna dohg the cross-word puzzle in bed, cailing out for help with 

m e r s  to her husband Martin who is watching television in the bedroom His construction of her 

is evident in mny ways. He easily cornes up with the correct responses to the p d e .  His answers 

are automatic. He calls the d e s  of the game: 

GEMMA. My husband Martin taught me to do crosswords. It's redy very 
easy. 1 read out the dues. He gives me the answee. 1 do them in bed on a 
Sunday afternoon. (1 9) 

Here even the syntax reflects the order and routine which defines Gemma's life: the word order is 

simply subject-verb-object. Gemma describes the routine of th& weekends, a routine which this 

short play depicts. It is Martin's voice which orders the actions of their lives: fkom doing the 

crossword puzzle to making tea to making love. Martin's extemal ordering of the world does not 

preclude any agency on Germna's, but t certainly defines the parameters of her We. His voice 

o-e and his recorded voice lecturing are the stnictwlng principles for Gemmi's world. 

Martin's job is in ArtiIicial Intelligence. Like the fàther in Mother Country who is involved in the 

media and Colin in War Babies who is an international joumaüst, the male character in Apple in 

the Eye is associated with a larger, media sawy world. The men are associated with a more 

pervasive discursive realm which constructs much of the 'truth" the fernale characters experience. 

Withm the limits of her world, however, Gemma has agency. She undermines the authority 

of Martin's voice by interprethg his words differently. She imaginatively uses Martin's answers 



for the crossword puzzle. One of Martin's answers, "arcane," for example, suggests to Gemma 

htastical irnagery. She descri'bes her d n d  as an apple, ?lit in two: 

GEMMA. . . . One half of my mind contemplates the pssibility of arcane 
amusements [she giggles], while the other halfcomes slowly to We, and the 
golden spider with eight-inch legs md a tiny diamond head nestling inside 
the etchmg, emerges and bites into the apple which is the two halves of my 
mind. (21) 

Where Mamn's responses are dennitions, Laerally based, Gemma's creations are fluid and 

imaginary twists, inspired by Martin's words and yet qmken Merently. In this way, Gemrna takes 

her words f?om Martin, but uses them for a dinerent efftén 

As MartUi controls her cross-word game, so the discourses of the patriarchy provide the 

discursive authorities which are the touchstones of her existence. Again, twisting the scene for her 

own purposes, Gemma ironically refers to Martin as Marat and phyfûily describes a bathtub 

scene: 

GEMMA. . . . Here beside me lies my husband Martin. Large and pale, shce 
he works with his mind and not with his body. [Spells M e r  . . . a-t. Pause.] 
Here beside me Lies Marat in his bath. He has been bitten by the golden 
spider. His head drips blood, while into one ear, through a smaU plastic 
plug, flow the Iatest and greatest exploits of the W i p e g  Blue Bombers 
and the Calgary Stampeders. My only love. (22) 

Gemma refers to the discourses, like the sports play, the lecture, the science fiction reading, which 

construct Martin's subjectivity as weli. Her mind is an apple, split in two whose shape reminds her 

of the buttocks of Saskia. The discourses which d e h e  Gemma and Martin are undermined in tbis 

way, playhlly @en a different meaning and signincance by her imagination 

G e m  wrests a certain amount of control fiom Martin m these playful re-imaginings and 

use of Marat, the p i c w  of Saskia, and her apple imagery. But m the final analysis, nothing in the 



discursive situation of Gemma changes. Her agency is limited and virtually unnoticeable to 

Martin. He does not see the apple which is her eyeA *ch tumbles out and is now on the kitchen 

floor. He perfom a ' ~ r f e c t  lobotomy" (29) on the apple with his toe as he accidentally kicks t. 

We do not see thk scene. We only hear Gennna shoo him out of the kitchen, o f f e ~ g  to make the 

tea herselfso that she can fhd the halves of her apple. She k d s  them, puts them together, 

"almost a perfect sed," (29) and r e m  to the domestic duties which defme her. But she is unable 

to d e  decisions on her own, even those most trivial: 

GEMMA. . . . Almoa a perfèct seal . . . You're getthg smaller. Now the tray 
he said . . . And the mugs. We'U have the Mickey Mouse mugs just for a 
Iaugh. No . . . he mightn't thmk it's funny. [Lights dim as she calls.] 
Martin? Should we have the Mickey Moue mugs just for a laugh? Martin? 

MARTIN. Bring it in a goddamned samovar. 1 don't care. (29) 

The imaginative apple imagery is on& effective for Ge- In thk way, her subversion of his 

world, particularIy in the re-use of language, is M e d .  

In Diving, similar techniques are used to differentiate between male and f d e  worlds. 

Again a male voice-off directs the isolated woman on stage. Vive, Viveca," he exhorts over and 

over. The stage is bare; Viveca is dressed in a nmple-ieafdecorated bathing-suit. Although she 

wears earplugs, she is still able to hem the male voice gMng her directions; she has internalized 

the dictates of the male authority. Her actions are directed by his voice and she respondç to him 

by 'tvaitiag for approval which does not corne" (1 15), by looking up 'Yearfùlly" (1 l7), and then 

waiking up "petdandy" (1 17), at which point she says, 'No one ever t e h  me what to do" (1 17). 

And yet they do, for Viveca does dive, afier saying to herse& 'Dive dog" (1 18), and then 

responding to the voice with a bark and a whimper. Althougli she parodies the roles she plays, her 

ability to act out Merently is dubious: 



MALE VOICE. 
VTVECA. Yes? 
MALE VOICE. 
WVECA. Yes. 
MALE VOICE. 

NOW! 

Yes. 

Yes! 
VIVECA. NOW! [She dives, Iighls snap off Blackout. . . .] (1 18) 

The dialogue reflects the ways in which Viveca obeys and acquiesces to the instructions of the 

male voice; she repeats his words, but she is unable to repeat them dinerentIy. Rather her actions 

are within the form orchestrated by the male voice. Imagery comments on the subjectivity of 

Viveca When the lights corne on after her dive, the skeleton of a salmon dangles at the place 

where Viveca's head was. The reprise of the male voice at the end is sipnincant. His tone is now 

less authoritative, but he stül commands Viveca She attempts to foliow his instructions, but is 

confused. She rewmds the tape, reducing the voice to gibberish, and t starts again. She foUows 

the insvuctions as the lights go down, focusshg on the water at the bottom of the pooL 

Like Gemmi, where Viveca is at the begmning of the play and where she is at the end are 

not much diaerent. Although the taped voice is less sinister and she can control it by rewinding it, 

reducing it to gibberish, she still plays the tape again and foiIows the instructions. She is taking up 

a position at the end of the play simüar to the one at the beginning: the repetition of her role is not 

cited or repeated ironically, rather the serialized pattern of her actions is emphasized. The 

mechanisms of the control of Viveca have been reveaied, and have k e n  show to be constnrcted 

and themselves controllable, but it also appears as though Viveca has interaalized the voice. The 

agency which she is afEorded is iimited and as the final position shows, involves a repetition of 

subjectivity with only minor modifications. 
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In summruy, these two short plays show isolated women, controlled and constructed in 

their actions by male voices. Gemma and Viveca, within these reahs, resist through strategies 

which take up the discursive measures already present. Nonetheless, tbis agency is limited. The 

positions which the characters take up are not sipnincantly dEerent; rather they are serialized, 

repetitive, and continue to play out the same discursive constructions, as  they are dependent on 

shifting relations of power. 

These limitations of agency, however, are connected to the limitations of the concept of a 

self as a ked,  contained individual. Defined and limited by hierarchical interaction, binarist ways 

of positionhg the subject necessady maintain a cycle of domination and subordination of limited 

political eEect. The most interesthg impetus for change cornes in the ways in which a new mode1 

for ide- is suggested. Another kind of story-telling is impticit in the play which suggests a 

revisionhg of other narrative constructions of identity. The story, in some ways, is mold by 

theatrical devices which contrast with the dialogue. 

Ln The Apple in the Eye, for example, the point of intelligibility of the story is geared 

toward a reading which involves a constant awveness of at least two levels. The audience is pnvy 

to both the perception of the world as seen by Ge- and as ordered by Martin. This play was 

originally &en as a radio drarna, and therefore the interior monologues would be signaUed by a 

different tone of voice or by the proximity of the microphone. The stage version suggests that 

these differences in space and rnkd be realized through lighting effects: the lights dim when 

Martin and Gemma interact; they remain bright for Genwa's interior and imaginative moments. 

The dimensions of the worlds are closely deked and there are a few moments of overlap. The 

effect is a reaiization of identity as a constant movement, located between the dark and the light. 
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Ironically here the real world of Martlli is in dark whereas the h e r  unaginative world of Gemma 

is in üght. Gemma is shown in two worlds: her inner imaginative space and the outer external 

space in which she interacts with Martin. This binary ÏtseIf, however, is also destabilized. The way 

in which t is theatricdy signifiecl is dinèrent than one wouid norrnally expect. The b e r  world is 

brightly lit; it is not the usual da&, mysterious world of the unconscious. In this way, the audience 

is encourageci to be a part of the world of Gemma's imagination. And yet both worlds are equaliy 

"reai." They exist simultaneously and are juggled accordingly. 

In addition, the two worlds collide. The i m a g k y  world htnides on the external world. 

Martin splits the apple, and at the end of the play, Ge- imagines how he swdows it whole. 

This overlap defies the perfect containment of boundaries. The images of Ge= are messy: the 

bloody Marat, the corpulent Saskia, the applelspider scenario. The destabilizing effect may not 

corne about in the overt presentation of Germna's subversion so much as in the effect of the 

images and the interpretative task of the audience. As Ric Knowles says, 

Audiences are left, not with hard bright kernels of meaning, but with the exposed 
modes and mechanisms of the production of image and interpretation. ("The 
Dramaturpy" 230) 

Images are polyvalent. The apple is botb the mind of Gemma and the fiwt of Eve; the eye is how 

Gemma is perceived and perceives; it is also her '7," her sense of identity. The prismatic 

resonance of such images makes closure for the audience diaicult. Interrogation may wt occur on 

stage, in the circumstances of Ge- but it may occur in the work which the audience does as 

an interrogator of images, who is taunted, Iike Martin, with the possr'biiity of swallowing the apple 

whole. Mastery of meaning is disallo wed. 



Diving works in a simitar hhion A very short piece, there is h l e  thne or inclination to 

develop a psychologically mo tivated character or scenario. Viveca's limited subversion in the 

dialogue is counteracted by theatricai and imagistic interrogation which prevent the contriinment 

of identity. For example, there are several leveis of voice which interact in this play. Story-telling 

is emphasized and linked to the formation of identity. A male voice instructs Viveca to dive. 

Viveca also relates the stoties that her mother and her neighbour told her, instructing her where to 

live, and ho w to behave. Viveca herself descnis her continuation of that cycle. Her mother gave 

her a dog: 

VIVECA. . . . I called it dog. Dog corne here. Dog fetch. Dog jump. Over the 
bdcony, d o m  to the parking lot. [She luughs.] Dive dog! 

MALE VOICE. Dive Viveca! [She looks up feagWy.1 
WVECA. But he didn't. Dogs don't. (1 17) 

Viveca is associated with the images of the dog and the s h o n  m the play. She barks Lüce her dog 

and dives iike the salmon. The stage directions indicate: 

She dives. iights snap 08 BZackout. A spot roams mound the stage looking for 
her andfincis the skeleton of a salmon dangIing ut the Zevel where VrVECA's 
head was. A disembodied male voice sings "Oh For the Wings of a Dove. " (1 1 8) 

The transformation of Viveca is ironic. She is not able to be contained by any of the appellations 

which are given to her. She keeps coming back in slightly different guks. In the opening she is 

shown wearing an "absurd swimsuit decorated wilh maple Ieaves" ( 1  15); after her dive, she 

returns in a ciiffereut ensemble: "VIVECA enters bris& no longer wearing lemes. She wears a 

jaunty maple-leafpatterned swimsuit and carries the towel over her shoulder" (1 18). The image 

and the ending are ambiguous. On the one hand, the costume change signifies nothing but a 

superficial change in Viveca She is less fearful, more assured, but as 1 eadier indicate, she stül 
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follows directions. The leaves now have becorne a part of her suit; she is less fearfid, but perhaps 

also less resistant. She is intemaüzing her subjection. On the other hand, the dog/salmon/leaf 

imagery destabilize any essential concept of selt 

As in The Apple in f i e  Eye, mechanisms of resistance are found in the layering and 

multiplicity of identities which are presented. The potential for change is there; it is not, however, 

activated on the level of the character in the play. If any action is to be formd, it is to be found in 

the way in which the spectators must become actively involved in creating change themselves. 

There must be ways to stop the cycle. The nnal pose of Viveca is held: she has foiiowed the 

instructions and now stares at the bottom of the pool about to dive. 

These two short plays, then, present fende characters aione, who are quite Literally 

discursively controlled by male voice-overs. They are show in a senes of positions as subjects, 

which &ord them a certain lirnited agency, but do not substantially change the interactions which 

occur. There are, however, theamical and irnagist interrogations of the unity of the self: lightiug in 

llre Apple in the Eye, and voice in DNing, and images in both plays which are resinant to ciosure 

and containment. These kinds of interrogations encourage the interpretative mechanisms of the 

audience and irnply the potential for change in identity formation These wül be more M y  realized 

in later plays of Margaret Hohgsworth, particularly in the plays of Endangered Species. 

Wur Babies: iayers of story 

War Bubies is a work which is a mise en abyme, a complex play, which sustains an 

interest in identity as a site of ambiguity, most overtly in the depiction of dinerent versions of the 

main characters. The focus in this play is on the relationship of Esme, a playwright and Co lia, her 



journalist husband, and the Unminent biah of their child. Esme feels trapped by both her 

pregnancy and her relationship and h d s  release in writbg a play about herse& her husband, and 

the fiends who are on their way to see them This play also cornes to W, so that there are two 

version of Esme and Co lin to contend with.lg Identity as a site of ambigu* is sustained at both 

the micro and the macro levels of narrative in this play. 

Ln the fïrst level of re*, the constm&g fiction of Wm Babies, the roles that Esme 

takes up prove to be tmatidktory. She is already a mother, but she gave up her fist son Craig at 

the age of three because she was unable to care for him. Although the end of the play sees the 

binh of her new child, a daughter, and a rather utopic reunion with her son, now seventeen, there 

is stül a note of foreboding. The daughter is, after dl, named Cassandra, and perhaps her wamings 

are once again not king heeded. There is no reason to believe that the same cycle of birth and 

abandonment rnight not occur. Again, the positions of Esme as subject are seriaijzed; she takes up 

certain standpoint positions as the situation demands. These positions prove to be temporarily 

effective, but then they are surnrnady dropped as a new discursive situation and construction of 

herseif as subject arises. 

The positions which Esme takes up are not as confinhg and as apparently oppressive as 

the positions of the f e d e  characters in the plays of Judith Thompson. Where Judith Thompson 

works in extremes, Margaret Hollingsworth attends to subtleties and nuance. Esme is equal to her 

husband; he supports her emotiody and in her career. Their liberal values are, however, put into 

question: Coi& while on assignment in a war zone, killed a young boy. The event is never cleady 

l9 In this section the play within the play wiii be desigoated as PWP, as Hoiîingsworth does 
in her script. The characters witbin this play will be designatecl as Esme2 and Colin2. 



remembered or realized; it represents an uoanswerable scenario. Where are Lnmts drawn? At what 

point justification? At what point truth? 1s there any stronghold which cannot be spoken, filtered, 

explaineci away? These questions are reminiscent of Butler's remarks on the discursive 

construction of bodies and gender. In Butler's attempts to define materiality, she emphasizes the 

"effect of power" which materiality generates: "'Materiality' appears only when its status as 

contingently constituted through discourse is erased, concealed, covered over. Material@ is the 

dissimulated effect of po wer" (25 1 a 1 2). It is important to emphasize the realization of 

materiality through discourse. This fluctuation between realms is explored in War Babies. These 

distinctions are important because these indicators signal a different process of identity formation: 

one which is contingent on the "as if" mode of story-telüng, but is in a constant motion with the 

constitutive outside which always marks its existence. 

The fluctuation of power relations which contriiutes to a destabilized iden* is 

foregrounded through the rnetaphor of war. Esme and Colin are aiways in a dynamic of 

opposition: they play at war. Both their jobs involve words. Their dialogue is a sparring match of 

games of songs and words. Early in the play Esme cails for a mce: 

ESME. . . . Listen--can't we can the war games? 
COLIN. What? 
ESME. Can't we make out without playing games? I mean--we're grown up 

mummies and daddies now. When the kid cornes- 
COLIN. We'U roast him and feed him to the poor. You can write about t .  
ESME. Not such a swifr idea . . . (1 5 1) 

Here garne-playing is again used as  a device in Hohgsworth to foreground the discursive 

construction of subjectivity. Erne herseIf cannot let go of the competitive pun m a h g  and 
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responds to Colin's allusion to Jonathan Swift's A Modest Proposul. S he herseif initiates the war 

of words which defines their existence. 

Words signe their link, but a h  their diffkrences. C o h  is a newspaper jounialist, 

reporting, and distorting reality: T v e  spent half my He recording history," he says (1 58). 

Recordmg history is a line which r e m  in Poppycock in a scene in Picasso's studio. While 

Picasso paints, Dora pho tographs the audience repeating, "Recording histo ry. Recording histo ty. 

Recoding history. Recoduig" (66). History as a tenuous transmission of questionable fàcts is an 

ongoing concem in Hohgswortk This obsession extends to story-telling about personal history 

as well. Esme accuses Colin of distorting reaiity, of obscuring the fàcts in order to seil a a o v  

when she fhds out that he kiued a young boy in order to get a story in the Sudan But Esme also 

distorts ''truth." The piay she is writing is based on their lives; it becomes intemvined with the 

%al" Esme and Coiin scenes Esme has also been responsible for the abandonment, ifnot death, 

of her fkst child, Craig, who now appears as the cMd/soldier in her play, who guards Colin2 in 

prison. Thus Esme also is not without implication Dorothy Parker discusses the merging of the 

two worlds: Esrne asks her fiiends about the peacocks which only occur in the play world; she 

mentions to her son that she thought he was the poiiceman fiom the PWP (108). Parker 

comments: 

The mingbg here of two kinds of r e m  is reminiscent of AUi's monologues in 
Alli Alli Oh by the intercontamination of realism and surreaiisrn. Hoüingsworth is 
warning the audience not to reduce either piay to over-simple formulations. (108) 

Not only can neither 'keality" be reduced, but they exkt smiultaneously. The effect of Esme 

introducing dissonant information into the PWP is w t  to suggest that she is crazy or that she is 



I l 7  

wrong. Rather it simply shows how she is alternatively constructed in a different situation. Tmth 

is not to be settled on because identity, iike tnith, is constructed contingentiy. 

Esme &ds a limited agency in her attempts to counteract the discursive authorities which 

construct subjects by creatively dispershg found texts into poetry. She uses news stories of Colin 

and creates "Media Mumbles," not only a reference to Colin's profession, but also a larger 

indication of the pervasive CO nstmiting presence of all kmds of 'Wormation." Esme rewrites 

sections of Doctor Spock. Her acts are aggressive as she attempts to emphasize the rigid 

definitions that these kinds of wntings dernand of seif and other. By breakhg up the words, she is, 

in a raw sense, achieving the kind of effect that Barthes does in a book like SIZ, in hk 

demonstration of the polyvalence of Here is a Merent kind of agency then, one that 

demands an active participation in the discursive constructions of identity and a 'WJfi~l act," as 

the title of this collection of Hollingsworth's plays prociaims. W i  this title there is the double 

meaning of a 'W act" which implies a transcendent se& and the 'W act" which recognizes 

the discursive construction of the "acts" within the plays themselves. 

There is a double dynamic in this play. Although the discursive is artfully recognized and 

reminded, strong reactions are provoked. When Colin catches part of a public re&g on his 

return fiom a trip, he is appded at the license Esme has taken with his work. They argue, and he 

reacts violently: he throws a chair, narrowly missing her. Colin's violent ration is fkught with 

pain. He does not want to act the way he is acting, yet the dynamic in which they are caught leads 

hUn into such a reaction. Colin rings Esme at home to see how she's dohg; she tells him that 

In 92, Barthes meticulously classifies each phrase of Balzac's Srnasine to dernonstrate 
the layers of meanhg which resonate within the text. 



Craig has arrived. He arrives home only to find that Esme has tricked him into coming: 'We's here 

now," she says. She mbs her stomach: '9n this room" (207). Colin again reacts in tumioil; the 

positions he is king asked to assume leave him conflicteci: 

COLIN. You ... you're sufEocathg me, you know that? Years, years I've spent 
trying to be ... I dumio, trying to be some kind oc-Rhett Butler to please 
you-don' t laugh! 

ESME. [Overlapping. ] Frankly darling 1 don't give a d m !  Sorry, 1 couldn't 
resist ... 

COLIN. [ûver[apping.] So what am I supposed to be. Some androgynous 
fl-? 1s that it? Yes ma'arn, no m'am, may 1 borrow your panties 
m'am! Why don% you make up your mind what you want? 

ESME. 1 want you. 
COLIN. And I don't want to blurr the edges any more ... 1 have to work 

dammit. It's women who have kids, not men And why do you have to 
make me sound like a wallang cliche ... ? (207-208) 

C o h  and Esme are caught in a dynamic of subjectlobject, of heterosexual roles, which no matter 

how hard they try to d e  things e q d ,  end up king determinedly cornpetitive and function on a 

level of domination and subordination. 

This play demonstrates the tension of mastery and non-mastery in the depiction of identity. 

Esme attempts to master the fiction: not only does she create the P WP which is an imaginative 

counterpoint to her lived experience, but she also manipulates the central action. As we have seen, 

she lies and beckons Colin home. She distorts the truth. Perhaps the criticism which is levelled at 

W m  Bubies for its overreachmg complexity (Parker 1 12) results from its refusal to provide 

simple, satisfactory answers. The mise en abyme of a play about a piaywight writing a play about 

a playWright writing a play is dizying. The play within the play is extremely melodramatic and 

critics have noted its ''soap opera" tendencies (Zhnerman 120). But as a form it is countered by 

the many other kinds of wnting and shaping reaiity which exist in the play: Colin's o wn 
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newspaper reporting, the other plays of Esme, and her own foray into poetry making. Each has its 

own place and signincance and mornentary way of m a h g  sense and each is problematized for the 

inevitable ways in which it distorts ''tnrth." By flipping f?om genre to genre, the play heightens the 

con- of f o m ,  and the different effects such shapings have on the viewing experience of the 

audience. Ahhough the play does not corne to a final resolution, it acknowledges, as Colin2 says, 

the need for containment or for resolution, whether it be in aory or in love: 

COLIN2. . . . You think you're in love--you try to narrow t down, you pin 
everything on one person--you put four walls around t. It's a fàntasy - you 
can't contain it. It's a htasy, we're always trying to contain ... look for 
limits. Without lunits we go mad, don't we? (177) 

The two plays end extremely dinerently. In the PWP, Esme2 robs a bank and sets up her husband 

for the crime. He is beaten, and taken away to prison. Irnmediately following this scene cornes the 

resolution of the play proper. The "real" Barbara and Jack and Craig. The play ends in the 

momentary and iargely unexplained reconciliation of Esme and her children: she embraces Craig, 

shows hmi her new daughter, arid draws paraUeIs between the appearances of her two children: 

"Like hia Like me. You have our fiice" (223). On this note of arnbiguity the play ends. In this 

way, Holhgsworth ironicdy unifies the very different d e s t a t i o n s  of identiw. This play is very 

cornplex in t s  approach, particdarly in the alternative narrative constructions it offers. It 

undertakes an extensive breadth of issues. This makes it confusing, perhaps, and even dramatically 

lethargic because of Uiis impulse to tackle so mmy ponderous issues. In so doing, it rnay, as 

Parker suggests, ru. the risk of losing its spectators. This is endemic to the postmodem condition: 

at what point are the spectators so confused, so lost, so destabilized that they stop making sense 

or, as is the case in many of Judith Thompson's plays, they are a c W y  alienated from the 
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drarnatic action? This is certainly a concem in a consideration of Hohgsworth's provocative 

plays because so few of them are produced or weil-received. This issue will be addressed in more 

detaü in a discussion of spectator pleasure in the conclusion. 

Alfi AIIi Oh, Islands and ln Confidence 

Situated Subjects 

These next plays by Margaret Holhgsworth articulate possibilities for identity formation 

for a lesbian within a patriarchal society. Al l i  All i  Oh and IsIandr are cornpanion pieces and will 

be considered together. In Confidence is a more recent work in which Holhgsworth tackles an 

often unconsidered topic: the sexuality of older women. 

Al l i  Al l i  Oh and Islands consider the Iives of Alli and Muriel and their troubled 

relationship. In A U  Alli  Oh, AUi was d e d  for years; we find out she met Muriel in a mental 

institution when Muriel's former lover, Barbara, was admitted. The implications extend to 

sexuality: the lesbian in a patriarchal society is represented as mentally unstable. The 

schizophrenic split of living in two places at once is too much; she is iiterally an "eccentric" 

subject whose language cannot be spoken or heard within the patnarchy. 

The limits of such a subject are obvious: agency is practicdy nonexistent. We k d  out in 

Islanh that after AUi goes to the mental institution for a second the ,  (at the end ofAlli AlIi Oh 

she leaves the fàrm in a state of distress), she is &en shock treatment. In Islunds, she and Muriel 

are not able to resolve the5 ciifferences. Muriel is f k d y  able to corne out to her mother who is 

visiting Muriel on the eve of her second marriage. The articulation of her lesbianism is M y  

achieved in a more public way, and yet the possibilities for action and change are limited on this 



discursive level. AUi leaves the island again, this time wÎth Rose. Muriel's mother. Muriel is left 

alone on the Girm, retuming to the plans she has for her new house. AiE and Muriel are unable to 

fùnction in a relationship together; certainly the traditiod masculine and femlliine roles that they 

assume do not serve them well. In Bodies n2al Matter, Judith Butler discusses the possibilities for 

a self-conscious performance to destabilize gender roles: 

Performativity desm'bes t h  reiationship of king implicated in that which one 
opposes, this tuming of power against itself to produce alternative modaüties of 
power, to establish a kind of political contestation that is not a "pure" opposition, 
a '?ranscendence" of contemporary relations of power, but a dficuit labor of 
forging a future from resources inevitably impure. (241) 

[n this revisiting of a heterosexual paradigm in AIZi AIli Oh, however, a subjectlobject dynamic is 

stiU in place. It is inevitably cornpetitive and hierarchical and leaves M e  room for substantial 

change in the institutions or society. There is no parody or distancing in a butcwfemme dynamic 

in their relationship. 

In Confidence, a much later play, considers the possibility of a lesbian relationship 

between two older women. Hollingswoah deliberately sets out to explore the sexuaüty of middle- 

aged women: "a territory that bas been pretty weL unexplored on stages for the last two thousand 

years" as Hollingsworth says in the introduction (9). Although the women teii their stories 

separately, they do 'hierge slowly, in the fkgmented, digressive style that women's storytehg 

oflen takes" (9). A g a  Holhgsworth unabashedly sets out to explore a specific kind of d g  

and experience. 

In Conjdence uses strategies of realisrn in its attunement to nuances of accent and 

chamcter. The lives of the two women are given great deta& as their husbands and descriptions of 

events complement each other. Their story-tehg gradually unfolds the hidden complexities of 
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their desires in their lives and for each other, but also constructs the Lmiits of their abdity to meet 

each other. Each character is staged in her own area. Although suggestions are given for how one 

or the odier echoes or responds to the other's words, each monologue is located in its own ngid 

space. The monologues are told sequentially. The two characters do not speak with each other. 

Rather, they are described and created by their own words. This staging technique dernonstrates 

both their isolation and their desire. Each is m a heterosexuai relationship; they harbour feelings 

for each other which they reveal through the course of their monologues, but they are unable to 

realize these physicdy. At the end of the play, the letter fiom one to the other remains literally 

unanswered. They are unable to be brought together in the physical staging of the play and 

therefore remain alone. 

In this way, Holüngsworth demonstrates the constrictions which are present in their 

current cofigurations as subjects. What is signincant about each of the monologues is the senes 

of stories they tell about thernselves, and thereby the series of positions they take up. But their 

ability to efect change is Limited. The worId they enter when they find each other is conveyed by 

the image of the hothouse. At Marianna's suggestion they buy vibtors. They hurry with their 

nedound purchases to the hothouse, teii each other their secret masturbatory practices; they 

experience their sexuality pubiicly. It is here and not within the realms of their homes where they 

can fïnd such fi-eedom At home, Chrissie has to think a long time before she decides where to 

hide her vibrator. The most private of places still does not accormm>date her desires. Explorations 

must be made outside the home, outside the realm of the known and the fiidkir. 



Identity Destabüized 

The destabilization of identity again cornes in the ways in which stories are told. The 

fluctuation between the différent plays and worlds of Wur Bubies results in an unstable sense of 

identity. In AlZi Alli Oh and Islands, there is a simüar underminhg of coherence in the use of 

images and metaphors. One of the images which recurs in Hoilingsworth's dramas is the image of 

the house as a structure which constnicts identÎty. In Al[i Alli Oh, the tiirmhouse is in a state of 

disrepair. There is not even electrkity. At the beginnmg of the play, AUi and Muriel are making 

p h  to excavate the lot and build a new home. But as the play progresses, it becomes O bvious 

that AUi is not ready to give up the pst, to tear down a house which still affords a certain kind of 

shelter and security. Similarly she does not relsiquish her own psychological paradigm; at the end 

of the play, she calls the psychiatrie hospital to readmit herseK When the relationship is reprised 

in Idandi, which takes place some six mon& Iater, Muriel is in the process of rebuilding the 

house. The play opens with Muriel in the process of assembling a drawing board in order to be 

able to work properly on the blueprints for the ho use. Her mother adrnonishes her ambition: 

ROSE. You can't build a house. m L  continues to work] Not on your 
own. 

MURIEL. I 'Il get help. If 1 need it. 
ROSE. Your grandfàther built our house. It nearly killed him. Look at your 

hands. [Puuse.] I'm oot against hard work. I've worked hard all my Me. 
[Points ut the blueprinf-] That's man's work. [Longpause. MURIEL 
works.] (122) 

Muriel does not directly conftont her mother, but the evidence of the house in partial construction 

expresses the process of restructuring that she is undertaking and undergoing. At the end of the 

play, Muriel is lefi by bot. her mother and AUi. Alone she wül continue the process of self- 

construction as she returns to putting together her desk. 



The image of the house is one of the sites of contradiction and ambiguity which 

characterize the plays of Margaret Hoilingsworth. It both provides shelter and yet proves 

confining for its inhabitants. The two women in In Confidence are depicted in their homes, their 

kitchens. As Hollingswotth says in her introduction: 

I am writing about isolation-the isolation of women who become invisible in their 
late 40s-the isolation of women who have been in long-tem relationships, of 
wives and mothers who feel it is important to honour these relationships and who 
don't know how to look outside for extra support and sustename. Chrissie and 
Marianna are marooned-cocooned in their separate kitchens three thousand miles 
spart- (9) 

Signincantty the men find space within these houses for their own sins and secrets. Chrissie's 

husband, it becomes clear, was abusing their daughter when she was young and lived at home. 

Marianna's husband dresses up in her clothes. This is part of the reason they move to Vancouver, 

to put distance between Marianna and Chrissie, and also to put distance between Marianna's 

husband and his secrets now found out by the police department where he worked. Although they 

hava come to resolutions regardmg theu behaviour, neither cm sustain it. Marianna catches her 

husband at home. But Marianna's solution is to accept the way thmgs are: ''John Crow," she says, 

their secret word for enough is enough: 

MAMANNA. . . . We've made enough adjusmients, 1 said. Let's go back to 
how it was. We c m  keep it to ourselves, nobody hows  us. What we had 
we have still. You don't have to change for me, you don't have to give it 
up for me. . . . (53) 

Marianna recognizes and accepts their senial explorations. She has just come from watching a 

pomographic movie. She cornes home to see him watching the same one in her underwear. But 

Gus' response to Marianna is to screarn his desire for n o d c y ,  accusing her of king a "'lepie 

whore"' (53). 



Marianna's monologue is delivered as she sands a door on two sawhorses in the kitchen. 

In the final scene of the play, there is a combined essentiaüst/deconstnictive move. On the one 

han& Marianna peels off the accoutrements which constnict her, as she reveals her inner self. 

Marianna peels off the gloves she's been wearing to protect her bands. She even peek off her 

fiilse nails and drops her rings. On the other hand, her actions also result in a bleeding of space. 

She c h b s  on the door and recites an imaghary letter to Chrissie: 

MARIANNA. Dear Mks Sabatini 
[She kicks off one shoe. It fails in CHRIS S E  's space. She shuts her eyes. ] 

Life's too short to be timid. Dear Chrissie. 1 hate this house. 
[She kicks offher other shoe.] 1 hate this house, 1 hate this room, I hate this 

door. 
[She peels off her beauty spot.] 1 hate his fucking sculpture. 1 hate his stupid 

sweatsuit, and his Adidas and his eighteen speed bike. 
[She pulls out the puddingfom her bru and throws it into CHRISSIE's 

space.] Dear Chrissie. 1 hate baving to s d e .  Keeping it in. Keepiug it in. 
Everyone fearing to touch. Keeping it in. Keeping it in. Everyone keeping 
it in. Insulate and preserve. Insulate and preserve. Insulate and fuckiog 
preserve. Fucking dumiflum siding. I hate t .  1 hate who he wants to be. I 
love him. 1 hate - I'm gonna smash your &ce in, John Crow. 

[She throws her skirt inro CHRISS IE 's space, stamps on the door, 
communicating with the basement, and begins to dance]. (54-55) 

Marianna's vehement expression is paired with Chrissie's action: she throws her now folded 

laundry up into the air. Mariaiuia's fàux striptease is liberating in its disclosure of the construction 

of her femininity. The scene ends on this note of possible eeedom, and yet the ending is 

ambiguous: she is attaçhed to Chrissie and she says of her husband: '7 hate who he wants to be. 1 

love him" (55). Substantial changes are possible, in the utopic gesture of both women literally 

throwing off the trappings of their roles, and yet we do not see the results of such a change. 
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Marianna yeUs the last iine, ' M e  ne fiega!'"' (55). Again, Ït is an ambiguous note, implying both 

fieedom and indifference. 

The real changes do not happen on stage; the possibility of a difEerent formation of identity 

rests with the experience of the audience. This is suggested agah by the form of the play with 

spaces and dialogue which alrnost overlap. A lesbian desire is not accommodated for within these 

plays other than in an exclusionary mode: in the hothouse, off stage, outside, in public. The play 

takes the audience through the story-telling of Marianna and Chrissie. It is in an imaginative re- 

t e h g  tbat other possible stories and identities can be told. 

En dangered Species 

The plays in this collection, The House thal Jack BuiZr, It 's Only Hot for Two Months in 

Kapuskasing, Poppycock, and Prim, DucL Muma, and Frank are four short experimental ph-. 

These plays wiil be considered in more detail to d o w  for an in depth consideration of narrative 

techniques which are more ciistinctly postmodern and which elaborate on a significantly different 

conception of idemity. 

The House thaî Jack Buill and It's Only Hot for Two Months in Kapuskasing: narrative and 
counter-narrative 

The metaphor of the h o w  also occurs in the est two plays of the collection Endungered 

Species. The House that Jack BuiZt and It 's Only Hot for Two Months in Kapuskming are meant 

to be presented together (10). Considered as cornpanion pieces, they comment on each other by 

21 HoUingsworth notes that the closest translation to this expression is 'T don? give a 
damn" or 'hothing matters" (56). 



presenting stories and subjects which are foregrounded and contesteci. The representation of the 

women in these two plays is similar: in both plays, relationships with men prove confining, 

constricting, and oppressive on the level of content. A substantial différence is apparent in the 

fomis of the two plays, however. Jack's story of hir rehtionship with Iermy is paralleileci by the 

house that he builds to contain her. Jenny's attempt to use hguage as a means of escape is ody 

temporary. Her position as a subject is ody momentady disrupted; her rebeiiion is easily 

containeci by Jack's discourse. In contrast, the destabikhg narrative techniques in It 's Oniy Hot 

for Two Months in Kapuskasing ailow for an interrogation of the constitution of subjectivity. 

M e r  options of ways of king become avaihble when the narrative Unpulse is relinquished and 

the confines of the house are challenged. 

The House that Jack Buili fluctuates back and forth between overt diegesis, the t e h g  of 

the events, and mimesis, th& enactment. Jack builds the house, and he also t e k  the story: as the 

primary ~arrating agency, he controls the events. By conforrning to a vaditionai structure, he 

co~lstructs Jemy's subjectivity: 

JACK. . . . So 1 buiit her a house. 1 mean, what more can a man do for his 
d e ?  You meet a girL It's too soon High schooi, but what can you do 
when she's the right one. Chew on your nails? Jerk yourself off? No. You 
buy her a ring, right? You buy her a ring, and then you marry her. You do 
it right. You work for her, and you just have to hope she doesn't get 
herselfpregnant before you've got her a house. That's the way it is. I mean 
you teil me ditferenty don't matter who you are. There's no other way 
when you corne right down to it. 

JENNY. There' s no other way. (1 2) 

Jack aligns himseif with a master narrative; he positions himself and Jenny within a heterosexual 

patriarchal middle class  mat^ His narrative symbolicaliy encodes gender ciifference. In addition, 

he interpellates, with his use of a universal "you,'' a spectator who is also heterosexual and male. 



Jenny has htenialized Jack's construction of her and has limitai agency. She constantiy 

censors her own attempts at narration. Early in the play she t e k  a story about Jack's canoe trip. 

He brought her back a thermos containing ice off an iceberg: 

JENNY. We put it m our beer and it h e d !  But how did he know there was 
icebergs here back then? How did he know there was oxygen? 20,000 
years ago? Jack! ! [Reaches out for JACK blindly. ] 

JACK Hey, hey babe. (14) 

Jenny panics at her incapacity before a history and knowledge which Jack seems to have access to 

and that she does not. The play takes us on a retrospective tour and demonstrates how Jenny was 

created as a subject accommodated to Jack's narrative. Jenny's desire does not seem to have a 

place in this story. She does not want to build a house, and her atternpts at intervening in the 

narrative are simply not heard: 

JENNY. What about a basement? 
JACK. You want a basement? 
JENNY. It's too wet for a basement. 
JACK. You want a basernent you'll get a basement. 
JENNY. Don't ail houses bave basements? 
JACK. If that's what you want, you'll have one. AU you gotta do is just say 

what you want. 
JENNY. 1 wanna stay on Queen. 
JACK You just gotta say the word. Basement. (12-13) 

Questions are queiled, and Jenny's desire-to stay downtown-4s bowled over in the 

predetermined building of the house and the story. 

Jenny attempts to assert some kind of control by tuming to her own body. She descnis  

how she privately binges and purges, how she fin& a job at Canadian Tue, how she obsessively 

shoplifts sponges at Shopper's Dmg Mat, how she attempts to sleep alone. But these serialized 

actions do not subvert Jack's narrative, or stop the building of the house. They provide only 



temporary agency. Jack describes how he went to watch ber once: 'Tt was Iüce watchin a manger 

or somethin" (17). Despite these attempts to 6nd a way of behg with Jack which atfords ber more 

choices, she is stiU confined to his story. Sexuality will be contained in the narrative. When the 

house is buüt, Jewy starts sleeping done on the futon in the P e s t  room, with a poster of Meryl 

Streep on the w d .  Jack intervenes: 

JACK. . . . I took it down and hung it in OLU room. If she wanted to sleep with 
Meryl Streep that was okay with me, but I didn't see why I should be lefi 
out of the action, right? (20) 

AU Jenny can do is stare straight ahead and say, "1 love you" (20). 

Finally a means of resistance is found within the very narrative that Jack creates: although 

the terrain where the house is built has been cleared of all its original species, some come back. 

Jenny hears a "noise" early in the play which Jack identifies as '%ggin fiogs" (12). In the course 

of the play, just as  the house is a metaphor for Jack's story, the fiogs function as a means of 

resistance to that story. With this ‘boise" Jenny h d s  a way of resisting. Jack clears away the 

fiogs when he starts to build the house, but eventually they come back. Jenny h d s  a new 

language when she joins a campaign to save the species who have been endangered by the 

subdivision. 

Her resistance to the narrative is palpable now. It changes her ianguage. She even refuses 

the narrative trajectory of the sentence: "A fiog. Does not. Drink up. The pond. In which he Lives" 

(20). She takes up the battle cry of the campaigo; her remarks contrast with Jack's hes:  

JACK. . . . It was somethmg to do with frogs. 
JENNY. Save the kogs! 
JACK. She got real excited. 
JENNY. The fiogs didn't come back that fest spring. 
JENNY. [Yells, full voice. ] Save the frogs! (20) 



Jenny's ferninist conscioumess is raised. A new language and resistance are found in a community 

of women who are campaigning for the fiogs. The women begin to change Jack's story; they 

invade the house, 'Then I'd corne home and there'd be ail these women in rubber b o t s  in our 

kitchen" Jack says, and later, "And I'd come home and there'd be all these women leavin coffee 

rings on my oak finish" (20-21). W h  Jack!" says Jenny now able to djsmiss him, endowed with a 

new knowledge and power (30-21). She doesn't even laugh at his jokes anymore. 

Although the fkogs give  MY a new voice, she is not quite ready for the repercussions of 

her new engagement. The words of Audre Lorde resonate: "the master's tools will never 

dismantle the master's house" (99). The frogs function also as a "constitutive outside"; this 

outside temtory is easily recuperated. When the fiogs do come back, they b ~ g  chaos. "Just a 

few of them at fim. Cute little green ones," says Jack (22). Then they rnove into the kitchen, and 

then the living r o o a  When Jenny retums fiom a visit to Kapuskasing, Jack narrates the fiogs' 

invasion while J e ~ y  appears to us in the tirne of the story: 

JACK. 1 told her they were in all the cupboards, in the sink ... when you sat on 
the toilet ... 

JENNY. Where? Where? 
JACK. I told her they were in the bedroom. They were jumpin and crawlin aii 

over Meryl Streep's k e .  They were in the IEggin bed. [Jumps tu his feet.] 
The whole fiiggin house is overrun! The whole m e t !  [Jenny screams.] 
Like a slimey green mg, heavin under your feet- and when you walk on it 
you feel it squelch ... you feel it under your feet, and then you're up to your 
knees in it and then it 's up to your chin. They're on your shoulders, in your 
ears ... they're takh over! It's fiogs. Your &ggin fiogs! 

JENNY. Do somethi-i-i-i-ng ! I hate hem! Kiu them! Kill them! Kiil them! Kü1 
them! Kill them! Ki-i-i-i-i-ill! (22) 

The fiogs presumably take over, in Jack's description, invading even the body. Jemy's outburst 

resolves the story complications, because she returns to Jack's narrative, to his control of the 
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kational and the excessive. M e n  the Li&ts come up after the fiog story, the imagined house and 

the pregnancy mentioned at the beginning of the story are realized in Jack's narration of the 

present situation: 

JACK. 1 decided against a lawn. 1 put down grave1 and cedar chips. The weeds 
go through so 1 kept a bunch of \veedkiller in the garage. It's not hard to 
control them if you get the right stuE (23) 

n e  fiogs, iike the weeds, although potentially disruptive, are for the moment d e l y  d e r  

control. 

A great revolution is not at hand for Jenny, but the potenhl for subversion is there. By 

discoverhg the nodes of contradiction or instability, changes ca .  be made, fiom within the 

narrative, but only EJenny is w i h g  to contend with a disrupted narrative and potential chaos. 

Whether the fiogs come back or not is a moot point. It  is Jack's t e h g  of the story that creates 

the chaos. His enforcement of the narrative is not necessarily the only way to resolve the story; 

change is possible, as Hoihgsworth suggests in her introduction to Endurzgered Species: 

Jack . . . codd grow, but ody if his wife J ~ M Y  were to show him the way. He is 
caught in a web of expectations, he is a man and he must perfionn as men are 
supposed to perfom Jemy may succeed in changing things in t he ,  but the 
question of how much time we have hovers in the background. (7-8) 

The solution, of course, is not for Jenny to pertomi as a Wornan, but for both performances of 

gender to be recognized as such, and through a revisioning of the possibilities for identity which 

reconfigures the seWother dynamic and subject/object relating. In order for this to occur, it is 

implied that narrative structures must also change to d o w  for dEerent formations of identity. 

Clearly Hoüingsworth is not advocating chaos. She continues in her introduction: 



The characters are searching to introduce order into their everyday lives to help 
them make sense of the situations in which they fhd themselves. It is too 
Eghtening to abandon this search. (8) 

What she does suggest k that there must be a different way of atraining that order. h the 

cornpanion piece, It 's On& Hotfor Two Months in Kapuskasing, Hollingsworth creates a 

difEerent kind of narrative which ais0 oners potential for a different kinds of identity. 

Unlike The Howe that Jack Built, lt 's Only Hot for Two Month in Kapuskasing provides 

no mifjhg narrative structure, no overt house which is buiit, and the result is fiightening indeed. 

Order and sense are constantly undemiined. The play tums on an enigma; it concems a womui 

who bas been called in the midde of the night to vist a fiiend who is seemingly involved m a 

domestic dispute: 'Tisten, ifhe doesn't kili me fkst 1'11 kül him" (27). The play opens with the 

cross-examination of the Visitor: 

VISITOR. [In a tighr spot. She is being cross-exumined.] She shoddn't've 
woke me up. My God, I didn't even have t h e  to dress properly. It was her 
voice. It sounded so weird ... i called a cab . . . 1 didn't know the address--1 
don't know the East E n d 4  mean 1 got no reason to go there have I? 
[Glances across at the kitchen.] (27) 

The lights corne up on the characters, the story begins, taking us back in the .  Something has 

gone wrong, but we're not exactly sure what. The Visitor is uncertain, she doesn't know the 

address. As the story progresses, events are filled in. Not in a linear tàshion as in The House thut 

Jack Buiit, but in a piecemeal marmer. The women know each other fiom before, from 

Kapuskasing; they are now in Vancouver; they met in an art gdery and in a w e k e  line. Events 

in the present are equdy ambiguou. The women tallc, have coffee, eat trifie, dance, smoke, and 

cty. Gerry and the Man embrace; the Visitor gives the boy some money and jumps out the 

window. The logic behind the events is suppressed. 



Whereas Jack d o h t e d  the narrative in The Home that Jack Built, here the Man is dent 

for most of the play. His fim line cornes at mid-point: 'That's a lie," he says, in response to 

Gerry's suggestion tbat he doesn't speak Engkh (36). In the absence of a totalizing narrative' the 

characters are capable of negotiating new, if temporary, subjectivities. The fieedom, for example, 

seerns to extend to sexuality. The Visitor muses, in her inner voice, "She's not as pretty any more. 

StiU has those Mick Jagger iips though. Cracks. Little sexy cracks" (28). And Gerry, in her turn, 

makes a move to seduce the Visitor. She wants to dance the tango: "Think of yourselfas Tina 

Turner," she says, "&y, I haven't daoced with a woman since 1 was in high schooPt (3 9-40). But 

the possibilities don't end there. The Visitor is also attracted to the Maa They hold eye contact 

which Gerry has to break. At the end of the play, Gerry and the M a .  throw chemes at each other; 

they smash and smear trifie until the situation becomes erotic, and the Visitor is implicated in the 

triangle: 

[. . . M A N  stanak behind GERRY, puts his arms around her waist, n d e s  her 
ne& and bites her ear. GERRY licks the spoon] 

MAN. [Speaking into GERRY's neck; Zooking at VISITOR.] So, are you 
gonna let me squash your cherry? 

GERRY. [Turning on VISITOR] You gonna stare at us ail night you little 
whore? (44-45) 

The Visitor stumbles backwards into the bedroom, where the Boy is watching TV. Feeling sorry 

for him, she drops some money into his lap. His one line packs a punch, ''1 corne fiee," he 

responds (45). These sexual encounters are stylized, atmost parodied. We can see them king 

enacted, and the identity of the characters becomes the effects of those roles. But the Visitor k d s  

the proliferation of possibilities for identity overwhelming: she escapes by jumping out the 



window. Whereas Jemy aies to counter the nanative in The Home thal Jack Buill, the Visitor is 

10% and confiised without one. Uninitiated to the language garne, she has limited power. 

The Visitor opens and closes the play by standing ir? a tight spot, test- before the law. 

It is as  though she is called to account for her actions. How do they measure up against the Iaws, 

which detemime exactIy what can and what cannot be done? What ifbehaviour is not accounted 

for withm a master narrative? The play doesn't provide the sec* of answers, nor does it offer 

stability of identity. The m e s  of Visitor, the Man and the Boy are no t stated. And Gerry, the 

wornan who presumably put in the call, who started the story, who, more than anyone else, calls 

the shots in the narrative, is sometirnes referred to as Hamiet. Her identity is in question, as the 

Visitor's comments reveal: 'iThat story they used to tell back in Kap--she once cut herselfup- 

there was so many stories about her--" (29). And later, "Now thaî 1 knew her 1 started to listen to 

the gossip about her . . . . everyone had a dinerent çtory" (35). At the end of the play, the Visitor 

describes how her bowend, M d e d ,  responds when she telephones him for help: 

WSITOR. . . . And he said stay there, I'il be right over. I'U take a cab. And I 
said, yeah, that's what you better do. I'U be waiting--1'U be nght here--and 
I couid tell, there was something in my voice--there was sornething in my 
voice Your Honour. (45) 

The end of the story is a paradigrnatic replacement of the opening, now the Visitor has 

"something" in her voice, lü<e Gerry did at the beginning. Unlike in The House that Jack Built, the 

story syntagm is not completely enclosed or contained; there is no resolution. Subjectivities are 

shifted, not afnrmed. The Visitor takes up Gerry's position by making a call for help; M d e d  

takes up the Visitor's position by responding to the urgency in her voice and taking a cab. The 



ending puts into question the ''tntth" we've been hearing, the "enigIM" we've been trying to 

resolve, the subjects we've k e n  attempting to create. 

ui su-, then, these two plays, particularly when considered together, demonstrate 

subjects which are constructed through narrative. There is a need for some kind of narrative 

control in order to be able to speak and act effectively. And yet there is a double bind. Speaking 

within a traditional narrative structure involves subjugation to the d e s  of the discourses and 

accommodation to a position of çubject which implies a mastery over an object. Jenny is unable to 

corne up with another way of reacting to the chaos of the fiogs which she unieashes, and which 

Jack turns on her. She reverts to a kind of mastery: "Kill the-" she screams (22). When there is a 

proliferation of narratives and several possible identities, as in It S Onl'y Hot for Two Months in 

Kapuskasng, the ensuing hgmentation is overwhelming, and there is still an accounting which 

must be made within the master narrative: the Visitor is cded before a judge or some kind of 

authority at the begmning and the end of the play in which she rnust make sense, assign blame, 

take responsibility. The implication here is that neither option is viable: not restrictive controlied 

narrative, nor a cornplete rejection of fonn and order. 

What these two plays do demonstrate, then, is identity as a site of ambiguity. It is this 

destabilized identity-in-process which provides the impetus to change. The plays interpellate the 

spectators at the level of the macrostnicture. The form of the play again plays a significant role in 

the interpretation of the process of identity formation. The House that Jack Buik is not only 

nanated by Jack but is also ~l~l l~ated by slides which provide a contrast to the fiow of the story as 

generated by the dialogue. The slides, with the exception of one, are representational: they are 

pictures of trees. The two-dimensional statu of slides as a medium is important to consider. The 
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slides begin with an aeriai shot of a forest, g r a d d y  become more and more specinc, umit a 

cross-section of a aee tnm.k is shown, the rings of the years commenting on the sequenchg of 

events. The narrative of the slides moves from the exterior to the interior. When Jenny joins the 

environmental group, this third voice seems to support her opposition to the narrative which tke 

dialogue invites. The only slide which deviates from the gradua1 diminishing of trees is a slide 

which shows a placard saying "Save the Frogs," the phrase which becomes Jenny's banle cry 

(20). M e r  Ienny screams to küi the fiogs, the last slide, a cross-section of a eunk showing the 

~ g s ,  Lingers as the other lights go out. The slide then disappears, leaving the screen blank, and 

then fmally there is a blackout (22-23). Although Jemy does not escape Jack's narrative in the 

microstructure, the macrostmcture foregrounds the repressive nature of Jack's namative and 

encourages resistance. The siides speak a third silent voice, exhorting the audience to still "save 

the fiogs." 

In It 's On& Hot for Two Months in Kupuskasing, the way in which the story is controiled 

through the inner voices of Gerry and the Visitor conditions the readllig of the play. It is a 

r e c d g  technique of Margaret Hollingsworth: inner and outer voices are distinguished by a Light 

change, or, as Hollingsworth suggests, ''a fieeze, a mannerism, or even recorded voice" (27). This 

device hightights the contradictions between the speaking subject and the subject of speech: 

language is limited in what t can convey about the subject and its desires. The inner voice is not 

given more validity or essentialized. Rather it provokes smaller possible narratives, away fiom the 

main plot. The lack of hierarchy among the namitives is iiirating. Here Gerry's desire for the 

Visitor is articulatecl; there are M e r  possible codgurations of identity. For the spectator, there 

are many ways to negotiate meaning, teasing out sense fiom cornbinatory choices of disniptions 
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and contradictions in the b e r  and outer voices, in the bizarre combination of events where there 

is no denouement to the complications of the plot, where a kind of detective plot genre is twisted 

and turned to produce an enigma, but no resolution. In this way, the spectator is engaged, 

disturbed, involved, and yet left without closure and satisfàctory m e r s .  

The pairing of these plays offers a potentially subversive reading of narrative itself. 

Subjectivity is caught in a peculiar bind. AIthough narrative c m  be a restricting structure, it is 

necessary to make sense, to create a temporary definition of identity. Jemy needs to tell her own 

story of the frogs, or find a way of living with Jack's in order to gain power. The Visitor has to 

choose and take agency in creating her own provisional tnith in relation to the options which are 

presented her. Although there is always someone who wants to know the truth, the tmth depends 

on the interpetive community which detemiines the historicai paths and relations of knowledge 

and power. Traditional roles and power dynamics which are seemingiy reinforcd can be at the 

same tirne destabilized. Disengaging Eom narrative is not entirely possible, but perhaps an active 

foregrounding of the making and the playing of identity is. 

Poppycock : the story of history 

The title of this play is an ùonic reversal of Pound's dictum: 

"As to 20th century poetry it will move againsr Poppycock, it d be harder and 
saner, it will be near the bone, it will be as much like granite as it c m  be, the force 
will be in its adjectives inipeding the shock and the stroke of 3. It WU be austere, 
direct, Eee fiom emotional slither." (62) 

The play in its irreverent treatment of great men of history, its clowning techniques, and its 

p h u i d e ~ g  of Ietters and fiterature sets itselfagainst the patriarchy and against history. Its 
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chatacters, more than any others in this collection, are stmggiïng with the boundaries which are 

imposed by language and yet are necessary for articulation. A subject which is specific and 

historicaliy contingent is countered by a performance style and structure which mterrogate 

resolufon and imegnty of being. 

The femde subjects in this play are again se- and discursively bomd. Historical 

figures all, the women are, in kt, 'keai" personages and in that sense, there is also a self- 

conscious play with the already pertormed identities of W&ed Wagner, Dora Maar, and Hilda 

Doolittle. These are margmai characters fiom history, however, peripherd to thei. much better 

known, also historicdy perfiormed, associates: Hitler, Picasso, Pound. S i . &  the last names of 

the men are sufncient to situate them historically. Whereas the fende characters are played by 

different actors, one d e  actor plays the three male characters which defhe the women: Adolf 

Hitler, Pablo Picasso, and Ezra Pound. This centralization of male identity emphasizs the 

phallogocenaic discourse which constrains the wornen. The man is quite literdy univers& and is 

not limited to t h e  or space. The first moment to the play is The overture to Lohengrin, up to 

and including the fiagrnent of The Wedding March" (53) during which each of the women 

introduces herseifto the audience in her own language. Although the women are not in tact 

d e d  to these men, this musicai introduction si& the h d  of relationship which exists. Each 

woman is defined by an object: a rose, a camera, a c a d e  (53). Each of these objects becomes a 

way in which the man later on asserts ownership over the wornan. Language atFrms this right, as 

the man follows the introductions with his claim to eack 'Mein. La mienne. Mine" (53). 



Not oniy does the man own the women, but he a h  masters them in other ways with his 

language. He calls each of them a witch (54-55), thereby both conflating and fiattening their 

qualities. He iiterally creates and initiates them. As Ezra Pound, he christens Hiida Doolinle: 

EZRA. H.D. 
Imagiste. 
I WU make you a movement. 
1 wül make you. 
A legend. (62) 

In a scene with Picasso, Dora wanders into his studio, looking for her lost dog. Picasso, quite 

literally, paints her. He paints arouud her foot: 

DORA. [Dipping herfinger NI the redpaint.1 Blood on my hand. I'm losing. It 
hurts. 

[Gets behind the paper, out of sighl.] 
Rape! 
Curse! 
Cur! 

[Pokes her hand through the paper.] 
[PICASSO paints round her hand, delighted He is painting a portrait, cubist-style. He 
paints teardrops on the woman 's face. DORA tears the paper and peeh ouf. PICASSO 
paints around her eye.] (70) 

W i e d  Wagner was the wife of Siegf?ied Wagner who was related to Richard Wagner. She 

entertained Hitler. In the play she is very much at his beck and cd. In their first scene together, 

she shows him various objects for his approvaI, as he surveys and claims the household: a portrait 

of King Ludwig, Wagner's spectacles, Lizst's piano. When she O& him Frau Cossuna's opium 

pipe, he fkowns: 

HITLER. You have no need for mtches! [Pulls the veil over her face.] 
Women must be pure. (6 1) 

As can be seen by these examples, the women are dehed, named, and temtoriaüzed by the man. 

in a two dimensional and systematic way, they corne to Life through the men who name them. 



They do, however, h d  ways to resist within the strictures of language and representation 

and domestic Me. H.D. continues to mite poetry d e r  she has left Pound, but she takes on a new 

lover, a woman, Bryher (a woman who names herseIf) (72). Dora takes photographs of  Picasso's 

work; she records history. In the last scene she breaks out of the picture into which she has k e n  

painted (73). WMed  denies any polifical involvement or interest; nonetheless, she exerts an 

influence: "Yes, 1 may have advised him to dissolve his cabinet, but who am 1 to give advice?" 

(69). As the end of the play seems to indicate, the women are marginaUy successful when they 

imitate the way they have k e n  taught, when they take up the discourses in which they have been 

However, words are not sufncient for a full-fledged revolution. in a scene with Dora and 

Picasso, Picasso throws the camera nom her hands and says, 'Taint!" (66). She picks up a paint 

b m h  and begins, but iike the medium, the words Etil her: 

DORA. Blue is the colour of God 
Paint blue 
Paint me Hue 
Paint 
Paint 
Pain 
P ~ Y  
Pan 
Pa- 
PPPPPPPPPPPPPPaPaPaPaPaPaPaPa--* (67) 

Here logocentrism and phdocentrism are united, as the word stripped bare becomes quite üterally 

the nither. Once again there are few positive images of womea Dora presents possibly the most 

active subject, in her attempts to reject Picasso's posifoning of her. And yet her chamcter at the 

end of the play descnis the fixation of her subjectivity in what Picasso bas done for her: 



DORA. They asked him for a mernorial to Apollinaire. He gave them a bust of 
me. It stands on a pedestd m a Paris square. White ftom sparrows. (74) 

W d e d  and H.D. repeat the sarne refkin they had earlier spoken: Wot accepting the darker side 

of man means not Ioving hirn enough," and 'The kindest thing I can say is that he was a iittie 

crazy" (74). There is linle evolution or resolution for these characters. What is ïüustrated is the 

constraints of acting as a subject, a subject with limited ways of interacting. The women respond 

and react to the man; the effects of their resistance are minimal. 

There are formai ways in which this play attempts to articulate a different subjectlobject 

relationship. This is a play of exnemes, aIthough in a very différent way than the work of Judith 

Thompson The audience is co&onted by broad characterizations; the play was originally 

workshopped using a clown method although in the introduction to the play, HoUingsworth says 

she does not necesçarily believe ail subsequent productions of the script should be done in clown 

(5 1 ). Nonetheless, there is a specificity in performance style which does become part of the text. 

One man plays al1 three male characters. Objects, on the other hand, cm become many thhgs. The 

c o f i  in the middle of the stage is also a table, a piano, a Men  tree (5 1-5 1). In this way, identities 

are conflictual and unstable. The women, however, are aiways themselves: this highlights the 

specincity of their circumstances and the need to acknowledge and attend to the lived experience 

of women in combination 16th a theoretical revisioning. Extensive research was conducted and 

funnelled into the creation of these characters. The plundering of a variety of sources produces a 

pastiche of identity, with tIagments of interviews, diaries, poetiy. The women f?om history are 

self-consciously portraitures, quotes mtemiingled with hearsay and .nagUiation, as Ho ilingswo rth 

attests in her introduction: 



The play is based on recorded mtetviews, poems and writhgs by and about these 
six people. It is a collage of what they actually said, or are reported to have said, 
with some miagioative * recreations added mainly to provide continuity. (49-50) 

In this way, the discourses of history as well as gender are hterrogated. Knowing oneself and 

taking care of oneself demand situating oneself among disco mes, desires, and psyc hological 

fluctuations, in effèct, momentarily stopping the transformational forces. It is this temporary 

speciiicity which is an important component of a postmodem feminist identity. 

Utimately this play questions what is practically viable. How does one reconceive identity 

and s a  ex&, function, and fùrtherrnore advocate change in personal interactions, m institutions, 

in society at large? The audience must work to put together meaning for the performance style; it 

must siil through fàct and fàntasy and reconmct the identities of the women. The play attempts 

to rewo rk interactions by getting the audience to think, conceive, and respond dfleredy. 

Audience members are given a parrot cage to holdhide a s  W S e d  prepares to receive Hitler 

(60). They are associated in the subjection with the women in one of the scenes with Hitler. He 

tapes off a red boundary of tape, using the laps of the audience as the perimeter, repeating the 

word, Wein'' (65). In an interview, Hohgsworth describes how she conceives of this play: 

You read Poppycock, which is basically about women and power. Ln that play I 
took it to the extreme to see the effect when creative women are linked with 
powerful men who subsume and subvert their power. It alI disappears! ("Margaret 
Hollingswonh Interview" 147) 

The power relations extend to the audience. They are forced to connont this exercise of power at 

least, to give themselves up to the domination by the clowns and by the intirnate interactions with 

the actors. They need to leam to cope without closure. Holiingsworth d e m i s  the ambiguity of 

her endings: 



A lot of Canadian theatre is fàr more up-beat .ian I am: People want happy 
endings. They want endings above all else. They need things tied up and resolved. 
Now that's the buzz word these days: 'kesolution." Or "redemption" 

I'm not parcicularIy interested in either. Nor in king especiaily optimistic about 
something that I'm not optimistic about. . . . 

For me, the major function of theatre is to challenge and d i i b .  And it's great if 
we can entertain dong the way. CiMargaret Hollingsworth Interview" 155) 

Coping with ambiguity invo Ives reünquishmg a need for a re-establishment of order. In 

Poppycock, the controlled chaos of the clowns both foregrounds the construction of identity and 

unsetdes the audience in its disturbance of hierarchies, boundaries, and ways of interactkig. 

Prim, Duck. Muma and Frank: Marking Ldentity 

Where the exercise of power determines the characters in Poppycock, the exercise of d e s  

determines the characters in Prim, Duck, Muma und Frank. Holüngsworth d e m i s  the 

characters in this play in terms of their adherence to the d e s  of sociaüzed behaviour: 

Duck's the one who can afFord to be creatkve with the d e s :  he c m  make them up. 
Frank knows exactly what the d e s  are. It's ail very clear for hlln Not so for 

poor old Prim. She just cannot get it right. Ever. She is always trying to learn what 
the man's niles are, but she doesn't even understand what happens when you take 
photographs. She womes about her insides getting photographed. And what if the 
photograph shows what she's just eaten? The terror, the absolute terror of king 
adri. in chaos is overwhelming. 

And Mama can't get it nght either, but she gets away with it sirnply because 
she's a mother. She's eamed her status, and she lets them aii know it. But in fàct, 
she's as much at sea as the rea of them . . . . The two women, in different ways, 
are totally at sea ("Margaret Hollingsworth InteMew" 160) 

There is a struggle to negotiate a balance between order and chaos. Elsewhere in the interview, 

Hollingsworth gives practical advice for making it in the world: Tou've got to try to get ahead 

of the d e s  and understand" (162). The interviewer asks more specificdy about Prim and 

whether Holhgsworth thinks she wül survive. Holiingsworth replies: 



No. 1 don't thmk so. Not a very hopefd character. Not a very hopefiil play. I see 
Prim and Duck as a body containing worlds spinning within worlds spmning within 
worlds. Everything is finally in motion at the end. Some physicists have that 
theory, don't they? There's no order in the universe, or@ chaos, and to live in it, 
we must impose order. (Wargaret Hollingsworth I n t e ~ e d '  162) 

But the imposition of order on the chaos cornes at a price. Order needs to be rethought. Identity 

for Prim is more fluid and unstable than it is for Duck and Frank. 

Both Prim and Mama are depicted in unstable temis. Although in many ways a strong 

character with the power to exert infiuence over others, Marna physicaily feels how she is 

separated fiom herself, how she is W e n t e d :  

MAMA. . . . S'me the parts of my body they don't feel each 0th- no more. 
See. I put one foot on the other and 1 stand on it and 1 don't feel nothin'. 
My toes see, my toes they don' touch ... see ... they don't wanna touch. . . . 
See, they don' wanna touch me neither. The parts of my body don' wanna 
touch no more Osvaldo. (85) 

Mama's f k d y 7  m e  her body, seerns discomected 60m its parts. Frank, the unde, is 

uncommunicative, spending most of his time in the kitchen chopping vegetables or cleaning; he is 

always doing something. Duck, the son Osvaldo, has a mysterious and active connection to the 

outside world, involved in a band and perhaps involved in theft. Discomection is most cleady 

played out in Prim; the others act upon her, and it is her search for identity that is the focus of the 

Like her mother, Prim is w g  to bring her various parts together. Her progress is 

impeded: the play opens with her struggle in shiny yellow ski boots. She clomps up the stairs, she 

clomps down. She changes socks and attempts to move: T h e  stands. She staggers. She tries 

walRing with various gaits" (77). She retreats upstairs again and returns with a pair of cross- 

country skis and attempts to put thern on The obsession signals the fkst section of the play: Part 
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Ooe is cded Teet." The rest of the play simüarly speaks to this hgmentation: "Hands," "Body," 

and "Head." Nothing connects. The parts do not make a whole. 

Where the others seem caught in their own loops of obsession, Prim, perhaps because the 

d e s  are so far away fiom her, is desperate in her search for sense, control and order. In the nrst 

scene, she is hntically searching for her contact lenses, her "eyes," as she caüs them When she 

asks Duck ifhe saw them, he replies: '4 drank'em" (79). Unlike Prim, Duck marks the lllnits of 

the subject. The second part of the play, 'Wauds," opens with an eerie scene: 

PRIM is lying on thefloor of the living room. DUCK is taping around her with 
white tqpe, making an outline of her body such as you see at the site of an 
accident. (87) 

But after surveying the outhe, Prim says, 'Those aren't my hands" (87). The representation she 

k d s  of herself in Duck's work does not correspond to her own image of herself. Later in the 

scene Frank enters and snips off the fingers of one of his gloves. Prim rescues the tips, places 

them one on top of the other to make one long kger  and stores it in her bra (92). She tries to 

retrieve and connect parts. She is always attempting to make sense, to knit herself together. She 

decorates her body in an attempt at marking herself. She paints her nails a pearly pink (94). In 

'Tmt Four: Head," Prim is getting ready for a job interview. She wears eiaborate makeup, paints 

eyeiashes under her eyes and wears a fikq bright green wig (99). When Mama interrogates her 

for her funny appearance, Prim asserts: "SO they don? hire me because of somethin' 1 did. . . . It's 

better'n not bein' hired for something 1 didn't do" (100). Prim, in her painting and prirnping of 

self, is trying to assert a measure of agency over her own destiny. This agency is subject to the 

limitations which ianguage and representation necessitate. 



Communication, for Prim, is difncult. Duck's language is often obtuse and seIf-obsessed 

He doesn't need to exphin hunself. Prim is often Ieft confused. When Duck talks about his outfit 

for the band, "Killing Time," he descriis a thousand origami cranes--birds, of course. PrSn, 

however, sees cranes on a building site: 

PRIM. Cranes? 
DUCK. I c m  string 'em together. 
PRIM. Cranes. Like ... cranes ... ? [Lookr up, seeing a towering Crane on a 

building site.] 
DUCK With wings. 
PRIM. Wmgs? 
DUCK. It'li be a blast. Thai's what I'll Wear. A thousand fiickin' cranes. 
P m .  #y? 
DUCK. Don't ask. 
PRIM. Why not? 
DUCK. Because you don't know. 
PRM. What don't 1 know? 
DUCK. You don't even know that right? 
PRIM. I don't know. 
[Long pause. ] 
DUCK. Paper cranes, yeah ... hangin'. 
PRIM. Hangin'? 
DUCK. Hangin' fkorn every part. Every part ... 
[Indicates his shotdders, each of his fingers, his wrists, his waist, his thighs. 

and his ankies.] 
PRIM. Hangin' fiom every part. 
DUCK. See? 
PRIM. [Doesn 'i see.] Yeah. (92-93) 

Duck launches into a long discourse about cranes and their symbolism of long life and mes to 

convey to her the irony of a band cded 'Xilling Time." Not only does Prim not have access to 

this language, but she a c t d y  sees things differently. 

Representation is problematic for her. The reason, presumably, for the outhe which Duck 

cames into the floor, is to provide Marna with a picture of Prim as a birthday present. Duck is 

confident that the outline is unique: "'S a fuckin' fingerpriat," he says.". . . . Permanent" (87). 



When P h  says she wants a photograph, Duck replies that they fade. Besides, "this way she gets 

two," says Duck (88). Again Prim does w t  understand: 

PRIM. Two? 
DUCK Full lengths. 
PRIM. Two? 
DUCK. [Sighs at her ignorance.] ûne. [lnside the outhe.] Two . [Outside the 

outline.] It's a bhck and white negative. 
PRIM. Duck ... ? 
PUCK covers the outline with a mg as &fit were a body. The world isjust too 

dumb for him.] (88) 

But Prim does not see herself within such binaries. She does not trust in representation. Should 

she get a picture taken by a machine, then? But, "[mlaybe it wouldn't look like me. How would 1 

have to look to make it look like me?" (88). She practises smüing in the &or. She ruminates 

over a picture of Duck which appeared in the paper: "That didn't look iike you. But Marna stiU 

cut it out. She cut round the outline of you. She said she didn't want the other people" (89). She 

quizzes Duck on what it feels like to be recognized. She doesn't beiieve in the tmth of mirroe. 

She looks at her refl ection, and covers up her right eye with her right hand: 'Wow do 1 know that 

what I see is what you see? (90). Again, she tnes to assert an agency or a control over the 

perception of herself by others. 

Prim's description of herselfin a photo booth reveak her vuinerability, and how rnuch her 

identity is detennined by the outside: ". . . there's all these pichers on the outside that the 

machine's taken, and dl the girls are smilin' and all the guys are sorta ... not smilin' know what 1 

mean? AU the faces ...Y (94). In order to be seen, one must imitate another and fit into a pattern 

But this entails a certain amount of trust in the representational apparatus: "How would you lmow 

it'd take your face and not your knees. 1 mean-1 mean, Mama's not gonna want a picher of my 



knees right?" (94). The right pose, the right perspective, is necessary, but there is also a certain 

1 mean supposing the camera doesn't know when to stop and it just goes on takin' 
pichers, and it &es you pichers of your stomach and stufflike that. Suppose it 
gives you pichers of your bones and your stomach and all the stuff you just ate like 
potato chips and Mdky  Ways and curry chicken, and the only way you know it's 
you is because you remember what you ate right? (94) 

Prim's hold on herselfis precarious. More tban any other character, she has difnculty in befieving 

the apparatus. Her dilemma illustrates Elin Diamond's concerns in her article "Mimesis, Mimicry 

and the Tme-Reai," in her discussion of Platonic mirnesis and the revisions of French feminists. 

Diamond cites Irigaray's critique of representation: 

She links the phailus to (Platonic, model-copy) mimesis: the female, lacking the 
organ of privilege, unable to syrnbolize her htasies and desires in a male 
syrnbolic, is positioned as &or to the male, reflecting back to hirn - thereby 
demonstrating the [ruth of his centruliiy--his own image, his SeEsme. Irigaray 
calls this specular operation of female eraswe "mimesis imposed," the alternative 
for which is hysteria, a female rniming that has no recognhble referent. (364) 

Although Diamond goes on to fàvour a historical-materiah reading over a postmodem one, the 

points she makes are valuable. Strategies of reaiism are problematic: 

Realism is more than an interpretation of reality passing as reality ; it produces 
"reality" by positionhg its spectator to recognize and verfi its truths: this 
escritoire, this spirit lamp, afsrms the typicaiity, the Universality of this and all 
bourgeois drawing rooms. Human signification becornes no less teleological. In 
realism the actodsigniner, la-ted to her character/signified, strenuously seeks 
admission to the right class of referents. (366) 

As in the narrative play of The House that Jack Built and It 's Only Hot for Two Months in 

Kapuskaring, the representational apparatus is questioned in Prim, Duc5 Marna und Frank. The 

structure of the play is overlaid, as it were, on the body proper. The play in this way rewrites the 

body through its discursive representation. 



Attempts at rewriting identity corne through the mdividual instance. Prim, in fàct, tries to 

rehte/rename her own body. She tums to the rnirror for assurance, for affirmation in an identity 

which is as solid as any of the objects she touches: 

PRIM. [Takes her wig ofl Underneath it she is w e h g  a wig cap. She l o o k  
into the mirror, then touches the mimer.] Mirror. [Touches the glass.] 
Glass. [Picks up the comb.] Comb. [Pich up the Iipstick.] Lipstick. 
[Touches the @stick.] Co Io ur. [Pause .] Co Io ur? [Lookr in the mimer.] 
Prim Iaccabuci, Prim Iaccabuci ... [Repeais it over and over]. Primavera 
Iaccabuci, Primavera Iaccabuci. [Intones the wordr and gradually a tune 
develups, the hymn tune Holy, holy, holy. Mcaea] Shefits her name to the 
tune of the hymn, tentative& atjirsi, but then she gets right into it.] (102) 

This moment is simüat to the fàux srrip tease at the end of In Confidence. There is a suggestion of 

an essential seif(the 'teal" Prim or Marianna) beneath the clothes and the makeup. At the same 

t he ,  there is a recognition of the construction of identity. Here Prim literally puts her name to the 

tune of a hymn She can ody combat and work within dicourse. Mer she completes her hymn- 

Song, she looks at the tapes Duck has dropped on the table, finds one she likes, puts it down the 

fiont of her dress, and retums to the &or: "So marna, who is rny papa?. . . For sure? 1 mean, for 

sure" (103). 

Prim's uncertain identity revolves aromd her kick of ongin. The closea to a M e r  

substitute, Frank has an unusual position w i t h  the play. Little is known, or revealed about him 

In the dramatis personae, where the other characters are @en ages, Frank is listed as "agdess 

(probably ex-Army)" (76). He seldom interacts with the other characters; he is always dohg 

something, usually a domestic task: chopping vegetables, stripping the table, pouring flour in 

preparation to bake something very large (97). Frank is even an outsider within the -y. Mama 

urges P r h  to be careful whom she marries: 



MAMA. . . . And you make sure he's Italian too, otherwise you don? know 
what you're gettid . That's what's wrong with your Uncle Frank. ( 10 1) 

The embodiient of action, he does not engage in dialogue with the other characters, yet he is the 

ody character who bas his own scene. Where the othez diimembered "Parts" of Feet, Wds, and 

Head are scenes of g e n d  disarray and non-linear narrative, "Part Three: Body" is wholly and 

completely Frank's. He alone speaks and acts. He is preparing to clean the wail where an outline 

of Prim's body has ken sketched; he prepares to erase her. Unlike Prim, and Mama and even 

Duck who at various points ruminate about the past, and about memory, and about the future, 

Frank is steadfàstly in the present task at hand. Words and actions are laminated together: "First 1 

put the bucket down . . . . Now I put the cloth in the water . . . . Now I take the cloth in my nght 

hand and squeeze . . . . Now 1 view the problem area" (96-97). Prim's indecision and confusion, 

her wailing "D-u-u-u-u-u-u-u-u-ck!" (78), are counterpointed by Frank's straightforward 

approach to tasks and decision-rnaking. Whereas Prim is harnpered by m g  on skis in the living 

room and bumps into three-foot plaster nymphs (79)' Frank is precise, orderly, well-defineci, a 

parody of etnciency. When he puzzles over how to begin e d g  the body, he lists ail possible 

avenues of approach: fiom the head? the feet? He thmks of everything in his decision m a h g  

process. Absolutely nothing is left to chance: 

FRANK. . . . Overlookhg fàcton such as intuition Ieads to ineptitude and an 
uneconomic use of thne and materials which are at your disposal. [Pause.] 
Now I wiU rnake my decision. [Pause.] 1 have decided. The decision is 
made. (97) 

Ironicaliyy Frank spends the whole monologue declaiming, describing his approach, and it is only 

at the end of the monologue that Frank is redy able to begin: 'Now I am ready to reduce the 

body" (98). Frank has, of course, in one sense already reduced the body, by completely 
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enveloping it in words. Prim's outline is etched into the floor by Duck: a physical engraving which 

Prim does not even agree with. Then, the shadow of thiç form, the corresponding ou the  on the 

w d  is verbally reduced by Frank in his preparation to erase it. In this way, the representation of 

Prim is contained in and by ideology as exemplifïed by both Frank and Duck. 

Frank's narrative, "Body," is, however, contained within the complete story of Prim. 

Du& Marna and Frank. A Aerent  kind of spectator is interpeUated when the play is taken as 

whole. in tact, the play is a series of parts which do not d e  up a whole. In sorne ways, the 

characters provide the keys to different interpretations of texts. Frank, we have seeq us 

one, a traditional readhg model: approaching, deciding, consuming. H k  object as a reader is to 

divide and conquer, to accept representation as it is, to make imperative staternents of what to do 

with it, rather than to interrogate, or accept its source. The other characters have Merent 

approaches to making sense of the world. Duck has a peculiar fiiscination with language. Like 

Frank, he is confident of his actions, and his word choices. He can skilfuly play with double 

meanings, with 'tranes" with 'pales" usually to the confbsion of Prim. His oftStage dealings are 

suspicious: is he a thief? Like Marna, and unlike Prim, he moves with a certain amount of ease in 

society, albeit on the rnargins. Within the M y ,  Duck is obviousIy fàvoured. Marna's way of 

reading the situation is show to be fàlse. She is so caught up in her own world and her own 

desires that she is unable to see Duck as a thief, for example. She misinterpets Prim when she 

emphasks that he is in the parking garage cctryin ' the cars" (10 1). Rather than recognizllig 

Duck's ülegal activities, Mama sees him as the perfect son: 

MAMA. Tryin'? So he's tryin' to choose which one he &es huh? That's my 
Osvaldo, don' buy before you know for sure and for certain ... don' buy 
before you how.  Don' go takin' your mama to the country in some ole 



can O' beam and not lmowing ifit's goma get her back the same as she left 
the house. That's the way his papa was ... 

P m .  Our papa (101) 

Prim is constantly overloo ked in fàvour of her brother. P h  reacts agamst Mama's reading and 

her attempts to situate her within a master narrative. Marna is an example of the Althusserian self- 

policing subject: having inte&ed patriarchal prescriptions for king, she perpetuates them. She 

is constantly exhorting Prim to %have welli' Prim f i d iy  acts out: 

MAMA. And who is t left the kotex in the bathroom again huh? . . . . You 
thmk that's such a beautifid sight for the man in the house to see? For your 
brother to see, even if there is a rose painting on the box. How many times 
1 have to tell you huh? [Sits on the chesterfield] What kinda woman who 
teils the whole world she don' care about her feet. Who stands in here with 
yeUow ... with yeliow ... who leaves her boxes in the bathroorn huh? Huh? 
You teil me huh? What kinda woman would do such a thing to her Marna 
huh? 

PRLM purs d o m  one ski and takes the other in both han&. She bops MAMA 
on the head Hmd. She exits through kitchen, and clomps upstairs- She 
appems in the bedroom and sits on the bed, wutching DUCK Meanwhile, 
downstairs, MAMA sits motionless on the couch, head sunk into her 
shoulders- Meanwhile. in the kitchen, FRANK cruch three eggs into a 
g l a s  bowl. He turns on the electric beater. Beats. The noise is very loud.] 
(86) 

In this example, we see Prim's attempt at a reading strategy. She acts outside the parameters of 

the story. Just as she creates herselfdifferently for the job in te~ew,  in order to gain some control 

over the outcome, here she takes on a role in the play which is contrary to the dominant realist 

aesthetic. in this pecuüar twist, Prim cm act out her frustration with Marna's unending tirade. She 

physicaiiy stops Mama's prescriptions. The body is the site where behaviour and rebeilion take 

place. Like the excess Ui Judith Thompson, here extremes in behaviour and rnarking of the self 

ultimately s i m  control and agency. When Prim bops Marna on the head, she stüls the Stream of 

talk which tells her how to be. The iïnal scene of the play is the most signiscant manifestation of 



this marking. Prim watches as Frank responds to Mama's cry for coffee. He methodically prepares 

a tray for her, with a cup that has the word c M ~ ' '  on it. His actions provide an accompaniment 

to Marna's lament: 

[. . . He pours the coflee into the cup, but does not stop when the nrp isfilied The 
coffee brims over into the saucer. onto the trty and onto the floor. MAMA sits 
motionless. DUCK sits motionless. PRIM wotches. FRANK pours.] 
MAMk [ Without moving. ] So how come no body c& me Giulia no more 

huh? How corne I'm either marna or signora or Siguora Iaccabuci Or 
nothin'. How come nobody calls me Giulia huh? Giulia Iaccabuci. 

[DUCK begins to umvrap the toikt roll.] 
Giulia Iaccabuci, Giulia Iaccabuci ... [Repecrts it carefiIly, as ifit rnight 
explode .] 

[PRIM upproaches FRANK, wulkïng slowly, her hanà out. palm up. FRANK 
continues fo pour. PRLM pich up the cup and saucer while he pours. She puts it 
on her uplurned puim. FRANK continues to pour. The c o a e  splashes on PRIM'S 
wrist, on her wist, on her am,  on her shoes and ankles.] 
PRIM. It's hot. [Dues not move.] 
[DUCK setsfire to the toilet paper with his Bic.] 
[Blachut. Thef7ame grows and then it is extinguished.] ( 1  04) 

Rather than stopping and beginning again, only to perpetuate and continue the same mode1 of 

behaviour, Prim makes a different choice this t h e :  to keep in a pamful holding pattern. 

The poignancy of this image is in its abiüty to hold the contradictions in tandem: it is both 

ernpty and full. It is a place where binanes are confounded. It is a painful process and the promise 

of agency is uncertain* What it does provide, however, is a mode1 of identity which is not in a 

pattern of domination and subordination with others, but rather it is embedded in comunities and 

dernands imaginative choices. 

The fragmented subjects in this play are in complicated worlds where po wer and 

h o  wledge and therefore agency are not pure and simple; oppression is cornmon. Marna is 

situated arnong disco urses which clearly aEo rd her agency, but nonetheless are continually 



restrictive. The kind of agency she h d s  is not fiom a sense of play or foregrounding of the 

constnicted nature of her identity, but is aiways bound back to a patriarchal ideai. Duck is the 

centre of his Marna's world, cleariy feels superior to Prim, but nonetheless exists on the rnargins 

of society. He is just as confiicted as Prim. Frank is perhaps the ody aiil centre, but he exists in a 

world which has imploded on itself. So assureci and checked are his actions that they are without 

significance. Working outside already determined parameters in the "constitutive outside" is not 

possible, and dtimately leads to inaction. Prim, painfûl as it is, is the one who feels and is 

inevitably marked. The urgency is with her, with her haod in the Stream of hot coffee, and in the 

poignancy of this image. For it is a state of king in both places, marked and in pain. The agency 

of identity in te= of a postmodem feminism c m  also be conceptualized in this state: k i n g  in 

two places at the same the ,  of pleasure and pain. 

The impenetrable nature of this last image works in combination with Marna's Iament of 

not behg known. This play is vety much about the ümitations of representation. What passes for 

"ealism'' doesn't work. Concomitaatly, the mode1 that is the nuclear M y  has coliapsed. The 

W e r  is absent; his existence is unceaain. Consumable images are replaced with something harder 

to access. Containment is possible, but not always secure. The body leaks. Like the 'Yiiggin fiogs" 

that retum, the cherries that are crushed, the Poppycock that persists, the body is scorched 

through it s own making. 

ConcIusion 

1 have ken  arguing for a combination of postmodeniism and feminism and as my analysis of the 

plays progresses, the question of the role of the spectator becomes more and more persistent. 



Issues of spectatorship, like issues of implication, are clearly important in the theorking of a 

postmodern feminist identity. The pattern by which identity is constructeci within the texts are 

intricately linked to reception and subject-object identification Although there is more of an 

emphasis on female identity in the piays of Margaret Hohgsworth, and a more ident%able 

feminist politics, there are simüarities with the work of Judith Thompson. Subjects shift according 

to relations of power. The dominance implied in such subjects is critiqued by the serialization of 

these positions, and in Hollingsworth, especially by images and formal and narrative devices. 

Identity which is in a tension of mastery and non-mastery. There is no moral insistence on good 

and bad, nor a fïrmiy embedded clifference between self and other. Hollingsworth vanously 

reworks stories from childhood, history, and genre. As she does so, a formation is achieved which 

is in keeping with Stuart Hall's definition of identity and Judith Butler's discursive groundings. 

Haii articulates the need to consider the fiuid process of theorking this kind of identity: 

. . . identities are about questions of using the resources of history, language and 
culture in the process of becoming rather than being: m t  "Who we are" or %here 
we came firom," so much as what we might become, how we have been 
represented and how that bears on how we might represent ourselves. Identities 
are therefore constituted within, not outside representation. (Questions 4) 

The films of Patricia Gmben take thjs study even M e r  into the reairn of the personal. In her 

films, she quite literally asks what represents herself. She asks the questions of ongin in 

conjunction with destiny. As Hail's remarks indicate, this is not an isolated, individual process, but 

one which is very much an interpretive joumey which foregrounds the participation of the 

spectator in the undoing of a subjectfo bject dynamic. In the next chapter, 1 will consider selected 

f h s  by Gniben and possible positionings for the postmodem feminist identity that she offers. 
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Issues of body and narrative in my discussions of Thompson and Hohgsworth have proven to 

overlap. This interplay wiU be a focus for my discussion of Grubea 



CHAPTER FOUR 

"Routes" not uRootsn: The Films of Patricia Gruben 

gnibeln: tu brood, to ponder the inponderable 

The films of Patricia Gmben provide ample opportunity for the exploration of identity in 

te- of postmodernism and ferninim. Although the criteria for considering film are different 

fkom theatre, the analytical overlay of the mode1 of subjedidentity is au relevant. Here the 

interplay of body/narrative which I have been considering in Thompson and Hollingsworth is 

always apparent. Gniben's f%m are thoughtfùl treatises which speciiïcaIly situate identity within 

an akeady particukuiy subjective medium. In her mterrogation of the discourses which constnict 

identity, Gruben addresses patriarchal institutionalized discourses of science and language as weU 

as the WC medium itself Again, the subject is situated among discourses; identity is ambiguous 

and contingent on shiRing relations of po wer. Mastery is critiqued as the subject is serialized; 

identity is not contahed in a sinpuiar body, but is interrogated as narrative and tilmc techniques 

are &O interrogated. 

In ail her films, most especially Ley Lines, Gniben addresses her own need to teil aories 

and to seek out origin. Gruben's interest in origin can be traced to her training in anthropology 

and her early work in documentaries. She bas desc~i'bed the focus of her filmç as "the ambiguities 

and contradictions of consciousness" (In Bachman 1) and 'liow we know what we know" (Ln 

Bailey n.p.). Her films reflect and combine these interests as eventually she becomes the subject of 

her own inquiry. 



Reception 

Like the work of Margaret Hollingsworth, the films of Patncia Gruben are not widely 

known She is well-known within experimentai nIm circles and on university campuses, but 

disuibution, even for her feature-length films, is limited. Reviewers lament this condition: 

Access to audience is, in kt, the most commonly missing element in the chemisay 
of Canadian films; and without this-without the &nmker/audience relationship 
which is a dynamic of challenge and critique-the entire process of production 
(including the expense, energy and ideas required) stops short. The work is 
unleashed into a vacuum. (Mason 43) 

Ln "The Best Canadian Films You've Probably Never Seen," which discusses Low Visibility, 

Geoff Pevere expresses a similar fiutration: 

Considering how dif3cuit it is to see Canadian movies even under the most 
generous circumstances, this admittedly is something of an exerck in hair- 
splitting. Nevertheless, there are certain Caoadian movies that, for one reason or 
another, are even less visible than most and which, in many cases, are W e l y  
superior to the chosen few that do enjoy some form of fleeting wtoriety. 
Therefore, what follows is a highiy subjective account of sorne of the undeservedly 
lost Canadian movies of recent years; those films that, &er a festival screening or 
two, simply dropped through the fioorboards of our cultural memory. (34) 

Gruben's attempts to accommodate her films to a more mainStream market have not been 

successfùl. in 1990 she made Deep Sleep, a psychological thriller, starring Megan FoNows, in 

which a young girl attempts to discover the reasons for the murder of her fàther four years earlier. 

Reviews panned the nIm. In most reviews it was criticized for the "scattergun" approach to the 

script and Gruben's ''htetellectual funiness and esthetic clutter" (Groen C3). Her attempts to fuse 

more experimental techniques with a mainstream plot were met with confusion: 

The most solid aspect of her film--the sharply-focused dream images and the 
deliberately anti-naturalistic 'keligious" dialogue-is also the most extrinsic, and is 
conceptually at odds with the more mahstream plot . . . . (Harris 21) 
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The fusion which Gniben appears to have anempted here is characteristic of her other work and 

in -y ways is one of her strengths. Like Thompson and Hollingsworth, there is a dual impulse 

to her films; they simdtaneously situate a subject and undo its moorings. Gniben's other nIms 

have also received mixed reviews and reactions. On the one hand, S@ed Evidence was voted one 

of the top twenty films in the world by Village Voice critic Jim Hoberman in 1983. On the other 

hand, Ley Lines was descnbed by Joe Leydon in Variety as "a ponderous and ~ e ~ i n d d g e n t  vanity 

production" (ap.). These mked reactions to her nIms can often be atiriiuted to the chdengirig 

ways her films incorporate issues of subjedidentity formation. 

Her concerns are feminin in theû consistently complex inqujr into the positionhg of 

women Ki a patriarchal society. The idea of a postmodern feminist identity which I bave k e n  

e x p l o ~ g  involves identity as a site of ambiguity. The tension of mastery and non-mastery is again 

dernonstrated in the senes of subjects in Gniben's films. Confined and constricted, these subjects 

need a language to speak. Her films also offer spaces for a different kind of subjectivity, in which 

coherence is undemiined, both by technical strategies and thematic concerns. The workings of a 

postmodern feminist form of identity can be found in the images and transgressions which happen 

sirnultaneously with the ongo hg serialization of the subject. 1 have chosen to consider four of 

Gruben's nIms here in extensive d e t a  for their particular situating and exploration of the 

subjedidentity dynamic: The Cenrral Character, S@ed Evidence, Low Yisibility, and Ley Lines. 

As in the chapters on Thompson and Hollingsworth, I will discuss both the situating of the subject 

and then consider the ways in which the identity of characters, as weii as Gruben herse& is 

presented as destabilized. Gruben uses several different techniques both on the level of the 

synchronized and the voice-over text to articulate this crisis of identity. Gruben negotiates the 
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border of chaos and order, and the ways in which we consauct identities out of the amalgam of 

stories we tell and are told about ourselves. 1 will &O consider the films hdividually for their 

specinc concerns of problematizing identity at various htersectiom with the other. The 

imperiaiism of the masterfiil subject is problematized in Gruben's 6hs .  Where Thornpson and 

HoUmgsworth work with non-linear narrative, where différent 'tealities" seem to exist 

simultaneously, Gmben corstantly foregrounds the construction of the M c  medium, drawing 

attention to the different fonns of representation and therefore the several constructions of 

identity which are possible. 

The Central Character is an early feminist nIm which both addresses the restrictive d e s  

of women and incorporates severd expetimental techniques as an alternative to the concept of a 

uaitary identity. The film unravels so many stories that its character is left diffuse, rather than 

"central." Swed Evidence, as its title irnplies, layers the subject, and overtly addresses the ways in 

which it is implicated in the other and the other's oppression. The nIm both accommodates and 

undermines narrative, pro bing the implications of both language and desire. Low VisibiZity 

rehquishes the subject even M e r .  Here, even more overtly than in Szped Evidence, the subject 

is constnicted by other discourses, and acts upon others in its attempts to achieve agency. Other 

more playful possibilities for a deiineation of the parameters of identity involve an ironic, 

foregrounded use of Ianguage and an awareness of the mediations which construct a viewing 

experience. h Ley Lines, the filmmaker huns to her own identity, and traces the h e s  she draws in 

an attempt at a personai definition. The film undertakes a pro blematic search for ongin. At the 

same t he ,  it articulates the irrrpossibility of arresting and maintainmg such parameters of identir/, 

here in the case of Patricia Gniben herseIf. Margaret Hollingsworth undertakes a sùnilar venture 



161 

in War Babies with the interrogation of Esme, the playwright, but here the study that Patricia 

Gruben undertakes destabilizes her own authorhl status as filmmaker. 

The Centruf Garucfer= Containment and Disorder 

This füm is the most ami-realistic of all the texts 1 am considering. The "centrai character" 

does not have a distinguiçhable character, or identity, or history. There is no specific narrative in 

the aaditional sense which orders her story. A dornestic world, s~uctured by words, blueprints, 

and photographs, is contrasted by the world of the garden. It is to this space that the main 

character escapes. In some ways, The Ceniral Character can be read quite simph/ as an eamest 

ferninist tract, exposing the constrictions of a domestic role for woman. The two spaces of the 

film, the colonized and the exotic, nature and cuttw, can even Ioosely represent the patriarchai 

world of order and its other counterpart, the disordered space of the feminine. Kathleen McHugh 

insightfUy analyzes the use of space as determinant of identity in Patricia Gruben's films. She 

describes the juxtaposition of the ordered domestic space of the kitchen, and projects a process of 

liberation as the woman rnoves into the organic space of the garden. McHugh contrasts the 

beginning of the film with the ending, and suggests the liberatory association the film makes with 

nature: 

The dnidge and monotony of the domestic becomes exotic as it dissipates in the 
a 4  vegetal riot of the outdoors. And the elusive central character? Originally 
constituted as an ordered, ordering fiinction in the kitchen, the woman 
disintegrates into an organic effect, a liirated growth that exceeds the constraints, 
the original context or containers of her own cdtivation. (1 1 1) 

There are limits to such a utopic vision of feminism, however, in its oppositional positionhg, and 

there are ways in which this vision is undermineci in the film. The reading of the film which 1 
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propose is one which reduces the opposition of binaries and, again, proposes a site of ambi& in 

its restnicturing of identity. These two worlds do not oppose each other in this film so much as 

intrude on each other, to no satisfactory conclusion. The film problematizes such dichotomies 

while still avaiiing itselfof these discourses. The film becomes an interrogation of both spaces, 

and tums the titk of the film back on itself: who is the central character? How to remake the 

centrai character differently? 

Let us fist consider the roles which the film presents as behg available to wornen within a 

patriarchal society, and the means of resistance which are present. In The Cenrrol Character, the 

domestic role of Woman as homemaker is seKconsciousIy foregrounded. A nameless woman is 

shown trapped by her kitchen, her grocery list, her domestic chores. Her voice is disembodied as 

words which scroll on the screen, descnbing a loose narrative of a woman struggling to the house 

with grocenes. The woman is &O contained by a voice-over wbich recites a list of groceries. A 

blueprint of the kitchen is shown on which appears the foilowing text: 

Entropy is the biggest pro blern in the modem kitchen. Reguiating traffic flow, 
keeping fhgerprints, food particles and other unhygienic intruders out. A nucleus 
of order must be maintained. A kitchen is white steel and chrome for earlier 
detectioa Why is it that disorder is more contagious? 

White words across a black screen detail other written texts which are not traditionally signiscant: 

a List of groceries, a recipe for Mediterranean Potato Pie. The woman's status as a subject 

co~lstructed by these discourses is cleady articulated. These words idente her tasks: fetchuig 

groceries, cooking me&. She is identined primady with respect to her function in the kitchen. 

Her movements are prescribed; in tact, the shots which illustrate her actions are sfills. The broom 

which sweeps the floor is caught in a moment. McHugh descn'bes these moments as indications of 



'the woxnan as merely an agent of order; we never see her" (1 1 1). Rather, she is serialized in her 

As the scrohg text continues to tell the story, possibilities of resistance arise fiom within 

the discourse. We have already been told about the 'Wores t  of mcchini" It is in the disorderly 

space of the garden where the wornan h d s  resistance. Her h c t i o n  throughout has ken  to clean, 

to keep order, to cook. It is the disorder which encroaches and overcomes her. She tries to keep 

things under control but she cannot. The potato she grows as an expriment sprouts everywhere. 

It is a growth which 'Teeds off the flesh of the mother." The wornan is also associated with the 

potato; she is seen partialiy submerged in a bathtub, floating just on the edge. 

Just as the noise of the fiogs exists already within Jack's discourse in Hobgsworth's The 

House that Jack Built, so too do the constant tasks of preparing food and cleaning the ho use 

provide within them a small means of resistance. She has k e n  trying to keep the excess, the d i .  

of life at bay, but she cannot keep everything contained. She canwt keep up with the growth of 

the potatoes. The words which scroii over the screen document the gro wth of the potatoes, but 

also seem to lose their focus: 

During this tirne the potatoes were active. 
Their growth rate was phenornenal. 
She would like to measure their rate but 
is lmsble to set up her apparatus. 
Long vines curl around the kitchen windows 
and across the cupboard doors. The footprints 
of North American wildlifie are to be seen on 
her fieshly waxed floor. She has to 
pull the vines off the dish cupboard door 
to reach the bowl for her vegetables. 
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Here the kind of hguage used to d e m i  the eternal task of rnaintaining order is a parody of an 

officiai, rational discourse. The narrative is unable to contain the disorder which encroaches. It is 

fiom within this use of language that the disorder appears. The corresponding action of the 'plot" 

is sllnüarly parodic: the wornan escapes outdoors to eat the vegetables; she then leaves the house 

completely in the fij.-tale Ute ending of the nrst haif of the film, as she scatters a trail of seeds to 

guide her back, reminiscent of Hansel and Gretel scattering breadcrumbs on their way into the 

forest, away fiom home. Of course, the birds promptly eat the se&, as the voice-over tells us, 

sealing her fàte in the woods. Thus the wonmn7s escape is ais0 ironically comained. 

The wornan Ieaves the house, ostensibly to find more "containers" for the potato plant 

whkh is overwhelrning ber kitchen. This transition into the exotic wild space of the woods is 

accompanied by a significant fonnal change. No longer do texts scroll across the screen. As 

McHugh points out, "the woaan's aural presence, her voice, merges with the cacophony of the 

outdoors" (1 1 1). It is &O significant that this scemrio, in the woods, is the first t h e  the woman's 

body is shown in entirety; other shots have s h o w  only fhgments: a hand, a head, a shoulder. in 

the scene where her full body is shown, she is prostrate on the wet ground. When she rises, she 

has ground in and around her mouth and on her clothes. She looks directly into the camera, as 

though recogniziog that she is rnomentarily caught visually, at least, ifno longer with interposed 

text. She then flees. A voice-over intones: ''1 would like to say that 1 would like to Say that" in an 

incessant loop. This moment of recognition of the fernale subject is an almost direct refusal of 

traditionai representation. As Craig Mastemian says, ccSyrnbolicaliy, the loss of language 

corresponds to the woman's tàll fiom the patriarchal order" (19). She will not be captured in 

language, either wntten by texts, or seen by the camera 
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The woman's b4escapen to nature, however, is not unproblematic. The inability to speak is 

painfiily evoked. Rather than woman as "an organic effèct, a hiberated growth" (McHugh 1 1 l), t 

is possible to see the limitatioos the nIm expresses about this construction of identity. The woman 

fumbles towards identification, as yet unboni and unable to speak, or to be heard. The woman is 

positioned as an "eccentric subject," as Teresa de Lauretis would say ("Eccentric Subjects" 145); 

this afEords her the abdity to see what others cannot. Nonetheless, the woman's words are Eoze; 

her desire unable to be spoken The film in this sense shows the imbrication of language and 

desire. The repetition of 'W 1 wodd Iike to say" indicates the circular, seriaüzed playhg out of 

this role as subject, trappeci in an endless cycle of speaking in pre-recorded phrases, unable to give 

voice to what it is that she wodd like to say, and yet also unable to determine her desire without 

words. Aithough the woman runs away when she recognizes that she is seen or caught by the 

nIm, that she is for an instant "re-presented," the voicesver which begins inrmediately fol10 wing 

this encounter shows the limas of such a Ieap into the exotic, presumably umepresentable 

unknown. In its repetition and inarticulacy, this technique conveys the need to speak and to be 

heard. At the same time, language is broken d o m  by its sheer repetition, not unlike the ''taik 

trots" of Pegs in I am Yours. As Kathleen McHugh says, "Meaning becomes a ((1 11); the 

meaning is in the act of repetition of the words, rather than in the words themselves. Here a form 

of resistance is found. And yet this resistance is minimal. Although the texts such as the recipe and 

scrohg narrative on screen no longer constnrct her, in exilhg herselffiorn language, the woman 

must express herselfdifferently. She is without language and the limitations it entails, but this does 

not meau that she is in a more exotic, liberatory terrain. She must negotiate interactions 
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differently. The exotic here can be related to the "constitutive outside" of Butler; only in forays to 

the "outside" can change be made possible. 

Other images repeat the motif of the inevitabüity of containment, and the iueluctability of 

the mediated. Han& are taking pots out of pots out of pots, a ventable mise en abyme, as the 

layers of the onion are peeied back, to reveal no essential core. What remains instead is the empty 

shell, that which holds the dirt, the disorder. This space is not necessarily more Liberathg than the 

domeaic space of the kitchen; it is its reverse as signalled by the use of high contrast, negative 

film footage. The camera tracks the woman's joumey in the woods and to a j d q m d .  She fin& a 

radio, and vainly attempts to tune in a station, to make contact. She opens a book and voices on 

the soundtrack pour forth. She is aiii on a search for civiiization; she attempts to dornesticate the 

outdoors by serving dinner. A makeshifl table is set and a salamander and fiog placed on the 

plate. As the woman prods the fiog with her fork, t leaps off the table. The voice-over is a 

distorted recitation of proper table etiquette. 

In this film, there is an ambiguous relationship to the containment of disorder, to situating 

an identity satisfàctorily within society. This containment is restrictive, yet necessary. 

Representation is inescapable, even ifit is in language, as the final image of the film shows: it is a 

pend drawing of the woods, and, as Mike Hoolboom points out, "CarefUy scrutinized, it reveals 

a woman's %ce starhg back ftom inside one of the tree tninks, her body merged with her 

sunound" (Qtd. in CFMDC info sheet). The voicesver is m e d :  'khy is it that disorder is 

contagious?" Like the dirt that is everywhere, spilling over, there is an inabiüty to contain ail, and 

even an inabiity to separate chaos and disorder, or nature and culture. A potato is pianted in the 

kitchen, and gradually takes over the space. A blueprint of the kitchen is shown as evidence of the 
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growth of the potato as it encroaches everywhere, provoking the remark: "Who took my chair?" 

There is a vitality of lifé to the disorder, just as there is a necessity for containment for 

articulation. 

This film shows the limitations of the position of the woman in the first halfof the film, 

and especially the limitations of mastery: of the wornan, of space, of language. The alternative is 

not clearly articulated because of its dubious complicated nature. A moment early in the film 

articulates a state of subjectivity which exemplifies this ambiguity. As a fern dangles over her 

head, a wornan floats in the bathtub in which only her head is shown in the shot. She is both 

below and above the surface, on the cusp. Her head sometimes sinks lower, but is never 

submergeci, and never cornes out of the water: this is the state of the fernale subject in this film. 

She exists, literally, in air and in water, in two places at once. The trick is to maintah a precarious 

positioning. Ironicdy the "central character" is not centre-based at all: it is both everywhere and 

no where. 

In this way, the film encourages the active piecing together of the film and the m e n t s  

which f o m  the identity of the cennal character. Two different, linked processes are implied. Left 

with a disjointed narrative, the audience is encouraged to fill in the gaps in the story by making the 

links and connections between events and images. At the same tirne, there is a blurring here of the 

womm as both subject and object. Identity is again a state of liminality: it is evoked between the 

disorder and the chaos, neither exoticdy transcendent in an association with nature, nor chained 

to the domestic realm of the kitchen. Although the wornan as the subject of the film does not 

attain an agency which serves her, the audience, through the interpretive signposting and the 

fkgments of narrative, is compelled to imagine O ther possible ways of reading and viewing which 
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in tum activate sites of identity formation Again, the idea of identity which is here played out is 

that of Stuart Hall, which is a concept "operathg 'under erasure' in the mterval between reversal 

and emergence; an idea which cannot be thought in the old way, but without which certain key 

questions c m o t  be thought at d" (Questions 2). This concept of ide* is clearly articulated in 

the later films of Gruben which engage more M y  with narrative. 

S@ed Evidence: Desire and Narrative 

Although more soiicitous attempts are made at spectator engagement in Sifrd Evidence, 

there is stU a suspicion of viewing as consumption which pervades the nIm. A Merent audience 

engagement is demanded; the film inquires into the nature of desire in narrative, and narrative in 

desire. In my consideration of this film, the construction of characters as subjects is evident. The 

power which they wield and their abiüty to order, colonize, objecw and categorize is related to 

this position of mastery. Yet at the same time, this impuise is put into question. Agency which is 

achieved is Wed;  the subject as such is seriaüzed. 1 will dso suggest ways in which the nIm 

suggests a concept of identity as a site of ambiguity and offers a viewing experience which is 

thwarted in its attempts to consume. The self as a coherent entiv is destabilized at both the level 

of content and form in tbis film Where The Central Character explores the dynamic of rnastery in 

the formation of identity as positioned between civilization and nature, SFed Evidence considers 

it more explicitly in the imbrication with the other. 

In this film several subjects are realized. The central story of the film, a woman's 

experience as she attempts to visit the Ninç in Tlatilco, Mexico, is claimed by one woman in the 

outer M e  of the film, but the "story" is experienced by a Werent woman, a difterent actor. 
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DWerent bodies take up the same story. This is an miportant feâture of the film. On the one hand, 

it undermines the coherence of identity and story: what happened to whom is questioned. On the 

other band, it establishes a commonaiity for the experience of subjects; women have been treated 

similarly and do expenence similar situations. This is realized eisewhere in the film. The search is, 

&er dl, for archaeological evidence of f e d e  deities. The early part of the nIm depicts f e d e  

divinities of ancient Mexico and discusses their position and appropriation within cultures. This 

sequence moves into a more general discussion of the way in which women are codigured in 

society. The objeaincation of women is shown through shots and cornments on wornen's bodies, 

in various poses: "We are billboards on the street," proclairns the voice-over. 'Woman" as a 

rnythic subject is considered. Yet this does not suggest that there is a coherence and stabüity to 

this idea of womul The f e d e  divinities are examined more closely: there are two heads, two 

taces. Why the double image? This thought provo kes a discussion of the r n i n h d y  split. 

Cowections are made between these different modes of mastering an Other. The film becomes a 

meditation on the negotiation of a way of king which recognizes and attempts to rework this 

impulse of mastery. This inqujr is achieved by formai medjations which suggest a Werent 

attempt at negotiating knowledge and interactions which relinquish this impulse to dominate. 

It is in verbal language in the nIm that this impulse to contain, control and domioate 

occurs. At the beginning of the film, discursive authonties are seemingly reinforced. A 

documentary, academic tone sets the ternis of the inqujr: this is a discussion of f e d e  deities in a 

small village in Mexico with a feminist perspective. Point of view is emphasized: we must 'Vix the 

h e ,  set the zoom, pay strict attention to the cross hairs." An image finally cornes into focus. 

But the irony begins: a rnildly pontific voice declares sententiously, '70 reach that spot, we must 
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proceed from where we are." The truism is turned on its head. The question becomes instead a 

matter of figuring out exactly where "we" are coming fiom in the first place, as well as an 

interrogation of the imperidkm of "we." The story is as much about the search for an 

understanding of the woman's own complicaîed subjectivity as it is about her archaeological 

searck 

The film is situated at the beginning within the r e a h  of the public; the documentary 

inquiry, ho wever, quickly shifts into the realm of the private. The subject of the tilm M y  

appears on screen: a woman stands in a room, with her suitcase open, looking at what she has 

brought back from Mexico. She plays a tape of Spanish lessons which now becomes the 

background sound. As she fingers the items, she says, 'These are the elements of voluntary 

bandage." She has a bus ticket, a statuette, a bunch of dried flowers: "These represent the ide& 

of adventure, mystery, and romantic love." She loo ks directly into the camem. This complex 

beginning to the film sets up the intncate parameters of the narrative structure. The documentary 

tone provides an ideological h e  for what is a personal story. The film moves fiom a pseudo- 

objective stance to the very intimate. The disembodied voice of the documentary is shown: the 

objective tone is now situated withm a particuiar scenario. The universaking voice and 

proclamations at the beginning, therefore, are shifted into the realm of the particth. 

This shift is &O parallelled by the formal devices of the film as they are self-consciously 

foregrounded. A series of dserent kmds of shots and filmic techniques signals the settling hto 

perspective: words which scroll on a screen, shots of the globe, a shot of a chiid looking through 

binoculars, and a senes of slides as the goddesses are delineated by a f e d e  voice who gives an 

account of f e d e  deity in Christianity and other religions. This pedagogical tone is then 
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ahandoned when we hear the slide projector bebg shut off, and the story, the personai story, 

begins. The white screen also provides a deliberate pivotal point for the film. A woman, whose 

story, presumably, we are about to hear, waIks into the shot. There are now close-ups of the 

woman, looking very concemed, and pans of her room where her niitcase lies open, souvenirs, 

her O wn personal artefàcts dispiayed. in this way, the film situates the story of the woman within a 

larger histoncal and theoretical fiamework. This situahg is paralielied by a catdoguing of the 

devices which Gruben uses in her fila As Kass Bannhg says, 

The opening sequence literally catalogues the materiality of the cinema: the white 
screen, the projector, the disembodied voice track, etc. They provide the elements 
(such as the rear projection technique in the film) which are later reworked. (163) 

This nLn is self-consciousIy, discursively embedded in both history and the filrnic medium 

The repetition is emphasized throughout. The character in the film is on a search for the 

niins at Tlatilco where two-headed femaie deity figurines were said to be found, but she is a b  on 

a search to rnake sense of the personal artefàcts which she has retained. It is in this seme also a 

search through her own memory to recreate the past. Simply the reiteration of the various fernale 

deities emphasizes how the subject is repeated: both the same and Merent. Both Woman's 

expenence and wonran's experience are brought into tandem. This doubling of images is m e r  

carried out when the actual telling of the personal story begins with the introduction of the trip to 

the ruins in Tlatilco. With no explmation, the woman who is on screen in the Tlatilco sequences is 

not the same wornan as the one in the hotel room. The film is fiameci by a different character than 

the one who is experiencing the story, a woman whose name we only later, and rather 

incidentdy, h d  out is Maggie. 
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Maggie is aiso reconstmcted in her various guises according to her context. There is no 

inainsic nature to her identity; she is situated by circumstance. Her power and abiby to rnaster a 

situation or meanhg is dependent on context. As a white wornan tourist in Mexico, she has the 

money to be able to hire people to guide her. Since she does not speak the language, she is 

dependent on her guide. Hers is a cautionary tale, doomed to repeat a story told in the voice-over 

in the early part of the fiha Early in the film, the fkst narrator relates the story of a Canadian 

woman who was kidnapped and held for several days. She did not speak Spanish and could not 

make herselfunderstood. As the narrator says, T h e  man who took her didn't understand her 

words, mistook her curiosity for desire. Who knows what they finalEy meant to each other." 

Maggie, although not kidnapped, fin& herself in a similar experience with Jim Lilly, the Me+ 

man she hires to be her guide. As she cannot make herselfunderstood and he speaks some 

English, he translates for her. However, he misreads her signais; he thinks she is flirthg with him. 

Their relationship is ambiguou. As the voice-over says, "Who knows what they really meant to 

each other." The repetition of these words again aligns Maggie with the woman whose story was 

told earlier. Not only does this draw attention to the materiai circumstances of women, but it also 

sets up the inevitability of interactions which are rnodelled on a subjedobject relationship, of 

domination and subordination. 

As Banning writes, the filmic techniques set up in the early sequence of the film are put 

into practice in the '%tory" of Maggie. A dinerent WC texture predorninates in Maggie's story, 

suggesting a different but CO-existing reaüty: some touristic shots of Tlatiico are used, but most of 

these sequences are stills and fiont projections used as  a backdrop for the action of the characters 

on screen. This technique foregrounds the consûucted nature of action and character. The voice- 



over at this point in the film is also different. For those who are aware of it, it is the Texas drawl 

of Patricia Gmben. She performs a khd of translation of the nIm, a "he-said, she-said" relaying of 

information which e&ts another level of distanciation fiom psychological identification. The 

result is a complex layering of foregromded story-tehg in the nIm, so complex that spectator 

expectations are constantly thwarted. in this way, documentary blends into feminist tract into 

personai story into experimental study of subjectivity. The texture of the film changes charneleon- 

me. What story is king told? Whose aory? Why? As questions rebound, further conflicts and 

discrepancies arise. As the way in which the story is bemg told is put mto question, so the identity 

of the characters is shifted and unsettled. 

The conflicts which occur between Jim Lilly and Maggie are linked to the dWerent storÎes 

they teil about themselves. The characters are acting within their own narratives. Because of the 

way in which the film is constnicted, it appears as if the narratives are "duelling" rather dian the 

characters.' Like Thompson, Gruben foregrounds the struggles of characters who are dierently 

discursively detemiined. Kathleen McHugh draws attention to the tension that results: 

Ultirnately, the evidence we must sifi through concerm the tension elicited fiom 
their confiicting representations of what is ostensibly the "sarne" story. The 
viewpoint of Jim Lay AKA Charlie though mediated through the woman's voice- 
over narration, presents a perspective that d f i r s  fiotn, if does not overtly 
challenge, Maggie's point of view. (1 13) 

In this way, characters are s h o w  to be subjects ody insofàr as their respective narratives are 

concemed. Who they are is determined by who is speaking and who has control of the story. 

Maggie is rendered immobile by her inabiiity to speak the îanguage of the foreign country. She is 

also rendered powerless by the misreading of the semai politics of the situation These are not the 

See "duelling narratives" in Ric Knowles, 'The Achievement" 34. 
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ody ways in which she is constmcted as a subject, however. The film complicates the interactions 

between Jim Lüly and Maggie by the way in which it communicates their interactions. 

Just as Maggie's experience of Tlatilco is moderateci by what J i  Lilly chooses to tell her, 

the film exploits the manipulation of voice and Ianguage in the diegesis. A very complex vo ice- 

over is used in Sifted Evidence. Kay Armatage d y z e s  the image-voice relationship in her article, 

''About to Speak: The Woman's Voice in Pamcia Gruben's Siftd Evidence." The sepmation of 

voice and image, as others such as Doane and Silverman suggest, is a positive feminist move, for 

it rejects cinematic codes which in traditional Hollywood nIms lead to voyeurism and fetishisni of 

the f e d e .  The image of the character in Tlatilco is seldom synchronized with her voice. As 

Arrnatage notes, the disjunction between voice/irnage is achieved by the use of a f e d e  voice- 

over and a he-said/she-said relaying of action on the screen (300-301). This is not used to 

translate. On the contrary, sometimes the voice-over is O bviously relaying word for word what the 

characters are saying, as their lips can be read. This is at times disconcerting. By adding another 

dimension to the filrnic experience like this, it forces the spectator to slow down in hiskier 

"consumption" of the film. A much more active viewing experience is requireû. Checks and 

balances are made: is she t e h g  us exactly what they are saying? The dkembodied omniscient 

narrator is not accepted seamlessly. Furthermore, the audience is made to question an investment 

in a singular tnith. What is to ensure that we are receiving the idionnation correctly? 

As the film progresses, the narration changes sfightiy. These moments are significant and 

chart the i n thcy  of the characters. Maggie and Jim Lay miss a bus and are forced to spend the 

night at a hotel. She gets sick, he looks after her, and accuses her of giving her the wrong signais: 

he has amorous intentions. When they discuss their encounter over breakfast the next rnoming, 
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the voice-over declares, "during one of the long pauses he said he's Men in love with me." Here 

a shift in narrative perspective happens, as the narrator moves from third person to fim person: 

she aligns herself more overtly with the protagonist. She begins to intervene in other ways, 

directing her herohe, letting the audience know her name: "Maggie, look over to your lefi." The 

actodcharacter complies and sees thaî the bus is corning. The voice-over not ody narrates the 

action, but also directs the action. '2ook to your left, Maggie," she says, when the bus is arriving. 

ui the crucial scene in the hotel room when Jh Lilly attacks Maggie, dl objectivity is lost. As 

Armatage says, '?he voice-over of the filmmaker renims to intervene in the woman' s dilemma: 

'Just stop it, stop it and go!"' (302). The narrator overtly aligns herselfwith the woman. 

The sequence in the hotel room, where Jim Lay pins Maggie to the bed, is remarkable for 

its synchronization of sound and image. Narration stops. Events are expenenced in 'keai" time. 

The characters speak for themselves. As Kay Armatage points out, 

Not only does the hotel room scene re-posit the conventional unifieci spectator, but 
it argues once again the relation of wornan to the M y  ülusioned, hierarchicdly 
integrated cinematic world. It effects the renim of the woman as a helpless O bject 
of desire, characterized by and victirn of her lack. (3 02) 

It is ironic to consider that now that the woman has a voice, she is even more objectified, given 

the cumulative effect of viewing codes of Hollywood films. The repetition of the subject is 

emphasized in this sequence, as traditional Hoiiywood codes of viewing and the scene of an 

objectified, nearly raped woman is revisited. 

It is miportant, however, to comider the effet of such a scene as it works against the 

narrating convention that has been set up. The 'lie-said, she-said" narrative technique has k e n  

used for so long that it is accepted as equally naturaI. Kathieen McHugh interprets the switch to a 
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more 'kealistic" mode of interaction as a way that the & self-reflexively questions this form of 

representation: 

The flm that provides the context for this scene also undermines its validity in a 
representational sense. The reaiistic conventions that inforni it becorne apparent 
when juxtaposed with the modes of presentation used in the scenes that precede it. 
The film thereby presents diegetic realism as just another mode of representation 
with no privileged claim to tnith. (1 14) 

in addition to these observations of Armatage and McHugh, it is important to ernphasize the 

effect of such a switch on the spectator. The jolt fiom the usual rnethod of narration catapults the 

spectator into what is a more traditional filmic product. Because it is so unexpected, it is 

disturbing. It is also important to remember that before the narration, the image of Maggie in the 

bedroorn is filtered through the louvers of the window. Therefore, the voyeuristic experience of 

the spectator is foregrounded; he/she is implicated. In this sense there is the derno~l~tration of 

these positions as subject which are societally, c u l t d y  and representationally conditioned and 

avdable; at the sarne tirne, there is an inquiry bto a subject/object dynamic. As the viewing 

experience is pro blematized, the conditions for the repetition of such a subject formation are 

questioned. 

The subsequent scenes now resomte differenty. A M e r  change in the intimacy of 

subjecdviewer occurs when Maggie wakes up. It is very early in the moming and she takes this 

opportunity to head out to the niins by herself. A M e r  dimension to the layering of identity is 

added. Each voice-over this t h e  is echoed by a dreamlike Gerrnan translation Maggie's German 

heritage has b e n  duded to before, in conversation and in references to Rilke, but here it 

becornes an important reminder of another layer of her experience. T o r  our heart transcends us 

still, as it does in ancient times" is repeated throughout the film. The hem, desire, is unable to be 
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quantified, or accounted for completely; nonetheless, it is formed by cultural prescriptions and 

CO difïed ways of interacting . Choosing, sbaping, rewo rking, redenning one's representational 

matrix are perhaps the limits of autonomy although this agency is a h  put into question. 

There are other ways in which the coherence of the subject is undermined, and visions of a 

different concept of idenîity are made possible. AU of these techniques refer back to the viewing 

experience and implicate the spectator. One of these sites of ambiguity is the ihstration of 

narrative. in many ways in this fiIm, narrative is given over to narration. Very few things happen 

and those events that do are highlighted. There is always an attempt to catch a bus, to move, to 

make the story work, but this impulse is always fhstmted. As the voice-over says, "We don? 

expenence the continuum of time, just each moment as we pass through it." It is this kind of story 

which is given credence here. Events and spaces are left uucolonized. There is little irnpetus to 

move the story forward. If events are not understood, they are le& hard, whole, counter to the 

story, undigested. There are spaces which are not made fkdhr but rather are lefi in their 

confushg ambiguity. The narrative technique supports this. Gaps in the murative and in the 

continuity of events are le& as such. Rather than smoothing over inconsistencies, the film exposes 

unexplained moments and overtly questions their placement within the story. When Maggie and 

Jim have to stay at a hotel, having missed the last bus back to town, they wait by the pool. The 

voice-over questions the turn of events, and changes which have occurred: "How did they get 

nom one step to the next? Where did she get the batbing suit?" 

Stones, which begin at least twice, once as a documentary, once as a personal 

reminkence, tàll apart and never reach completion. The documentary q d t y  is dispensed with 

d e r  the beginning. The personal story, which is set up as an intrigue-who does what? how does 
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lnstead these questions are superseded by those of a more metaphysical nature: whose story are 

we hearing? what is the name of home? Narrative desire, then, is not so much denied as it is 

diverted. What does become evident is the way in which that desire is consmicted. The plot 

becomes a clever parody of the foreign adventure. A trip abroad does indeed become a means for 

'Vhding oneself." In this way, the dominant paradigm is reworked nom within, gently critique& 

but not overtumed. 

Narratives break down, possibly because so do words. The reason Maggie is W e d  in 

her voyage so rnany times is because of her inability to speak the language. The Spanish lessons 

fiequently recur on the sound track, mocking her feeble attempts at progress. But there are also 

other issues at stake here, a colonization of another sort. In speaking about her films, Trinh T. 

Minh-ha says, 

Any penon who has had prolonged interactions with country people and viUagers 
--whether fiom their own culture or fiom another culture-how that you have to 
learn to speak differently in order to be heard in their context. . . . Translation, 
which is interpellated by ide0 logy and cm never be objective or neutrai, should 
here be understood in the wider sense of the term-as a politics of coostnicting 
meaning. Whether you translate one language kt0 another language, whether you 
narrate in your own words what you have understood fiom the other person, or 
whether you use this person directly on screen as a piece of "oral testimony" to 
serve the direction of your film, you are dealing with cultural transition. (127-28) 

These remarks regarding cultural ~ctnsition are appropriate here, aithough this film is a fictional 

rendition, because Gruben's work is similariy deaüng with the space of the other and the 

complexities in nego tiating identity, and also, or perhaps concomitantiy, desire. 

In Sijted Evidence, issues of lace and class form part of the process of identifcation for 

this privileged white woman. This is the classic postrnodern Mure: the privileging of the loss of 



subjectivity at the expense of those who have not ever attained that space. Gmben makes 

cornparisons ifnot equations between vmieties of colonization which are occurring: the M e c s  by 

the Spanktrds, women by men, and perhaps her implication as a tourist in Tlatilco. 

Again the substance of the film is found in the particular. What the film addresses, subdy, 

never overtly, is the fernale tourist's desire for her Spanish guide, and his for her. Not only is Jim 

Lilly's desire to dominate Maggie problematized, but Maggie herseIf cornes under question in 

both her ambiguous relations@ with lim Lilly, and her colonising desire regarding the ruins of 

Tlatilco. The exotic on both sides is erotickd, but never resolved; both desire, neither dominates. 

J i  Lilly is objectified as much as Maggie is. His body is descn'bed in great detail. She sits by the 

pool in her bthing suit, in display. Maggie sits out too long in the sun and gets sick: fiom the 

sun? f?om the tequila? Jim Lilly takes care of her and the closeness perpetrates an encounter. They 

discuss each other's behavio ur: signs that have been misinterpreted. The next morning over 

breakfhst, he says she doesn't even know his real name. Indeed she doesn't. As the waiter informs 

her, his name is "Charlie." He tells her he loves her. He sings her a Song: "You led me on" She 

comments on the cliché. But they do not leave each other. There is a constant push-pull between 

them. She continues to miss buses and taxis. Her movements towards escape are ineffectua. 

Again they end up in a hotel room where the fhd, most intimate encounter between the two 

OCCU~S. Jim/Charlie cornes to say good-bye to her. He says he has a date, she suggests he leave. 

When she attempts to leave, he grabs her and wresties her to the bed. She screams. Suddedy the 

texture of the film changes, and synchronization between voice and actor occurs, as mentioned 

earlier. 'Tm sure they heard me," she says. T m  sure they ciid," he says. They separate, but no 

resolution is reached. No responsibility is taken. No one responds to the scream. Rather than 



resolving the action, the moment at which the voice-over aops and the body speaks is 

disconcerthg and arnbiguous still. 

The ambiguity of the relationship and the circulahg desire between Maggie and Jim Lilly 

is illustrated in repeated images of rnovernent. The two of them are almost always on the way to 

somewhere, by taxi, motorcycle, or bus, but they are unable to get where they are going. The 

most important scenes of the film happen in the waiting spaces: the d e ,  the hotel. It is in this 

üminal space where J i  Lilly M y  dweh. One of the last sequences of the film uses the w w  

famihr Mue-screen projection Maggie is on the bus, finally leaving Jim Lüly and her quest 

behind. As the bus drives away, she sees or imagines him &g behind, eventualiy gaining on 

the bus, mil, in the bizarre overlay of film and fiont projection, he is framed in the back window 

of the bus, larger tha. iifie, as she gazes at him Then the bus tum a corner, and as she and we 

watch, Jirn Lay tum and runs away fiom the bus. In this film identity is problernatized by the 

narrative fiutration. Images such as these &O suggest how the subject/object diçhotomy is based 

on dornination/subordination, and how this dynamic is easily reversed and the cycle perpetuated. 

From cultural story to gender critique to personal reminiscence to travelogue, Sifted 

Euidence continues to shift shape, suggesting the perils of acting in the t e m  of a linear narrative 

structure, and offering possible ways of a dserent configuration of identity. One of these ways is 

h the archaeoIogical motif, and the visit of the stranger to a foreign land. SiJed Evidence is also 

about a pçychic colonization. In S~rangers to Ourselves, Julia Kristeva uses the trope of 

'Yoreignness" as a way of describing the venture into psychic space unknown, "a constant quest 

for welcoming and gohg beyond the other in oneself' (75). She descnks how St. Paul spoke to 

the psychic distress of his foilowers and how he 'proposed a journey between two dissociated but 
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d e d  spheres that they CO uld uncover in themselves-a jomey between 'body' and 'soul"' (77). 

The foreigner is thought of as "one who does not belong to the state we are in" (90). In many 

ways, Kristeva's theorking of the foreign as a psychic space of "perpetual transience" (3) is a 

trope that recurs in Gruben's work. As .Kristeva says, 'Vie space of the foreigner is a moving 

train, a plane in flight, the very transition that precludes stopping" (7). 

In Sifled Evidence, the foreigner and her invasion have a multitude of resonances. The 

psychic transience of Maggie is represented by the layers that code her experience: the several 

voices and the vario us filmic techniques. She is not securely located in one place. The foreigner 

can also be considered a visitor to the b'constitutive outside" that Judith Butler descnis. Tlatilco, 

as a place of exclusion, is a place where she can journey in order to configure a new way of king. 

As in The Centraf Character, the exotic space of the other realm is problernatizzd; distinctions 

between zones are blurred, just as Maggie's desire and Jirn Lilly's desire fluctuate. The traveiier 

ventures into unknown territory to leam something. In this case, Maggie is looking for lest female 

deities, a search which has almost been forgotten because t has ken  so often deferred. But her 

search is important because it is a search for origin and a search for the mother. 1 am not 

suggesting that this motif is a search for completion. Rather these others (Jim Lay, the female 

deity, the mother) corne to Maggie through this realm of the "constitutive outside." It is the 

process by which they are reintegrated into the film and constantly coded that brings us to 

the discursive terrns of this discussion. Dan Nadaner points out ho w this film co~l~tantly 

interrogates the production of meanhg : 

We are constantly reminded, through a string of original textuai and visual devices, 
that meaning is culturaIIy coded and that authenticity is therefore pro blematic. The 
wornan wants to know, for exampIe, the precise moment when Jim Lilly feu b love 



with her. Whüe she was drinking tequila in three feet of water in the pool T t  was a 
pose 1 'd copied fiom a travelogue" (sic). (1 4) 

Just as  this expenence is doomed to repeat the story of the Canadian traveller who was 

kidnapped, so too here there is another repetition, an imitation of f o m  Visudy and thematically, 

the fikn questions its own production and attempts to find ways out for a different articulation of 

identity. On the one hand, there is Maggie's own posing and participation m bringing about her 

own situation. On the other han& the fernale traveller here is not undmood, (language is a 

coustant struggle); she is fearfùi, aione and pursueci. She is in a land coded by male gestures. 

The identity which results fiom the journey of the foreigner is a reiterated, fhgmented 

king. The woman who M e s  the film is not the same as the woman who represents her in the 

story sequence. The narrator of the story sequence uses other voices, most signincantly that of 

Paticia Gruben herself Dan Nadaner emphasizes the voice of Gmben, who is Texas-bom and 

retains this grain of voice: 

Gmben is a master of the drawl. Drawl--the slow, twanged speech of southem and 
western Americans-4s conventionally interpreted as havhg to do with heat, open 
spaces, slow thought, slow action Gruben's drawl, however, is intermeshed with a 
cornplex multi-layered narrative, not a yarn told on the fiont porch This 
unconventional content changes the meaning of the vernacdar speech, just as the 
vemacular changes the rneaning of the content. The tone of voice becomes the 
expenential meeting ground between 'hatural'? (as in non-intellectualized) Lived 
experience and the debilitating shock of intellectualiy self-aware uncertainfy. (1 5) 

As Nadaner goes on to note, Gruben's Gerrnan heritage also infiltrates the film. Her voice, her 

story, perhaps the "fiction," of the film with its multiplicity of voices and distancing techniques, is 

more 'keal" than the short sequences which hme it. The 'teal" of Patrick Gniben is set hto a 

space which is fiamed by the intellectuai voyage of the woman in the hotel room, even more 

conventionaily shot and consistently reaiized than the synchronized voice/image attack in the 
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bedroom sequence. The woman in the hotel room, reminiscing in a Proustian f'asfüon over her 

mementoes, e d  on a difterent plane. These strategies of realisrn are put into question. 1s the 

spectator now also introduced to a foreign territory, as he/she is plummeted back to conventions 

which smooth over the constructed nature of reality? Here Gruben chooses to stop (literally stop) 

the film at the point when the character returns to the hotel room. This sequence is &ed in a 

manner which erases all evidence of the M c  apparatus; no rear projections or voice-over 

techniques are used. The film ends in a shot tbat is inscrutable. The woman, who clearly appears 

upset, looks at the camera; the shot is fiozen. The film ends abmptly, questionhg the possibilities 

of narrative engagement and the viabiiity of the conventional subject. Although the voice works 

agamst the look and thereby challenges conventional narrative and patriarchal structures, no 

coherent answer is provided. Armatage qualifies the autonomy, or ability to speak of such a 

subject : 

The "evidence sifted" bas provided no answers to her quest. As ifto assert the 
impossibility of resolution or escape into a finally activated alternative discourse, 
the woman is suspended in a fkeze-fiame just as she tums to the carnera and 
opens her mouth. She is fiozen in silence--about to speak. (303) 

The snai sequence of the film is hcinating. It is usefùl to consider the visual lead up to this shot. 

There is a pan of pictures on the wall, of Mexican vülage shots, until the woman is shown, hmed 

in the doorway. The shot is an interesting composition, for the woman is in the doorway, on an 

angle slightly k i n g  to the viewer's right. On the w d  on the other side of the doorway, slightly 

k i n g  left, is a picture of a woman, resembhg the woman in the Tlatilco sequences. As the film 

ends, the spectator, at least, is ironically offered up the two-headed de@ which was introduced as 

the intrigue at the begi-g of the film. 



This ironic remlution can be considered a ijminai space, where the unity of huma- is 

rejected, stopped, disallowed. It is not oniy the patriarchal construction of a fernale subject which 

is critique& but also the humanist unity of self. Beyond this, an alternative discourse is perhaps 

already articulated in the multiple tniths, voices and identities which co-exist in this film. Sifted 

Evidence does more than reject patriarchal constructions of the selF, the mode1 of subjectivity it 

offers involves a different kind of identity formation Stones are equally as  limiting. The need is to 

teii stories, perhaps without ends. The film, like this nnal shot, is perhaps a meditation on this 

space between, in the constant push and pull of narrative. In a postmodem fèmini(;t identity-in- 

process inadequate words and the desperate need to speak coalesce. 

Low mibility: 'a growth which feeds off the mother" 

In Sijted Evidence, the story does not put forth the thoughts or perspective of Jirn Lilly. 

He is, in this way, not known. In Low Visibility, Gmben's first feature length film, part of the 

enquiry of the film is just this: to speak the male subject. In a newspaper article, Gruben descriis 

her search: 

Of Low Visibiliry's hcoherent hero, known as 'The Man Who Ate The Nurse," 
she muses: "1 wasn't aware til the fïim was halfshot that it was about how 1 can't 
presume to speak for men." (In B a c h  1) 

[n an interview, she elabrates on this particular inquiry into subjectivity: 

1 wanted to make a film using a man as the ma i .  character, but I'm outside of male 
subjectivity, of course. It goes back to the idea of making a nIm about the 
limitations of my own imagination and the medium itself. The Bones character is 
an absence rather than a presence-people feed into him what they want to get out. 
("Inte~ew" 2 1 ) 
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The centrai character of this film is Mr. Bones, an amnesiac who was found w a n d e ~ g  near the 

site of a plane crash. The film engages a desire for narrative as dues about Mr. Bones' story are 

pieced together. At the same tirne, the film re-constnicts his identity. At the hosptal, various 

doctors and nurses attempt to get Mr. Bones to speak and relate to them: '4 just want to know 

how fâr we have to go to get you back here with us," says one of the doctors. The male doctors 

ernploy clinical tests and use objects in an attempt to get Mr. Bones to retrieve the use fiinction of 

language. The f e d e  nurses take a less orthodox approach. They tease and joke with hh, and 

christen him Mr. Bones because he likes to play with chicken bones and because he is the straight 

rnan for the nurses. Later in the film the name takes on other resonances when it becornes 

apparent that this man camibalized the other corpses in order to survive. The film k an 

interrogation of the discourses which constnict identity, as well as a study of the impossibility of 

kno wing another's experience. 

Although Mr. Bones presents an interesthg study of the construction of the subject, 1 will 

focw on the central character oniy insofiir as it relates to the identity of the women. This nIm uses 

canniiaiism as a metaphor for the consurnption of the 0 t h  in the subjedobject dynamic 1 have 

been discussing. It is discovered that Mr. Bones cannibaiized a nurse on the plane. She was 

pregnant. As in The Centrd Chc~rucfer, a recurrent theme is the "growth which feeds off the 

mother." The nurses at the hospitai, ironicdy, are the only ones who are able to elicit a response 

nom Mr. Bones. They give him a name. They reach him tangentially, through jokes and possibly 

through the unconscious. They dream about him, their voice-overs tell us; they dream about aU 

their patients. These nurses, in their white uniforms, represent the subject in an endless cycle of 

repetition. Atternpts to change the cofiguration of identity are few. 



The psychic provides an interesthg counterpoint to this type of identity. She is a site of 

ambiguity, embroüed in the psyches of others. The identity which she has is intricately Linked and 

dependent on others. Ln this way, she is portrayed as a contingent being, a way of knowing which 

is not self-containeci, but k t u r e d  in its integrity. Interestingly she plays a significant organiPng 

role, yet she is never seen on camem She is employed by the police to help unearth the truth, but 

she is unable to corne up with any substantial dues. 

The psychic c m  be read as a means to a different situating of identity. Her vision and her 

way of understanding are underrnined at points throughout the nIm. At one point aeriai shots of 

the forest and mountsins fiom a plane are accompanied by the voices of the psychic and the pilot 

or detective who is accompanying her. She directs the plane through a pass that they have aiready 

passed. The man points this out. The psychic sighs, "Oh, I don't know." And yet at other points, 

she gives us the only real glimpses into the crash site: through her eyes we see brief clips of trees, 

snow and wreckage. At the end of the &II, there is a shot over fog, high in the air, where trees 

and landscape are only barely glimpsed. The voice-overs are of the psychic and the nurse who was 

camibaiized. The dialogue is enigmatic: 

Where are you? (JMing, I'm flying) 
Are we in the plane? (no) 
And the baby ? (It 's moving) 
It's you 1 want, you know; he was jus? ail we had - the dive one. 
Did you tell them yes? (Yes? oh no, I coddn't. I couldn't taik; they never asked 
me) 
You don? need to tdk now? (Can I now? Can 1 taik?) 
The blue wings fade and it's aU only blue ... (Qtd. in Mason 44) 

As Joyce Mason suggests, perhaps the psychic hims that ' ive rnay have b e n  foUowing the wrong 

mory all along" (44). Again, the film teases and tempts the spectator to seek out the subject and to 
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relate to it in a particular way and then it fkustrates and thwatts these attempts. Mr. Bones is 

never redy "known," not by the spectator, nor by the nurses. As Gniben says, this film is ako 

about the flhmkhg experience. The conceit of Mr. Bones' re-education is realized through the 

language games of the docton and the nurses, but it is also mediated through different 

media: sornetimes through shaky hand-held camera shots, as though an on-spot news item is king 

filmeci; or through a video sucveillance camera in the hospital, or in a more realistic strategies of 

fiùnic representation. In addition to the fltering of the images, video footage, or television 

programming fiequently is part of the scene. Sometimes this creates a dizying effect of mise en 

abyme. Scenes fkom earlier in the nIm are rephyed to Mr. Bones at a later point. These scenes 

show Mi. Bones participating in a game to help hlln idenw pictues of people who are dead. 

Gniben discusses how she used to work in a hospitd videotaping group therapy sessions: 

In one case there was a schitzophrenic (sic) patient who didn't bave any sense of 
his own body, and we would tape him doing things like brushing his teeth, and 
then the doctors would play the tapes back to show him to himself. (In CFMDC 
info sheet) 

This replaying of scenes emphasizes the way in which subjectivity, as Butler points out, is attained 

by reiteration. If Mr. Bones could figure out how to repeat himself properly, he would be 

welcomed back to society. Not only do the doctors want Mr. Bones to watch himself, they also 

want him to watch other people, especidy on television, to gain an undetstanding of correct 

behaviour and interaction, to be like other people. The conditionhg of Mr. Bones as nich is 

emphasized. The shows on television take on an ironic significance when a documentary features 

ants eating other ants. Srnarties are used as a reward for the correct m e r s  to the games the 

doctors play with Mr. Bones; Pavlovian responses are rewarded. The film emphasizes the 
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arbitrariness of language, and the way in which it constructs obedient weU-behaved subjects. In 

another sequence, a slow pan of television monitors in a room reveals five Merem "realities" 

phying out, among them one of the previous episodes of Mr. Bones and an RCMP officer, and a 

fight aitendant demonstrating emergency procedures. Finally the canera stops on a woman who 

is watching one of the monitors. She is watching a news aory about Mr. Bones. Again this 

technique emphasizes how context determines emphasis and shapes relations of power. 

It is again the psychic who demonstrates the sïpperiness of hguage and the importance 

of contextual readings. Her voice describes what she is seeing, which the detective and the 

spectator assume to be part of the crash site. Ln her atternpt to connect with the man, she sees 

glas  and an orange parachute; she hem a crash. As her voice enmerates these items, the film 

shows Mr. Bones in his hospital room There are close-ups of the ice-med water pitcher, a melted 

orange crayon, and items fàüing to the floor: the counterparts to the images that the psychic 

evokes. Here the imperfect relationship between language and thought is highlighted. There is no 

single, fixed meaning. The spectator is given at least two dimemions/regimes to entertain at once. 

As the film progresses, it becomes more and more evident that language or any kind of attempt to 

make a direct representation of reality is u~satisfàctory. Only ghpses  of a temporary clarity, like 

the ones the psychic experiences of the crash sight, are available. 

A direct relationship between language and fiinction, such as the doctor demands, is 

restncting. In one of the gamedtests he orchestrates, the doctor displays several items on a table: 

a comb, a toothbwh, a Lighter, etc. The doctor begins each of his requests with, "As completely 

as possible, tell me what you do with this." Mr. Bones, however, does not comply. He picks up 



the comb, and he brushes his teeth with it. The doctors, with thek scientifïc and rationai discourse 

are t qkg  to get Mr. Bones to compfy to theù kind of logic: 

. . . the police, iike the doctors, can only examine hmi. Moreover, they can only do 
so fiom across the distorting distance dictated by a normality defhed in 
oppositionai terms (to what is "wrong," "bad," "abnormal," etc.), and protected by 
closure: what keeps the doctors and the police and the authoritarian values they 
serve and protect safely inside the structures of socialkation is precisely what shuts 
Mr. Bones, and the radical alternatives to 'horrnality" he represents, out. (Pevere, 
''Radical Marpinaiia" 56) 

Mr. Bones already speaks ftom a place outside of binarist terms. It is the psychic and the nurses 

who are able to gain access to that space. 

The nurses find Mr. Bones attractive. They gossip about what might have happened, but 

they also refuse to presume what his experience was Iike. As with the nurses, the film establishes 

the character as Likeable. What is remarkable about many of the reviews is their commendation of 

the performances of the actors: 

Few f i g e  fiLnmakers are as good at directing actors as Gruben, and Larry Lillo 
develops a convincing portrait of traumatized insanity. Never hysterical or 
obvious, he unfolds the character as the point of unity in the nIm. (Kaja np.) 

In particular they stress the "reality" of the perfoxmances: 

The cbaracters are fàscinatingly well-played, their peculiarities making them so 
' teal." Delightfiil idiosyncrasies, whether the inadvertent result of pec uliar acting 
styles or intentional characterisations, elict a response of pure delight in the variety 
of human expression/communication. Both the clichés and the individuality of 
human behaviour are evident, presenting the familiar in a way which makes us 
recognize it-giving the sense of knowing it better for knowing t again? (Mason 
44) 

Where the performances of the actors emphasize reaiity as CO herent in their psycho logically 

motivateci performances, there is always a meta-fihic awareness of how experience is rnediated. 

For example, the video clips which are used in the television sequences that Mr. Bones watches 



are, according to Gniben, intended to elic t those responses which are then hstrated by the nIm 

Ail these stories t u .  around questions of sumival and consumption, and "cue" the 
progression of a film which M y  doesn't progress at ail but doubles back on 
itself, like the mad trapper wallcing in circles. (In CFMDC info n.p.) 

The film not oniy questions the coherence of identity through the use of the psychic, but it also 

achieves this effect in the way in which it works on the viewer. The experience of watching the 

film is dislocating. Expectations are set up which are not dashed so much as queried. A certain 

amount of empathy is gained for Mr. Bones in the sympathetic, 'kalistic" pomayal of him. and 

yet at the same tirne, this empathy is complicated. The i3.m is both an exploration of the Iimits of 

understanding the other and an exploration of the embeddedness of an identity within the other. 

The question remains: is it a "growth which feeds off the mother" or a growth which is 

communicative and interactive? An argument can be made for Mr. Bones as the empty centre of 

the film. I f  it is an empty centre, it is also paradoxically full, for the viewer is constantly projecting 

bits of information, trying to filter through the noise of the nIm, inevitably b a t e d  in this search 

for coherence. As Gniben implies, the film implicates the audience in the temtory between the 

fictional and the real: 

I've dways had a terrible conflict as a filmmaker and a writer . . . because I've 
aiways really wanted to work in fiction, as opposed to documentaries. But I never 
felt Like 1 had the right to fool people. And so, aIthough 1 really hate reflexive 
films, 1 always feel I have to sort of admit to people that what they're watching is a 
construction in some way. That way, 1 leave some openings for them to draw their 
own conclusions. Or at least they can be aware of ho w they 're king manipulated. 
(In Leydon, "A Meditation" E 1) 

The audience awareness of manipulation also extends to an active construction of meaning and a 

different construction of identity. 



The enigma of what happened and of who is responsible is brought to a form of closure by 

language itself. A final due at the crash site is found: a W. The wrinen words implicate Mr. 

Bones in the crime, but it is still impossible to know the tnith. The writer of the d i q  descriks a 

broken leg. Mt. Bones bas no broken bones. The woman's name, we fïnd out, is Mary Ames. She 

was pregoant. The diary niminates on her death, and on the possible death of her baby. It asks 

whether it keeps feeding on the mother. Mary, the archetypal mother, is also Agnes, the sacrificial 

lamb. She is M y  reached by the psychic, in the confùsing last scene of the fiLn which 1 have 

quoted above. The film continually shows how things are seen, not who the victim, or Mr. Bones 

or who the psychic are. Idemity, it seems, is contingent also on perceptions of others. Mr. Bones, 

who is ofien on screzn, is not understandable. This unity in a main character is denied. Instead, as 

in S#ed Evidence, the spectator makes the correiation between mpeaking subjects and 

hgmentary voices; bodies and voices are disjointed. Gruben herselfdescnis the ineniible nature 

of this finai scene: 

It's difncult to understand the scene because it depends on recognizing the voices 
of two characters-the claWoyant and the nurse. The clairvoyant has entered the 
mind of the cannibaiized woman, and the nurse has entered the mind of the 
clairvoyant. The nurse asks the claiawoyant/dead woman, '?)id the men ask you 
whether it's okay to kill and eat you? Did you tell them yesTy And the 
clairvoyant/dead woman answers, '9 couidn't talk," and then "The blue wings fade 
and it's all only blue." The plane is disappearing into the fog here and they're 
entering a place where you dony t need a plane to fly, they' re taking off in a psychic 
sense. Because we haven't gone through what they have we can't follow them, so 
the film has to end here, at the limit of what it's able to represent. (In Low 
VisibiliS, CFMDC info sheet) 

This comment ultimately brings to the fore one of the issues which this mode1 of the postmodern 

feminist identity @lies: to what extent does comprehension or more properly, lack of 

comprehension b d e r  the meaning of the &? How is different spectator satisfàction ensured? 1s 
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it necessary? Evaluative ternis corne into question Aithough complete subjectivity or relativism is 

not an option for femlliism, as it already asserts specinc terms in its agenda, where are iimits 

established? This film turns on itseiffor answers, questioning the consumption or colonization 

which is implied in both nImmaking and storytelling: 

It's a fiLn that's M y  about filmmaking and ernpathy. Movies show us events and 
characters we're expected to believe in, but ifit's not our story, how do we know 
whether it's true? I'm not saying we can't know, but what son of took do we 
apply to these experiences to test whether they're authentic or wt, and in an 
extreme case of SUTVival., how can we ima.ghe what that's like? (Gruben in 
CFMDC MO sheet) 

As Gmben suggests m these comments, there are necessarily limits to representation, and perhaps 

there is even a necessary cannibaüzing in the desire to imagine the experience of the other. The 

active foregrounding of this questioning and refi?iming of authenticity, however, is in itselfan 

attempt to deal with an idea of identity in which reasoning does not have all the m e r s .  This 

formation of identity also implies a different way of understanding which may mean that it is also 

on the knife-edge of comprehension, always wilüng to consider what is impossible to consider. In 

thk regard, the ttle resonates: Low VisibiIity indicates the foglike comprehension of the film, the 

difnculty in both king seen and in seeing. 

Ley Lines: (auto) bio-mythography 

The questioning of the dynamic with the other and the theoriziqg of an identity within the 

community at large is ais0 the focus of Ley Lines. This is a fascinating film which now M y  

catapults Gmben into the middle of her own theorizing. This t he ,  rather than tangentially 

questioning her own ontology, she IiteralIy becomes the central character. In Ley Lines, Gruben 
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uses her search for her origins of identity as a way of seekmg out the place of the particular within 

the whole. ui this respect, this fiim is perhaps the moa postmodern of all her works, for it is the 

process of wnting a "petit récit," as Lyotard wodd say, while trying to grapple with the 

overarching presence still of the master narratives, which, although crumbling, still fom a skeletal 

structure of existence. 

In Ley Lines, the extraterrestrial seems to be one way, at least, of escaping earth-bound 

ways of thinking. Lronicdy the film opens with an ending. The first shots are of the las sequence 

of the nIm, The Incredible Shrinking Man. As the man gazes up at the heavens, he contemplates 

his own liminai state of being: "What was I? Still a human king or a man of the friture?" He 

decides that despite his tininess '90 God there is no zero. 1 nill exist." There is a point where the 

infinite and the infinitesimal meet. The idea that existence begins and ends is man's conception, 

not nature's. The credits are shown: 'Yhe end" cornes across the screen. 

It is no coincidence that Gruben seKre£lexively begins her film wÏth the end of this film, 

and piggybacks her own musings onto this conclusion. The voice-over, Gruben's own voice, 

ponders: 

When 1 was a girl, that was my favourite movie and just like him 1 couldn't stop 
thuiking of myselfas the centre of the universe. But what wodd bappen when the 
hcredible shrinking man became too s m d  to have a brain? It would have been too 
scary jus to disappear. 1 had already given up on Sunday schooL 1 had to f i d  
something. 

The master narratives that places such as Sunday school provides were not çufncient m e r s  for 

the young Gruben. It seems unlikely that there will be any resounding conclusions like the one we 

have just seen. Yet, a response is necessary; disappearing is not an option. Ley Lines is almoa a 

response to The Incredible Shrinking Man insofàr as it features the '5ncredible expaading 
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identity" of Patricia Gruben, for her quest for understanding her identity takes her across the 

world. Texas, Germany, and Tuktoyaktuk become geographical counterparts for the expanse of 

her thought, for her ability to adapt herself and constnict herself fiom various discourses. 

Gniben's m e r  is in fixing the ley lines of her lifé across an expanse of the world, and in 

becoming bigger, rather than smaller. Or rather, perhaps Like the Incredible Shrinking Man, the 

answer is in discovering that there are ways in which the innnite and the intinitesjmal meet. 

The juxtaposition of this old biack and white, rather pompous footage, with Gruben's 

rerniniscence of her own chüdhood memory creates a dissonance which provokes humour. 

Serious questions about the universe are countered with childlike musings. It is part of negotiating 

this inner/outer tension, this curious compulsion to siîuate the particular within the whole, which 

is also the inscri'bing of the identity of &ben. The self-conscious fictionaüzlig is foregrounded: 

the question becomes not so much 'îvhere do 1 belong?" but '%vhat represents me?" or "how do 1 

represent myseP' Paaicia Waugh descnis how, in a patriarchal society, the question "Who am 

I?" is better replaced by "What represents me?" for this question recognizes the impossibility of an 

ultimate unity and fjxity of king (1 1). To this 1 would add Stuart Hall's remarks on a concept of 

identity which is 'hot the so-cded return to roots but a comiog-to-te=-with our 'routes"' 

(Questions 4). In Sijted Evidence, the very title indicates the approach to representdon: finding 

the evidence, the archaeological clues to reconstnict an existence. In Ley Lines, Gruben's semch 

of fàmily and personal history is marked by leys, a metaphor for the siting systems of her lifé: 

Leys are invisible lines that can only be traced by the points that mark them: sacred 
s p ~ g s ,  ancient trees, temple cities, beacon hills, standing stones. 
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As Gmben's voice narrates, shots of these leys are s h o w  a realistic documentary technique. The 

voice-over corresponds to the objects shown. Yet we quickly discover that these are not at all the 

leys that she means. Her choices of leys end up king quite dinerent, a h o a  randoa As leys are 

insignincant alone, so are the events in Gruben's Me until she imposes a pattern on them, uutil she 

views them through her sights and marks her territory, until she names the 'koutes" she has taken. 

M e r  the description and sequencing of leys, a child's voice asks: Wouldn't it be neat if 

you could fkd those lines in your lifè so they ali make sense about why you were bom and who 

you knew and how you were connected to the universe?" "You mean iike connect the dots?" 

cornes the reply. And it does seem to be a kmd of transformative game with the leys you find. 

Once the triangle is formed by the leys, then 'would you be inside the triangle or would you be 

the triangle itself," Gruben asks. "WeIi, what is you?" asks the child. T o u  how," says Gmben. 

But the chüd persists. "Where do I leave off and the world begins?'' In this transitional space, 

what is me and what is not-me? How to make use of the objects 1 play with? How to represent 

me? 

With the ley as the conceit of the film, there is already a removal from the coherence of the 

subject. Identity is posited as  king found between the straight lines marked out by the leys. There 

is a l i n g e ~ g  linearity in the connections between the leys, just as there is a sense of identity as 

king dependent on the a c c d  of subjects. These separate subjects which feed into this identity 

illustrate the tension between rnastery and non-mastery and the singular and the plural. Five voices 

constitute the voice-overs of the film, according to Gruben, and the nIm is classically mctured: 

It's consmicted classicaliy in a Prologue, three Acts (Texas, Germany? 
Tuktoyaktuk) and an Epiiogue. The Prologue introduces the thesis and the five 
Narrators of course are the five voices of the Subject: the Filrmnaker; the Little 



Girl; the Academic; the Old Texas Aunt; and the German Wornan. The sixth voice, 
the Inuk Woman, is aiso a subjective voice but doesn't show up tilI the last Act as 
befits her alien status (den to me, that is). ("Letter") 

These voices are all subjects which assert a momentary coherence in order to contil'bute to the 

narrative which is Ley Lines. A formation of identity as a series of subjects is evident in these 

voices. To signify the ordering elements of narrative, Gniben has chosen particular moments of 

coherence which are both parts of herseif and parts of her community. 

The film is most kequently narrateci by Patricia Gniben herseifand an inquistive young 

child, often in dialogue. The child's voice transcends time. She is both present and pas& wise 

beyond her years, and yet unbom, unrealized. The chüd may be the younger Gniben and in this 

way represent the "uow" which in retrospect has k e n  given a position, a rneaning within a 

narrative. In any case, the chiid is exceedingly inquisitive, probing Gruben to explain exactly what 

she means. The other voices of the women are intenvoven in the complex narration. The Texas 

Amt is obsessed with ascertaining facts and constnictiug the M y  tree. A siightly accented 

German voice speaks poetry. As in Gruben's other films, the sound track is complex. It is 

impossible to retain all. But this is also part of her technique, for the spectator, too, overwhelmed, 

confused, bombarde& must sift through the experience and comect the leys for guidance. Have I 

read Marx? Do 1 understand G e m ?  Have I seen Giant? How many cultural, Iiterary, 

philosophical, historical references wiil I c d  on a &st viewing? Obviously this is a concem for 

any reading of a work of art, but in Ley Lines, the horizon of expectations of the spectator is 

ernphasized. The film is so dense that it is impossible to retah d; momentary choices must be 

made, and the impulse to understand and consume all must be rehquished. 
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There is a power to this film in its desire to take on ahost more than it can hande. Ruby 

Rich descnis the way in which the nIm manages to cross genres, to be both large and d at 

the same Ume: 

Rarely do women take on epic forms or dare to inhabit universal positions. AU the 
more power, then, to Gniben: she's taken the form of the personal documentary, 
cross-fertilized it with experimental asides and conceits, then cast her whole 
genedogical search for orighs as a philosophical discourse between herseifand a 
Young girl- (np-1 

Gruben eschews neither the universal nor the particular, but manages to corne up with a voice that 

negotiates this territory carefùily, dways aware of the participation of the individual within larger 

culturai and historical discourses without losing sight of the specificity of experience. Ley Lines in 

this way addresses both the various subjects which rnake attempts at agency and at the same the ,  

in its overail positing of identity, offers a different model for knowledge and interaction. 

One of the ways in which this model is achieved is through the multiplicity of voices. 

These voices are very specXcdy oriented, as Gruben herseifso carefùliy outlines. In their 

interactions, however, they also probe and question one another, so that their combined dialogue 

undermines the individuai coherence of each subject. The voice of the little girl pushes the 

filmmaker herself to çtumble and Say, "1 don' t kno W." The answers which are to be fo und are 

simply temporary and of the moment. 

In addition to voice, which always plays an important role in ordering Gruben's h, 

O bjects and space are &O significant. Gniben's ley lines lead her to Spur, Texas, to Koln, 

Germany and finally to Tuktoyaktuk, NWT. She is not able to find nor contirm her M y  history, 

but she does present a khd of cartography of her identity. The leys she reviews in the images are 

M y  not geographical, but personal images fiom the film which are now reprised: men in Spur 
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piaying dominoes, a miniature golf course with a paper cathedra1 burning in Koin, irnages of eyes, 

roads, and watches. The child's voice repeats at the end of the film: "Wouldn't it be neat if you 

could find those lines in your ET' 

From this short description of the texture and substance of this f2m, several techniques are 

clear. Although sequentially arranged in the film, the proHeration of leys suggests a random 

selection. They must be imbued with sigrScance by the reader. There must be a special 

comection there for the onlooker, the one who is seekmg, just as there is a special comection for 

the douser, whose search for water is compared to the search for leys in the film. The stick starts 

viirating when water is known. The d o w r  must approach nom several Merent directions in 

order to validate the h d .  Similarly, identity is found in trachg the lines of significance in marking 

Wher Me. 

In the film, several leys are documented; the voice-over is polyphonie. Out of this density 

of references, however, Gruben succeeds in making a very personal film. The territory which she 

covers is perhaps best described by using Audre Lorde's terni: Me-writing as bio-mythography. 

Lorde uses this tetm to descn i  her own He-story in Zami: A New Spelling of My Name, her own 

poignant account of her We. There is both the assertion of particular speaking place, a security in 

an agency, accompanied with the continuing pomodern iack of belief in any master narrative. 

Bio-mythography has a significant space in postmodern d g ,  for it puts into practice so 

clearly the theorking of identity which obsesses postrnodemism. As considered by Lhda 

Hutcheon, postmodern autobiographicd writmg problematizes the 'hotion of the 'centered self" 

( m e  Politics ... 40). As Hutcheon is wont to do in her defkition of postmodemism, she 

emphasizes its compiicitous nature. But it is possible to see this kind of l i f e - d g  as other than 
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cornplicitous, for this @lies a collusion with the politics of a particular project. Rather there is a 

way of theorizing this work as the rewriting of identity in a fearfiilly piayful action There is 

certainly an aflxiety to this work. Yet there is also a piayfiilness in the questioning of nanative 

structures and integrity. 

"Truth-tehg," as exemplined by other filmic techniques, is always dubious in Ley Lines. 

Discursive authorities, when evoked, are equalized across the board. Scientifk kt, phüosophicai 

musings and iiterary references are counterpointed with shots fiom films such as The Incredible 

Shrinking Mun, and Giant starring James Dean. ln this way, scientific rationaüsm is balanced by 

popular movie iconography. AU are instnunental m the construction of Gruben's belief systems. 

As dense as the language of this film is (there are Long ditFcuit quotations which scroll across the 

screen; voice overs which barely give time for absorption), words ultimately fail. The etymology 

of "Gniben" is traced to German words: £inaily "g'übeln" is settled upon, meanhg "to brood." 

Like n e  Cenrral Character and Sifted Evidence, Ley Unes is relentlessly anti-narrative. 

The emphasis of the film is not on events that happen. Instead of action, the film is a process of 

unfolding, of teasing out meaning. And yet at the sarne the ,  Gruben plays with narrative desire. 

In some ways, the film is set up as a kind of detective nory. The f3.m follows Gniben to the North 

West Temtories, and waits expectantly for her to "discover" her roots, for her to find out who 

she is, but the key to the story, Eddie, is not where he should be. We Men to her phone caiis 

trying to track him down. We experience her thwarted attempts to find things out. We fhally only 

hear Eddie's intermediary: '8ddie told me to ask you what you want here." This pointed question 

momentariiy stops the p d  and questions Gruben's narrativizing. It forces Gruben herseifto 



finaiiy corne to the point of what her film is asking: Y'm just tryuig to h d  out what happened to 

In this sense, Gruben's search takes on a difEerent dimension. She is indeed looking to 

explain, as part of her search for identity, what happened to her M e r ,  a "golden boy" in his 

youth, who Ieft the church and evennially drank himselfto death. Gruben deçcr i s  this as a kind 

of a climax of the film itself: 

The climax of the thing is really the acknowledgement that it's my fâther that I've 
been lookmg for al1 this t h e .  That came very late. 

That's the thing 1 didn't understand that the film was about until I was weii 
into making it. That my Mer,  who had had a very promising youth, went off into 
WWII and came back, and was not able to realize what he had expected to have in 
his üfé. And I never understood--and stiu don't understand. ("An Independent 
Sho wcase" n. p.) 

If the film is about Gruben's search for her fàüed M e r  and a personal corning to tenns with who 

he was and how he interacted with his children, it can also be read as an exploration of alternative 

possibilities for the workings out of identity. In many ways, &ben is asserting the need to d o t  

specinc leys to one's We: complete bgmentation, or loss of d rnoorings, Ieads to nowhere but 

destruction and nihilism as it did in the case of her M e r .  Rejecting his fitndarnentalist beliefS and 

king forced to bomb Germany, his country of origin and yet aiways strange to him, propels her 

m e r ,  according to Gniben, into a spiral of self-abasement (In 'Xetter"). The instabiüty of her 

fâther resembles a crisis in paaiarchy, a Ioss of master narratives. Rather than re-inventing a 

simüar foundatioaal system for an essential sele Gmben cornes up with the idea of Ley Lhes, a 

metaphoncal interstitial spacing of identity, in which specific narrative cho ices of connecting Ieys 

through communities determines who she is. She descriis the film in simüar terms: 



It's a film about how we invent owselves as individuais based on myths fiom our 
cuitures and our M y  histories and how they are altered to suit our need for both 
uniqueness and belonging. (In Letter) 

Ultiniately Gruben's search through her past is ais0 a feminist search for a way of king in the 

postmodem world. When &ben is asked to consider the implication of the absent m e r  in her 

works, she acknowledges the sigoincance: 

It's interesting that you tie my absent M e r  to the missing protagonists in my 
other films--you're right of course but 1 guess 1 hadn't thought of it in that way. 
The guy in Low VisibiZity is a mystery in a similar way; so is the fàther in Deep 
Sleep. And the women characters in The Ceniru1 Character and Sifed Evidence as 
weii as Deep Sleep and Low Visibility are these kind of protean, unfked 
subjectivities that are dancing around these mysteries tcymg to solve t h  (In 
Le tter) 

The absence of the fàther and the reworking of identity go hand in hand. in this fiùn, Gruben 

herseif is "pro tean, udked;" she herself is a site of arnbiguity . 

Gruben's musings are particular and global at the sarne &ne: at one point, a computer 

search for a M y  tree cornes on screen: her name is typed in. In this scene there is a fàscinatmg 

overlaying of the particular individual and technology, as the individual is Wtually located among 

several discomes. The nImic screen becomes a computer screen. As the Old Texas Aunt leads us 

through the process of searchg on the data-base, the name Patricia Gruben appears in type. The 

search is entered. Data displaying a famüy tree results. This scene in some ways is emblematic of 

the nIm as a whole. For here the filmmaker traditionally erased and invisible, l i t e d y  becomes 

both the subject and the object of mqujr. The nedound subject-O bject rehtionship, however, 

does not involve mastery. There is no comumption. As has been illustrated, these searches are for 

severai possible answers, not necessarily one. There is a whole ditlerent method of înquiry which 

is operating here. As Lyotard says in The Postmodern Esplained, 



. . . objects have languages; to know objects you must be able to translate their 
languages. Intelligence is therefore immanent in things. In these circumstances of 
the imbrication of subject and object, how could the ideal of mastery pemst. It 
g r a d d y  falls out of use in the representations of science made by scientists 
themelves. Man is perhaps or@ a very sophisticsted node in the general 
interaction of emanations constituting the universe. (2 1) 

The film does not hurtIe towards conclusions, but relinquishes this impulse of mastery over its 

objects, and attempts to negotiate meaning making with its audience differently. 

Again, in the form of the film, there are contradictions which indicate this push-pull of 

assertion and relinquishrnent. &ben herself points out the deiiirate classicai structure of the 

film, with three very distinct sections, and a prologue and epilogue. Despite this rather rigid 

structure, however, there is a fiuidity and experimentation in the texture of the film itself. For 

example, images and metaphors which are evoked and the ways in which they are conveyed 

indicate a plurality of interpretations. S miilarly, meaning is no t goai-oriented. The Tukto yaktuk 

section is particularly evocative in this sense, perhaps because in this section, Gruben has corne to 

the last ley, and yet is conthually fiustrated in her attempts to fhd answers. Like the great 

expanse of snow and north where Gruben must wait, meaning is m e n t a r y  and oniy 

momentady coalesces. 

The North, in particular, gives Gniben an imaginative terrain to evoke and plunder. She 

charts an ice floe that moves irnperceptibly. Like tirne and rnemory, it is vimially impossible to teli 

that change is happening. Questions such as these recur: 'Wow do birds know how to take off 

without colliding with each other?" She asks a man, "when you are going somewhere on a skidoo 

across miles of white snow, how can you make sure you get back to where you started from?" 

The answer again suggests that the mooring of identity is relative: whenever he goes somewhere, 
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he makes sure to look back over his shouider. The ice presents other metaphors: you cannot get 

to the bottom of anythmg here because there is no bottom. It is undenvater, aimost depthless. 

Goals, answers must be given up. In one example, the canera starts on an expanse of white, pans 

to a ship with the name Ungaluk, and moves off to white again, and then, seemingly without 

interruption the same shot is shown again. Three tixnes, this sequence is shown. Although there 

are no overt connections made between images and metaphors like this and Gruben's search for 

identity, the similanties resonate. The leys are many and she leaves them for the audience to 

comect on their journey through the film. The boundaries of subject and object are confounded, 

mingled for an instant. 

As Gniben looks for the leys to mark her Uej she negotiates the space with the other, and 

perhaps tries to becorne more accustomed to a space which is not so clear in its distinctions of 

separation, or of difference. Resolution resides in spaces between, within and without, in a playfbi 

interaction between the consmictedness of laquage and lived social experience. In &g about 

his music, John Cage descnis the interplay of the sounds of the environment: 

There is no rest of Hie. Life is one. Without beginning, without middle, without 
ending. The concept: beginning rniddle and meanhg cornes fkom a sense of self 
which separates itself corn what it considers to be the rest of lüè. (In Schmitt 25) 

There is a simüar kind of philosophy at work here. The boundaries of sewother, of 

actor/character, of subject/object are blurred: a perennial transitional space is evoked. To an 

extent, the spectator or listener is propelled into a dEerent position as weU: a CO-creator, cc- 

conspirator in a conversation, and perhaps catching one's own Y" as well. In her conclusion to 

Xhinking Fragments, entitled, ' Wo Conclusions," Jane Flax returns to the conversational model: 



To pursue promising ways of understanding our experience is not necesMy to 
seek "truth" or power in an Enüghtenment sense. Rather it enta& a cornmitment to 
respoosibility and a hope that there are O thers "out there" with whom conversation 
is possible. It also entails and reflects a commitment to nonoarcissistic concepts of 
subjectivity, to assume that there are others out there existing independent of my 
htasies about them. (223) 

As Schmitt descnks in Actors and Onlookers, the kind of performance technique which 

characterizes postmodemism is one in which there is a dserent relationship between character 

and actor. She discusses Joseph Chaikin's conception of character (Schmitt 125). His comments 

consider the kind of character study that method acting usually engenders: 

As 6equently taught, characterization is an exploration of the limits of a person. 
The borders of the self, the outhe, the silhouette, tend to be the actor's study. . . . 
It sustains the stereotyping of people, the stereotyping of ourselves. (Chaikin 1 1, 
1 9) 

Schmitt elaborates on the signincance of a diierent approach to performance: 

Without the idea that the self has distinct boudaries, the study of character 
becomes a study of boundaries, of which the character's or actor's identity is a 
hction. It is not fixed. If a character does not constitute a discrete whole, no 
aspect of the person king portrayed can be seen as subordinated to another. 
Moreover, individual character can be seen as cenaal only if identity is understood 
as separate fkom both other people and the environment and fked over tirne. The 
idea of hterpenetration vitiates the central importance of character confiict in 
cirama, of the opposition of fixed forces in opposition (125) 

Gruben does not just trace one ley, but several. In so doing, she illustrates the multiple ways in 

which sense can be made. This search for sense is not only of what has happened to her ancestors, 

but what they were üke, what caused them to do the things they did. In the second section, for 

example, she dwells at length on Nazi Germany. One of the quotes which she presents on screen 

for consideration is fiom Mein KampJ and the role that the individuai should relinquish for the 



group. But Gruben shows how the individual and the group must remain in tandem. It is 

necessary to keep both in hand simultaneously: they are neither one, nor the other. 

These kinds of contradictions permeate the nIn Tukto yaktuk is the last stop for Gruben. 

Here she is w t  even sure ifshe has relatives. She makes comparisons with the other places she 

has visited. She says "i could feel my M y  ail amund me m Germany, but they were invisible." 

In a physical sense, the plurality of identities which has ken  evoked throughout the film is 

realized. in Tuktoyaktuk, out of a population of 956,213 by birth or maniage are named Gruben. 

Although Gruben traces the significance of John Gruben's lineage, she is never able to 

satisfacorily detennine her place in the ancestry, or the comUNty. She wonders ifhe is the 

misshg brother of her great grandMer, but she is never able to find out. She thought of 

Tuktoyaktuk as a doppelghger for Spur, Texas, where she was bom. But now Spur has nothmg: 

no one remembers her, or her M y .  Tukto yaktuk, by contrast, is a growing, boomhg town. 

Identity, for Paîricia Gruben, has becorne a matter of investigating and linking several possible 

aories and origins. As she says, T h e  Gruben M y  seerns elastic here." 

Where Sifted Evidence in its search for female divinifies is a materna1 search for origins, 

Ley Lines is a study of the loa Father. Gnrben dedicates the nIm to her dad, and the shot 

lingers on him, old, wasted by dcohol. It is not oniy literally her fàther in this sense, but the 

patriarchy which she sifts through, trying to figure out how to position herseif-& such a 

legacy. The answers and accomodations that she d e s  are not nostalgie, but neither are they 

vehement rejections. Rather what most characterizes her search for a new awareness of identity is 

a prescient awareness of an economy of difference. Gruben discovers hstead stories without ends, 

familes without origins; tmly the "infinite and the innnitesimal" do meet in a postmodem feminist 
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search. In Ley Lines, *ben cornes to something of a resolution of her question of identity by 

negotiating an almost perpetual existence in a transitionai space, because of the shüüng nature of 

the lep. Her relations with others and her fictionalking of her experience operate in a place of 

flux where play c m  produce possibilities for change. She takes a patriarchal culture, a paternal 

heritage, and creatively transfomis them, to "disnipt" the chai.. The subjectdobject relation is 

interdependent; each affects the other. 

Conclusion 

Gruben's films consistently question both the spectator's and the iïhmker's hvestment 

in narrative, in viewing, and in the imperialism of the subject. "Story" and "character" are 

ventureci, but they cohere only momentarily. The desire for closure is hstrated, the limits of the 

subject made clear, and the need to watch and to relate differently is asserted. A patriarchal 

discourse constnicts a humanist subject which is whole, but limted, particularly for women; an 

alternative discourse, articuiated marginally by the film, involves multiple truths and identities, 

workable only when a singular, finear story is relinquished. This particular treatment of narrative 

has k e n  referred to as  'hew narrative,'' both by Gruben herseIfand by other critics ("Desire in 

Ruins" 38). According to Gniben this is not well received. She cites Bruce Elder's critique of 

narrative, but points out how he collapses narrative forms. She çummarizes the arguments against 

new narrative succinctly: 

. . . the two arguments against new narrative: that it '%onspires", as ifrnounting a 
concerted attack on the avant-garde in order to undermine it nom withiq and that 
it compromises in a "sideways motion", as  ifthe deconstruction of narrative were 
merely a compromise on the part of former members of the avant-garde who 
secretly want to be Spielberg but know it im't cool. ('Desire in Ruins" 37) 



She associates a revolutionary potential with a "new narrative" and feels much of the fear cornes 

fiom its feminist use: 

1 think part of the threat of new narrative is that it is associated with ferninism, and 
it deploys feminist concerns into areas which have within Romanticisrn as weii as 
modernism and the avant-garde been roles for men-specificaily, opposition to 
bourgeois culture. C'Desire in Ru&" 39) 

And yet there are those who argue against 'hew narrative." They take issue with film as capable 

of representing, and argue that feminist film making is of necessity experimental: 

n i e  present impossibility for women to represent themselves properly, accurately, 
has led to an awareness no t only of the inadequacy of the aimç and intentions of 
dominant cinema but also of the impossibility of the main task: to represent. We 
wish to f 'bdy acknowledge this and to move on to a use of film that attempts GO 

mastery of meaning, assumes no ultimate knowledge of reality through fila 
(Cartwright and Fonoroff 137) 

But this kind of divestment of the real does not take into account the reception of fila Narrative 

desire can only be fnistrated by king engaged. Again the tension of mastery and non-mastery 

recurs. Gniben revisions narrative, tums it on itself. As she says, '? simpiy want to &d a place for 

narrative in its heterogeneity, its radical possibilities ("Desire in Ruins" 3 8). She d e s  a 

cornpelling argument for the usefuless of narrative engagement, using as an example a film class 

at Simon Fraser University. She descnis what happened when one production class was taught 

by a sessional who insisteci, unlike the regular staff, that the students articulate their ideas more 

completely : 

When I saw their finished work, my first thought was of ho w unusually po litically 
naive they seemed to be--blaming '%elevision" or "Amerika" in broad strokes for 
ail our ills. Gradually 1 realized that the ideas were no Werent fiom before, but by 
questionhg some of the obscurative imagery, our sessional had forced the 
students' han&. In our efforts to protect their "artistic intuition" the rest of us had 
aiiowed visual style and obliqueness to mask unexamined opinions and aesthetic 
choices. CPesire in Ruins" 36) 



In this way, with her adherence to narrative in most of her work, there is a postmodern 

'perversion" of traditional fom smiilar to tbat noted by Ric Knowles in the the work of 

play-ghts such as Judith Thornpson and Margaret Hollingsworth. Here there is a difEerent use 

of form and narrative, not a complete and utter rejection of it. This project also involves situaihg 

identity ditferently. Ekwhere, in a discussion of Low Visibility, Gniben d e m i s  her work on 

su bjec t ivity : 

The best we can hope for is a fkactured subjectivity ... and maybe, transcendence to 
another level of subjectivity. (In Bachman 2) 

identity, of a postmodem feminist co~guration. The effect is an unsettled identity and an 

unsettled viewing position. As in plays by Thompson and Hoüingsworth, in Gruben's films 

identity is experienced as an ongoing process, involhg both the engagement of subjectivity and 

its constant destabübion. 



CEFAPTERFIVE 

Conclusions for Possible Emergent Identities 

Using a strain of postrnodemist thought, idiected by feminism, 1 have shown how identity 

in these plays and nIms cm be considered a site of ambiguity. Identity is presented as a series of 

formations as subjects, roles which are temporarily engaged and then dismissed, according to 

shifting relations of power. These works illustrate the cycle which bioarist models of behaviour 

perpetuate. Identity is in a tension of mastery and non-mastery. This tension is demonstraîed 

through the seriakation of identity, through images of the body, and through destabilized and 

mtempted narrative. San* of self is threatened in the works of Thompson, Hollingsworth, and 

Gruben Identity is an uIlStabIe state of the Isninal: the about to be bom, the about to break fkee, 

the about to speak. Borders are consistently threatened: inside/outside m the instances of the 

abject in Judith Thompson; inner and outer voices in Margaret Hollingsworth; the publidprivate 

in Patncia Gruben. Oppositional realms, such as these, are intermingled so that identity must be 

thought of as conflictual, excessive, and in process. 

Identity as a site of ambiguity involves a reiinquishment of a subject/object relationship, of 

binanes such as rightlwrong and sewother. New possibiüties for identity are possible only when 

borders are îransgressed, and hierarchical models are broken d o m  The ramifications of such a 

consideration of identity are severai. What km& of possibilities for agency does this critique of 

mastery involve? What kind of spectator pleasure is aBorded in such an aesthetic? 

The Question of Agency 

Since the subjects are serialized and there is no depth or adherence to this position, agency 

must be revisioned in relational terms. In Moral Voices, Moral Selves, Susan Hekman discusses 
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Carol Gilligan's research on the morai reasoning of women and girls and in interpreting her work, 

argues that 'particular mord theories are inextricably linked to particular epistemologies" (30). 

Helanan interprets Giiligan's mode1 to be a replacement of the "disembodied knower with the 

relational self' (30). The result is that truth is necessarily plural: 

The knowledge constituted by this relational seifis comected, a product of 
discourses that constitute fomis of lifé; it is plurai rather than singular. Gilligan 
hem moral voices speakmg fiom the lives of connected, situateci selves, not the 
single truth of disembodied moral principles. She hears these voices because she 
defines moraiity and moral knowledge as plural and heterogeneous. (30) 

Plurality and heterogeneity in knowledge do not mean relativisa Rather agency cm be constmed 

as a senes of informed choices which result from a combination of discursive positions. Clearly 

one's moral choices corne Eorn the discourses in which one is irnbued. But it is the recognition of 

the severalness of these discursive formations which d o w s  for choices which are both situated 

and yet entertain difference. Agency is not precluded; rather, the question of an obsession with 

self must shift to a consideration of the implications for actions in communities. It is ody through 

risking ciifference that change can occur. This entails a relinquishing of mastery, but no t of choice. 

By asking questions dwerently, possible answers can be formulated. What is my 

investment in what represents me? How long will what represents me continue to represent me? 

What discursive took are available to act out ditrerently? M e r  the posmiodem theorizing and 

negotiating of boundaries, perhaps there must be a shift to a different kind of question, one which 

is not so obsessed with the self, but is rather focussed on achieving change. Wendy Brown 

suggests that feminists take up an actively political stance. The very fàct that there are no 

universal truths to rely on, to stand on, means that one must be active in the creation and 

discussion which produces trutbs. This is an active political engagement: 



Such judgements require leaming how to have public conversations with each 
other, arguing nom a vision about the conmon (%bat I want for us") rather than 
fiom identity (%ho 1 am"), and fiom explicitly postuiated norms and potential 
comon  values rather than fiom false essentiaüsm or unreconstructed private 
interest. (80) 

This s h i .  the focus fiom the individuai to the communityy while always maintaining a vision of 

and a tension between the two. This kind of interrogation involves constant checks and balances, 

a constant revision and discarding of no longer workable identities and communities. 

Identity within Community 

Identity within community is not another label for universaüty. Rather, identity within 

community is a concept which recognizes the discursive and social coflstructions of identity. It 

also atfords a sense of pluralism. We cm find such an articulation of identity within community, 

and the specinc temporary choices which are involved, in a play such as Lion in the S~eets.  

Iso bel, at the end of the play, acts '?norally" in her forgiveness of Ben, her murderer. She 

temporariiy takes up the discursive position which Catholicism af3iord.s; but her choice is not 

everyone's choice. It offers the possibility of tnumph for her, but it is clearly situated within a 

particular community. 

This pattern of interaction is found in the plays of Margaret Hohgsworth and the nIms of 

Patncia Gniben as weli. Esrne in Wur Bubies negotiates her identity within her play, and herseif 

withm her me, so that she is able to make peace with her children. The audience is pnvy to two 

representations of Esme, neither one being whole, each being representatiodly and contextually 

contingent. Nonetheless, she needs to take action and make some kind of resolution, even if it is 

suspect. In Szfted Evidence, the layered representation of the viewing apparatus and the main 



characters induce an identity vertigo, in which there is no endmg, no secure sense of identity to 

rely on. The individual k in the continual process of king re-hvented. This re-invention of 

identity within community is most apparent in Ley Lines when Gmben '%ds herself" in a very 

displaced way: the many Gmbens in Tuktoyaktuk provide one possible cornrnunity, her German 

hentage another, her famiy context another still. 

Cornmunity provides a legitbmte temporary groundmg for identiv; cornmimity is a better 

t em than "home" because it recognhzs the pl& and even the political engagement and 

s o l i d e  which acting as a subject +fies. It is in the negotiation of one's identity, then, withm 

discursive communities where positions of agency can be achieved. These plays and films send the 

interpretative game back to their discursive cornmunifies, teasing the audience's desire for 

recognition, sometimes satisfling, always irnplicating. Rather than gMng up on meaning because 

there is no singularity in a se& it is possible and reasonable to stiii look for and articulate sense, 

justice, moraLity, without king hegemonic : 

The search for intefigi'bility and meaning is not necessariiy the sarne as the 
imposition of reason. It need not enmesh us within the "metaphysics of presence." 
One can seek rneanings without assuming they are rational, context-fke, or fked 
'Yorever" or that rneanings can be attained only through or depend on the use of 
reason. Play, aesthetics, empathy with, or king used by other's feeling States are 
also sources of meaning and mtelligiibility. (Flax, l?hinking Fragments 223) 

It is in this ph@ interaction of fixedness and mo bility that a concept of identity can be found in 

the postmodem without loshg the agency of the fémini,ct. The self-consciously discursively 

constnicted and nÿmipulated subjects of these plays and nIms are counterpointed by an 

undermining of "roots." The kinds of agency which occur in these plays and films, as exemplified 

by the characters and offered to the spectator, are ephemed, k t i n g ,  and guardedly optimistic. 



To r e m  to a place of origin, of home, of psychic safety is not completely forecloseci. The 

suggestion, rather, is that these places need to be reconfigured without the imperialism tbat is 

irnplied in their creation. A place of home or of identity in solidari@ with others is still possible, 

but these works suggest that these places must be continually re-created. This is the terrain which 

is to be negotiated in the postmodern, where forays to the 4 6 c o ~ t i v e  outside" provide an 

ongoing negotiation with otherness so that the dynamic of mastery is also contindy reworked 

and destabilized. This inscniing of identity withm community is a story-telling of subjectivity and 

an engagement with narrative. This smiating can also explain the aesthetic which is employed by 

Thompson, Hohgsworth and Gruben. 

The Aesthetic: Destabilized Linear Narrative 

The aesthetic which kilitates such a simultaneous demoostration of subjects and their 

constellation in identity is a hybridized aesthetic, implicated in dinèrent relationships with reaüsa 

The debate in feminism between realisrn and mi-realism is ongoing. Reaüsrn is difficult to accept 

because it denies its own construction. Realism tends to support a singular and dominant vision of 

reality and a vision of identity which is unchanging.' Although anti-reaüsm cm be effective for the 

way it unsettles and problematizes such conceptions, it cm also run the risk of alienating viewers, 

of not k ing  understood. The plays and films, as 1 have discussed them, have been arranged on a 

continuum of deployment of the strategies of realism, fiom the most realist to the least, fiom the 

' In the introduction to M a h g  a Spectacle, Lynda Hart recounts the impetus that swings 
away k m  realism, fbr '% is the master's way of seeing" (4). In an ideatistic hini, ''reality is exposed 
as ülusionism and the woman pkyvnight can begin to be heard" (4). As Hart acknowledges, this 
theory is much indebted to fïim theory and Lam Mulvey's article on the d e  gaze in mainstream 
cinema (5). 
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least obviously feminist to the most. Thompson has a great aminement to specific places and 

specific patterns of speech in her plays which would hdicate an attempt to convey a particular 

illusionistic realism. Hollingsworth's plays Vary in their deployrnent of realist strategies; Mme are 

specifk about psychologically motivateci characteen; others are overtly a n t i - r d .  Gruben's 

works, as 1 have indicated, seldom present coherent protagonists or situations which erase the 

filmic rnediation. On the contrary, the filnmiaker's investment m illusionism is h y s  questioned. 

Although Thompson, Hohgsworth and Gniben employ varying stnitegies of reaüsm, they do 

coalesce in thei interrogation and destabktion of a linear narrative structure. In this section, 1 

wül suggest how this anti-realist strategy is connected to the depiction of identity in these plays 

and films. Destabilized and pfural narratives estabiish different "routes" for identity formation. 

Thompson's plays, with the exception of Lion in the Slreets, are the rnoa hear in 

structure. A story is told fiom beginning to end. Closure, ho wever, is seldom forthcoming. The 

endings of ail plays are left open to plural interpretations. Often the realm of the other-worldly or 

fàntasy provides a place for the entertainment of possible conclusions. In Lion in the Streets, for 

example, the ghost of Isobel appears, participates in the drama, and M y  creates ber own reality, 

in the final moments of the play when she ascends to heaven. SirniIar1y Pony in White Biting Dog 

cornes back nom the grave to speak to her ciad, the projectionist and to explain her own 

"squishing" of the old Pony. In I am Yours, the paintings of the foetus and the severai possible 

dream sequences suggest alternative visions of the world. In the stage version of Tornado, Viola's 

chest is soaked with milk; she is inexplicably able to breast feed. Two (or more) worlds exist 

simdtaneously; the dud possîbiiity then, of defeat and redemption for characters like Isobel or 

Pony or AmandaNiola must be entertained. The cross-fade at the end of I am Yours pairs 
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presence and absence; Dee hagines she sees her baby in a happy moment of fulfillment, while Toi 

holds the baby and asks " M d  to Pegs who is slumped in the chair, possibly dead (176). 

In addition to these ambiguous endings, throughout Thompson's piays, monologues 

punctuate the story-line, providhg an interruption of the flow of the action. Here characters 

reveal their insecurities about themselves in hauoting poetic images. These moments which resist 

containment in Thompson's work are never undermined or explained by awther, hierarchized 

narrative of "reality." Single narrative is k t u r e d  into many d e r  narratives, especidy in Lion 

in the Slreets. Although the story of Isobel structures the play, the relay form of the play itseif 

demonstrates the constructing power of story, and presents an open-ended alternative in which 

other ways of king are possible. Scenes proceed not by cause and effèct but through accidental 

comection of character. 

Margaret Hoilingsworth &es more overt connections between destabiiized hear 

narratives and destabilized, often hiratory, identities. She contrasts linear structures with circular 

spins. The controlled narrative structure of The House thal Jack Built dtimately confiaes Jenny, 

whereas the circular, fluid structure of It 's Only Hot for Two Months in Kapusking aliows for 

O ther representat ions of identiîy. In Confidence pairs two monologues which themselves are 

imempted and woven in a circular hhion. Connections between the women are found when 

boundaries of story are overcome. Other h e s ,  provoking images are used in Hoilingsworth's 

phys to imerrupt the narrative. These images persist as a memory and are not explahed by the 

fiction of the play. They speak on a different level. Prim's pouring of the coffee over her hand, as 

it bums, yet is fiozen in immobility, is a si@cant focus at the conclusion of Prim, Ducs Mama 

and Frank. Sometimes the interrogatory nature of these moments is made more explicit. In plays 
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such as Diving and Apple in the Eye, intenor "srneal" moments which individual characters 

undergo inipinge on the patriarchal worlds and disrupt the reading of a iinear narrative. 

Gruben's work is most radical in its interrogation of linear narrative structure and in its 

foregroundiig of f o n d  devices. In Sifted Evidence, for exarnple, diffierent actors take on the 

roles of the main subject, Maggie, thereby breakhg d o m  singulanty and unity in identity. Stones 

begin several times. Even Werent genres of story are evoked: travelogue, documenürry film, 

persod remuiiscence. One system of representation, however, is not hierarchized at the expense 

of auother. The m e  of Szjled Evidence competes with the intenor story of Sifted Evidence. In 

Low Visibility, words and images are fiactured to reveal a myriad of possibilities. Although 

glhpses into Mr. Bones' world are periodically offered, and the desire to understand the enigma 

of his story is aroused, no conclusion or satisfiiction is afforded. In the final sequence in which the 

psychic and the victim converse, &ben inquires into the limits of her own story-telling. As 

G n i ~ n  says, the film has to end here, "at the ümit of what ifs able to represent." (In "Law 

VisiMity" CFMDC Uifo sheet). In Ley Lines, Gruben takes this study even fùrther into the 

investigation of what constitutes her own identity. Here lines are blurred even more; the 

containment of the individual by simply one meam of narration or representation is impossible. 

Subjects are engaged dtematively and repetitively so that identity becornes an effèct of these 

positions, not as they are held together, but as they are hctured and discontinous. If identity is 

itselfa process of telling a story of one's We, then it follows that a destabhd, interrupted 

mative indicates also identity as a site of ambiguity. Identiv is in a constant interrogation of its 

O wn narration. 
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In these plays and films, however, narrative is never completely rejected. nie Central 

Character by Patricia Gruben is the most anti-narrative of all the te- considered, and yet even 

here Gruben playfulSr uses narrative techniques and story-telling devices. There is the overlay of a 

fhiry-tale escape into the woods and the adventure of the woman's Sght fkom the domestic realm 

of the kitchen into the wild woods. As Gruben herselfsays, she is looking for a place for narrative 

"in in raùical possibillties." YDesire in Ruins" 38). Thompson and Hollingsworth engage more 

M y  with narrative, and therefore, more coherent characters resutt. Perhaps tbis is an e W  of 

theatre itsell; as  it already foregrounds its own construction with the possibility for interruption 

and change aIready present in the audience's attendance and participation Every performance is 

different. These issues of destabilized identi~, and its reIationship to destabiked narrative bring 

the discussion to a consideration of the spectator's identification and pleanire in the play and film. 

A Dinerent Relationship for the Spectator 

The destabilized linear narrative involves a different identificatory process for the 

spectator and a Merent kind of spectator pleasure. Here some distinction between theatre and 

£ilm spectatorship is necessary. Theatre is not a finished product; its "look" cannot be contained in 

the same way as the look of the camera There are certain similarities between theatre and nIm, 

however, which Susan Bennett in Theatre Audiences discusses: 

Both are public, generaüy take place in a building specScaliy designed for tbat 
purpose, and invariably their audiences watch in a darkened auditorium. Both 
audiences generally react as a group (John Ellis's term is CO-voyeurs). (80) 



Bennett emphasizes here the voyeuristic impulse of both theatre and fih. This impulse is 

particularly evident when the role of narrative is considered. John Ellis descriks the position of 

the spectator in the narrative film in terms of separation and mastery: 

The film is offered to the spectator, but the spectator does not have mything to 
o&r to the film apart from the desire to see and hear. Hence the spectator's 
position is one of power, speci.fïcally the power to understand events rather than to 
change them. (8 1) 

The dynamic of mastery in viewing pleasure is linked also to the mastery which a single subject 

position and a single narrative miply. 

Using psychodytic theory, Laura Mulvey links visual pleasure to narrative and to a male 

spectator. JiU Dolan in The Feminist Spectator as Critic sees possible intersections for theatre 

The gaze in performance, although not as carefully controlied a s  in film, is also 
based in a narrative paradigm that presents gender and sexuality as a factor in the 
exchange of meanings between performers and spectators. (14) 

Referring to the dominant ülusionist nadition in theatre, Dolan suggests that the performance 

apparatus directs its address to constitute a particuiar subject position, intelligible to a particular 

spectator: 

Histoncally, in North American culture, this spectator has k e n  assumed to be 
white, middle-class, heterosexud, and male. That theatre creates an ideal spectator 
carved in the Iüceness of the doxninant culture whose ideology he represents is the 
motivating assumption behind the discourse of feminist performance criticism. (1) 

Where Mulvey suggests a counter-cinema (1 7), Dolan advocates '?extual and performance 

interventions that undermine the tyranny of male narratives of desue" ("In Defense of the 

Discourse" 10 1). Dolan forceMy suggests that postmodernism presents the best option for this 

kind of criticism: 



. . . a postmodernist p e r f o m c e  style that breaks with realist narrative strategies, 
heralds the death of unified characters, decenters the subject, and foregro unds 
conventions of perception is conducive to materiaüst feminist d y s e s  of 
representation. (60) 

These visions of spectatorship in both film and theatre advocate radical contestings of linear 

narrative structures and coherent character development, ünkmg mastery to a narrative structure 

and an illusionist tradition. 

Rather than proclaiming the "death of the subject," however, the works of Thompson, 

Hoilingsworth and Gniben proclaim provisional identities and provisional truths. Mastery is 

critiqued, but it is not completely rejected.W is a feminist project which is engaging in Elin 

Diarnond's proposai to rethink mimesis. In ''Mimesis, mesis,cry and the True-Real," Diamond 

proposes that a provisional engagement with a position to speak Eom is necessary: 

Feminists, in our difFerent constituencies, with our merent objects of analysis, 
seek to intervene in the symbolic systems--finguistic, theatrical, political, 
psycho 10 gical--and intervention requires assuming a subject position, ho wever 
provisionai, and making truth ciaims, however flexible, conceming one's own 
representation (3 65) 

This project c m  still be asserted by the kind of postmodern feminism that 1 am suggesting. Again, 

it is important to keep in mind the epistemic changes of postmodemism, which make such a vision 

of the world possible: 

. . . postmodemism can be characterized by the rejection of epistemic arrogance 
for an endorsement of epistemic humiky. Such humility entails a recognition that 
our ways of viewing the world are mediated by the contexts out of which we 
operate. This means not ody are our specific beliefk and emotions about the world 
a product of our historical circurnstances but so are the means by which we corne 
to those beliefk and emotions and by which we resolve conflict when dissent is 
present. This does not entaii the position that there are no solutions to epistemic 
dilemmas, merely that there are no final ones. (Nicholson, 'TeminiSm and the 
Poütics" 84-85) 



These plays and films provide, as Nicholson suggests, temporary solutions, fiom a place of 

"epistemic humility," and offer temporary ways of engaging with identity. The relationship 

between narrative and identity is questioned, and yet it is not completely disavowed. What is 

achieved in these piays and films, to varying degrees, is a foregromding of the connection 

between the two. Again, to replace mastery with non-mastery would reinstate the terms of an 

either/or scenario. The postmodern feminist saain which 1 am suggesting questions this very 

distinction and always operates on the border. 

Spectator Pleasure 

With the destabilized, but not disavowed, narrative and identifkatory processes, these 

plays and films engender unsettling responses, and necessitate different reading strategies. This 

can be seen in several cntical observations. George Toles, for example, has this to say about the 

ways that Judith Thompson's plays work on the spectator: 

Thompson aiways aims her plays at the faut iines in our intemal defence system, 
the places where the self has no 'prepared responses." (1 30) 

The kaleidoscopic ettéct of some of these plays and films with their disregard for continuity can 

have a dizymg effect on the audience, as identification is both engaged and thwarted. One of the 

ways in which this is achieved is in the mi>ring of genres: 

Thompson repeatedly dislocates the audience, a s  she propels the spectator, with no 
transitional scenes and few abatements of intensity, fiom troubling comedy, to 
nightmare panic, to breakdown, and back again Every thought or impulse that 
arises in a scene immediately splits into its opposite, Pirandello-khion, so that 
emotion and comedy both end up having the same source and the same value. 
(Toles 130) 



Discursively constructeci subject positions CO llide; in e ffect, new discursive formations are 

produced in which a singular response is unlikely. This is found in the dissonant moments of 

audience and critical response. The disruptive and scattered responses that these plays and films 

produce can be a t t r i e d  to the very variety of subject positions offered in the collision of 

discourses within the works. The spectator is forced to respond severally and dinerently. Teresa 

de Lauretis discusses a simiIar sentiment in viewer and reviewer reaction in her consideration of 

Born in Flames, a film by Lizzie Borden: 

The "discornfort" of Borden's reviewers might be located exactly in this 
disappointment of spectator and text: the disappointment of not finding oneself, 
not finding oneself'5nterpeMed" or soiicited by the fiùn, whose images and 
discourses project back to the viewer a space of heterogeneh diaerences and 
fragmented coherences that just do not add up to one individual viewer or one 
spectator-subject, bourgeois or otherwise. There is no one-to-one match between 
the film's discursive heterogeneity and the discursive boundaries of any one 
spectator. ('Rethuiking Women's Cinema" 142-43) 

This type of response is ünked to the kind of aesthetic which these plays and nIms employ. In her 

discussion of Thompson's plays, Julie Adam suggests a s i m k  scenario, in which borders are 

crossed and different spectatorial positions engaged: "Naturaüstic illusionkm is precluded but 

scenes of communion between characters and audience rely on ano ther form of illusion, that of art 

and life inhabitkg the same realm" (27). Here Adam indicates the paradoxical process which this 

viewing process en&: a new kind of illusionism in which art and We are not thought of in 

complete separation This is to reconceive modes of interaction and viewing pleasure. 

Susan Hekman in Gender and Knowledge suggests that knowledge is not to be gained 

through abstraction, but through contingency (1 2). This same kind of phüosophy is at work in the 

spectatorial positions which are encouraged by plays by Thornpson and Hollingsworth and films 



by Gruben. Ric Knowles, in his discussion of W m  Babies by Hollingsworth, indicates how 

mastery is replaced by contingency: 

In Wm Babies it is the element of "liaison" rather than contlct, of puil rather tban 
push, and of 'kwhere she perceives herseif to be" rather than "where she is" (thai is, 
where others perceive her to be) that takes over the action and informs the 
ostensibly conventionai reconciliation at the end of the play. There is no reversal of 
(external) action, but rather a shift in the subject position of the assunaed spectator: 
the perceived has become the perceiver, and the audience sees fiom the point of 
view of the woman who is "normally" the object of its perception. ('mie 
Dramatut.gy" 234) 

The juggl.ing of subject positions which is implied here has a political efficacy. The destabilization 

of identity is achieved in the ways in which the audience rmst make sense of these contradictions 

and uncertainties. It is unsettling to watch these displays and to have to make choices about 

narrative or visual hterpretation. in their attempts to create identity diftérently, these works set 

mto motion a complex reaction in the spectator, perhaps ody the begmning of which is to disturb. 

Knowles argues for the L'perversion" of traditional dramatic devices and structures such as plot 

and character and catharsis by dramatiss such as Hohgsworth and Thompson, and, 1 would ad4 

f ihmkers such as Gruben: 

The revisionhg of those [Aristotelian and mode&] structures k t u r e s  
traditional concepts of focus, unity and action, and perversely twists them out of 
shape in order to divide and multiply the prisns through which we see, and to 
extend the subject positions available to Canadian theatre audiences. (234) 

The implication for the spectator is a disnrption of "the cornplacent and voyeuristic satisfàctions 

and containments provided by dramatic catharsis'' (226). The sixnuitaneous investment in several 

realites and the dislocating effect of dBerent scenes and devices which fiagrnent identity result in 

many perspectives, many avenues of access to the play or film. 
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The most signincant 'perversion" of rnodernist and Aristotelian dramatic techniques for 

this project is the reformulation of anagnorisis. The recognition of one's true nature or pfight is no 

longer possible. The spectator does not attend the presentation of a self who recognizes M e r  

own true nature, and is thereby satisfied or chastised. What is -lied in the sh&g of identities 

is the recognition of several different subjects, several different possible auths. Where tragedy in 

ancient Greece formulated a sense of an ideal self on stage, and preserved and inaugurated a 

part ich conception of the hero, here notions of identification with a hero or an ideal self are 

constantiy undermined. If aoagnorisis happens, tt happens several thes. This serialization 

undermines a coherent identity and a d e d  response. 

This is not to suggest that these works offer rampant relativism, or that the pluraw of 

subject positions offered open the doors to a colonising, appropriating experience of the other. 

Rather, the spectator is offered the "as-if" engagement of subjectivity at the same time that 

mastery of this position is undermined. By foregromding the reiteration that constitutes 

subjectivity and by suggesting forays into the "constitutive outside," the dynamic by which 

identity is achieved can gradually be reworked. A dflerent Mewing pleanire dynamic is irnplied: 

one which is not co~l~umptive. Therefore the audience/performance dynamic mirrors a Werent 

subjedobject dyoamic; mastery is relinquished. Rather what is achieved is the possibiüty of an 

interactive, communicative process for identky formation. 

These plays and films are in some way, then, left unexplainable. There is often a precarious 

border between ernpathy and revulsion, between coldness and cntical engagement, between in 

depth examination and studied self-absorption. The question remains, how do we give up mastery 

and at the same time retain understanding? This can be, therefore, dificuIt, dangerous terrain; 
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however, it is also exciting and provocative, and can expose audience rnembers to a potentially 

transformative experience. Again, we must r e m  to the distilled moment, the individual 

discursive situation, which is one of the r e c d g  characteristics of these works: the series of roles 

as subjects which are performed and then discarded. As readers and viewers of texts we are 

encouraged to take up similar temporary spaces of viewing pleasure, compromised, c o q  kit,  

uncomfiortable as they are. As de Lauretis says, %e are both invited in and held at a distance" 

(143). And yet, we watch, as we constmct stories in an "as-if' m e  of mhd (McHale 32). By 

emertaining possible Stones, possible subjects, we can corne to difEerent possible combinations in 

the narratives we create out of these positions. The ultimate project must be the continual change 

in dynamic of discursive situations in order to effect a substantial change in the dynamic of 

identity . 

Dif5erence Dinerentiy 

AIthough this guardedly utopic positionhg of identity as plural may seem paralytic to 

some, it is always important to return to the question of difference. Diftèrence can only be 

sustained ifthe temporary and con£lictual nature of one's discursive position is acknowledged. 

The subjecthdentity dilemma is a concem now more tban ever with the bumbardment of 

discourses in society. The individ~d, of necessity, plays several different identities. It is only in a 

relinquishment of mastery that the several possibiüties of other identities not the same as our own 

c m  exist. What postmodernism seeks is a radical disruption of the sewother dichotomy. Making a 

difference does not necessitate repudiation of the other. For Merence to be heard, it needs the 

support of a community. For a ianguage to be spoken, it must be understood. In this sense, there 



needs to be an accumulation of a project, a rallying of support, f h m  others who have felt the 

same, for a différence to be made. This involves a consolidation of specifk identities as 'toutes" 

through communities, not "roots" within a seK 

The very suggestion that change is possible implies that another world is already 

envisioned, tbat a particular go& or direction for the "route" is in sight. To negotiate towards this 

goal without imposing prescriptions and agendas, and excluding others, is difncuft. Jane FIax, in 

Thinking Fragments, discusses the problems of situating herself within her work and attempts to 

corne to ternis with her location and implication. M e r  citing her biases, she concludes 

inconclusively : 

There may be no way out of these dilemmas. Yet there may be at least better or 
worse ways of living with them. The better ways wouid seem to include a 
continuous stmggle to be conscious of how philosophies and persons respond to 
clifferences and ambiguities: our fear of erasing them, our desire to do so. (43) 

It is the question of our desire to erase ciifference which is the movement of this thesis. This is 

also implied in Stuart Hall's discussion of identity: 

Identities are, as t were, the positions which the subject is obliged to take up while 
always "knowing" (the language of consciousnessness betrays us) that they are 
representations, that representation is always constnicted across a "lack" across a 
division, fkom the place of the Other, and thus can never be adequate--identical--to 
the subject processes which are invested in them. The notion that an effective 
suhuing of the subject to a subject-position requires, not only that the subject is 
"hailed," but that the subject invests in the position, means that suturing has to be 
thought of as an articulation, rather than a one-sided process, and that in tum 
places ideniifcation, if not identities, f'innly on the theoretical agenda. (Questions 
6) 

As the quote fiom Hall hdicates, this process of identity formation is inherently unstable and 

predicated on absence. Instability recurs in these works, especially in a fbstrated search for 

origin, where the absent mother, fiither, or other is not to be found, much less colonized. Rather 



this search cornes to sigr@ the ongoing negotiation of a formation of identity which is a 

'boveable feast" (Ha& T h e  Question" 598), where there is an oogomg engagement with an "as- 

if" n;Me of mind. Barbara Freedman suggests that theatre provides a mode1 for postmodernism, 

'%s it k always sening into play the subversion of its bights (3 9 1):" 

A refusal of the observer's stable position, a k inat ion with re-presenting 
presence, an abiüty to stage its own staging, to rethhk, to rehme, switch 
identXcations, undo m e s ,  see fieshly, and yet a -  the same time see how one's 
look is always already purlomed--these are the bene* of theatre for theory. (391) 

The '<purloined look" is also a useful way to consider the impure, reiterative nature of identity 

formation. This process is mherently unstable; the combination of postmodernism with femniism 

rnakes it even more so. Situating identity temporarily, monitoring dealings with dierence and 

attempting to curb, perhaps, the desire to consolidate permanently, may be the best ways to let 

dserences exist, to negotiate, without conquering or appropriating. 
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